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§ 1415.11 Restoration agreements. 
(a) Restoration agreements are only 

authorized to be used in conjunction 
with easements and rental contracts. 
NRCS, in consultation with the pro-
gram participant, determines if the 
grassland resources are adequate to 
meet the participant’s objectives and 
the purposes of the program, or if a res-
toration agreement is needed. Such a 
determination is also subject to the 
availability of funding. USDA may con-
dition participation in the program 
upon the execution of a restoration 
agreement depending on the condition 
of the grassland resources. When the 
functions and values of the grassland 
are determined adequate by NRCS, a 
restoration agreement is not required. 
However, if a restoration agreement is 
required, NRCS will set the terms of 
the restoration agreement. The res-
toration plan component of the res-
toration agreement identifies con-
servation practices and activities nec-
essary to restore or improve the func-
tions and values of the grassland to 
meet both USDA and the participant’s 
objectives and purposes of the program. 
If the functions and values of the grass-
land decline while the land is subject 
to a GRP easement or rental contract 
through no fault of the participant, the 
participant may enter into a restora-
tion agreement at that time to im-
prove the functions and values with 
USDA approval and when funds are 
available. 

(b) The NRCS State Conservationist, 
with advice from the State Technical 
Committee and in consultation with 
FSA, determines the conservation 
practices and activities and the cost- 
share percentages, not to exceed statu-
tory limits available under GRP. A list 
of conservation practices and activities 
approved for cost-share assistance 
under GRP restoration plans is avail-
able to the public through the local 
USDA Service Center. NRCS may work 
through the local conservation district 
with the program participant to deter-
mine the terms of the restoration plan. 
The conservation district may assist 
NRCS with determining eligible con-
servation practices and activities and 
approving restoration agreements. 

(c) Only approved conservation prac-
tices and activities are eligible for 

cost-sharing. Payments under the GRP 
restoration agreements may be made 
to the participant of not more than 50 
percent for the cost of carrying out the 
conservation practices or activities. As 
provided by the regulations at part 1400 
of this chapter, payments made under 
one or more restoration agreements to 
a person or legal entity, directly or in-
directly, may not exceed, in the aggre-
gate, $50,000 per year. 

(d) The participant is responsible for 
the operation and maintenance of con-
servation practices in accordance with 
the restoration agreement. 

(e) All conservation practices must 
be implemented in accordance with the 
FOTG. 

(f) Technical assistance is provided 
by NRCS, or an NRCS approved third 
party. 

(g) If the participant is receiving 
cost-share for the same conservation 
practice or activity from another con-
servation program, USDA will adjust 
the GRP cost-share rate proportion-
ately so that the amount received by 
the participant does not exceed 100 per-
cent of the costs of restoration. 

(h) The participant cannot receive 
cost-share from more than one USDA 
cost-share program for the same con-
servation practice or activity on the 
same land. 

(i) Cost-share payments may be made 
only upon a determination by a quali-
fied individual approved by the NRCS 
State Conservationist that an eligible 
restoration practice has been estab-
lished in compliance with appropriate 
standards and specifications. 

(j) Conservation practices and activi-
ties identified in the restoration plan 
may be implemented by the partici-
pant or other designee. 

(k) Cost-share payments will not be 
made for conservation practices or ac-
tivities implemented or initiated prior 
to the approval of a rental contract or 
easement acquisition unless a written 
waiver is granted by the NRCS State 
Conservationist or FSA State Execu-
tive Director, as appropriate, prior to 
installation of the practice. 

(l) Upon transfer of an easement with 
a restoration agreement to an eligible 
entity as described in § 1415.18, the enti-
ty will be responsible for administra-
tion of the agreement and providing 
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funds for payment of any costs associ-
ated with the completion of the res-
toration agreement. The eligible entity 
may, with participant consent, revise 
an existing restoration agreement or 
develop a new restoration agreement. 
Restoration plans must be consistent 
with the GRP management plan or any 
associated conservation plan as de-
scribed in § 1415.4. 

(m) Cooperating entities under 
§ 1415.17 will be responsible for develop-
ment, administration, and implemen-
tation costs of restoration plans. 

§ 1415.12 Modifications to easements 
and rental contracts. 

(a) After an easement has been re-
corded, no substantive modification 
will be made to the easement. Modi-
fications that would not result in ac-
quisition or divestiture of additional 
property rights may be made. 

(b) State Conservationists may ap-
prove modifications for restoration 
agreements and GRP management 
plans or conservation plans where ap-
plicable, as long as the modifications 
do not affect the provisions of the ease-
ment and meet program objectives. 

(c) USDA may approve modifications 
to rental contracts, including cor-
responding changes to conservation 
plans, GRP management plans, and 
restoration plans to facilitate the prac-
tical administration and management 
of the enrolled area so long as the 
modification will not adversely affect 
the grassland functions and values for 
which the land was enrolled. 

§ 1415.13 Transfer of land. 

(a) Any transfer of the property prior 
to an applicant’s acceptance into the 
program will void the offer of enroll-
ment, unless at the option of the State 
Conservationist or State Executive Di-
rector, as appropriate, an offer is ex-
tended to the new landowner and the 
new landowner agrees to the same 
easement or rental contract terms and 
conditions. 

(b) After acreage is accepted in the 
program, for easements with multiple 
payments, any remaining easement 
payments will be made to the original 
participant unless NRCS receives an 
assignment of proceeds. 

(c) Future annual rental payments 
will be made to the successor partici-
pant. 

(d) The new landowner is responsible 
for complying with the terms of the re-
corded easement, and the contract suc-
cessor is responsible for complying 
with the terms of the rental contract 
and for assuring completion of all ac-
tivities and practices required by any 
associated restoration agreement. Eli-
gible cost-share payments will be made 
to the new participant upon presen-
tation that the successor assumed the 
costs of establishing the practices. 

(e) With respect to any and all pay-
ments owed to participants, the United 
States bears no responsibility for any 
full payments or partial distributions 
of funds between the original partici-
pant and the participant’s successor. In 
the event of a dispute or claim on the 
distribution of cost-share payments, 
USDA may withhold payments, with-
out the accrual of interest, pending an 
agreement or adjudication on the 
rights to the funds. 

(f) The rights granted to the United 
States in an easement will apply to 
any of its agents or assigns. All obliga-
tions of the participant under the GRP 
conservation easement deed also bind 
the participant’s heirs, successors, 
agents, assigns, lessees, and any other 
person claiming under them. 

(g) Rental contracts may be trans-
ferred to another landowner, operator, 
or tenant that acquires an interest in 
the land enrolled in GRP. The suc-
cessor must be determined by FSA to 
be eligible to participate in GRP and 
must assume full responsibility under 
the contract. FSA may require a par-
ticipant to refund all or a portion of 
any financial assistance awarded under 
GRP, plus interest, if the participant 
sells or loses control of the land under 
a GRP rental contract, and the new 
landowner, operator, or tenant is not 
eligible to participate in the program 
or declines to assume responsibility 
under the contract. 

§ 1415.14 Misrepresentation and viola-
tions. 

(a) The following provisions apply to 
violations of rental contracts: 

(1) Rental contract violations, deter-
minations, and appeals are handled in 
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