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heard for the sole purpose of deter-
mining whether the recipient know-
ingly or through gross negligence al-
lowed the employee or board member 
to engage in the activities leading to 
the conviction or judgment. While an 
appeal of a conviction or judgment or a 
hearing is pending, the Corporation 
may take any necessary steps to safe-
guard its funds. 

PART 1641—DEBARMENT, SUSPEN-
SION AND REMOVAL OF RECIPI-
ENT AUDITORS 

Subpart A—General 

Sec. 
1641.1 Purpose/Applicability. 
1641.2 Definitions. 
1641.3 Scope of debarment, suspension and 

removal. 
1641.4 Duration of debarment, suspension 

and removal. 

Subpart B—Debarment 

1641.5 Debarment. 
1641.6 Procedures for debarment. 
1641.7 Causes for debarment. 
1641.8 Notice of proposed debarment. 
1641.9 Response to notice of proposed debar-

ment. 
1641.10 Additional proceedings as to dis-

puted material facts. 

Subpart C—Suspension 

1641.11 Suspension. 
1641.12 Procedures for suspension. 
1641.13 Causes for suspension. 
1641.14 Notice of proposed suspension. 
1641.15 Response to notice of proposed sus-

pension. 

Subpart D—Removal 

1641.16 Removal. 
1641.17 Procedures for removal. 
1641.18 Causes for removal. 
1641.19 Notice of proposed removal. 
1641.20 Response to notice of proposed re-

moval. 
1641.21 Additional proceedings as to dis-

puted material facts. 

Subpart E—Decisions 

1641.22 Decisions of debarring official. 
1641.23 Exceptions to debarment, suspension 

and removal. 
1641.24 Appeal and reconsideration of debar-

ring official decisions. 

AUTHORITY: 42 U.S.C. 2996e(g); Pub. L. 105– 
277. 

SOURCE: 64 FR 67507, Dec. 2, 1999, unless 
otherwise noted. 

Subpart A—General 
§ 1641.1 Purpose/Applicability. 

In order to assist in ensuring that re-
cipients receive acceptable audits, this 
part sets out the authority of the Legal 
Services Corporation (‘‘LSC’’) Office of 
Inspector General (‘‘OIG’’) to debar, 
suspend or remove independent public 
accountants (‘‘IPAs’’) from performing 
audit services for recipients. This rule 
informs IPAs of their rights to notice 
and an opportunity to be heard on ac-
tions involving debarment, suspension 
or removal, and the standards upon 
which such actions will be taken. This 
part applies to IPAs performing audit 
services for recipients, subrecipients or 
other entities which receive LSC funds 
and are required to have an audit per-
formed in accordance with guidance 
promulgated by the OIG. 

§ 1641.2 Definitions. 
Adequate evidence means information 

sufficient to support the reasonable be-
lief that a particular act or omission 
has occurred. 

Audit services means the annual fi-
nancial statement audit of a recipient, 
including an audit of the recipient’s fi-
nancial statements, systems of inter-
nal control, and compliance with laws 
and regulations. 

Contract means an agreement be-
tween a recipient and an IPA for an 
IPA to provide audit services to the re-
cipient. 

Conviction means a judgment or con-
viction of a criminal offense by any 
court, whether entered upon a verdict 
or plea, including but not limited to, 
pleas of nolo contendere. 

Debarment means a decision by the 
debarring official to prohibit an IPA 
from soliciting or entering into new 
contracts to perform audit services for 
recipient(s) based upon a finding by a 
preponderance of the evidence that any 
of the causes for debarment set out in 
§ 1641.7 exist. Debarment may cover an 
IPA’s contracts with all recipients or 
with one or more specific recipients. 

Debarring official is the official re-
sponsible for debarment, suspension or 
removal actions under this part. The 
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OIG legal counsel is the debarring offi-
cial. In the absence of an OIG legal 
counsel or in the discretion of the In-
spector General, the debarring official 
shall be the OIG staff person or other 
individual designated by the Inspector 
General. 

Indictment means a charge by a grand 
jury that the person named therein has 
committed a criminal offense. An in-
formation, presentment, or other filing 
by competent authority charging a 
criminal offense shall be given the 
same effect as an indictment. 

IPA means an independent public ac-
countant or firm of accountants. 

Knowingly means that an act was 
done voluntarily and intentionally and 
not because of mistake or accident. 

Material fact means one which is nec-
essary to determine the outcome of an 
issue or case and without which the 
case could not be supported. 

Person means an individual or a firm, 
partnership, corporation, association, 
or other legal entity. 

Preponderance of the evidence means 
proof by information that, compared 
with that opposing it, leads to the con-
clusion that the fact at issue is more 
probably true than not. 

Removal means a decision by the de-
barring official to prohibit an IPA from 
performing audit services in subse-
quent years of an existing contract 
with one or more specific recipients 
based upon a finding by a preponder-
ance of the evidence that any of the 
causes set out in § 1641.18 exist. 

Suspension means a decision by the 
debarring official, in anticipation of a 
debarment, to prohibit an IPA from so-
liciting or entering into new contracts 
to perform audit services for recipi-
ent(s) based upon a finding of adequate 
evidence that any of the causes re-
ferred to in § 1641.13 exist. Suspension 
may preclude an IPA from soliciting or 
entering into new contracts with all re-
cipients or with one or more specific 
recipients. 

§ 1641.3 Scope of debarment, suspen-
sion and removal. 

An IPA may be debarred, suspended 
or removed under this part only if the 
IPA is specifically named and given no-
tice of the proposed action and an op-

portunity to respond in accordance 
with this part. 

(a) Actions against individual IPAs. De-
barment, suspension or removal of an 
individual IPA, debars, suspends or re-
moves that individual from performing 
audit services as an individual or as an 
employee, independent contractor, 
agent or other representative of an IPA 
firm. 

(b) Actions against IPA firms. (1) De-
barment, suspension or removal shall 
affect only those divisions or other or-
ganizational elements materially in-
volved in the relevant engagement and 
as to which there is cause to debar, 
suspend or remove. 

(2) The debarment, suspension or re-
moval action contemplated in para-
graph (b)(1) of this section may include 
any firm that is an affiliate, subcon-
tractor, joint venturer, agent or rep-
resentative of the IPA firm only if such 
firm was materially involved in the 
relevant engagement and is specifically 
named and given notice of the proposed 
action and an opportunity to respond 
in accordance with this part. 

(3) The debarment, suspension or re-
moval action contemplated in para-
graph (b)(1) of this section may include 
an individual officer, director, or part-
ner responsible for the engagement, or 
an individual employee, independent 
contractor, agent, representative or 
other individual associated with an 
IPA firm only if such individual is spe-
cifically named and given notice of the 
proposed action and an opportunity to 
respond in accordance with this part. 

§ 1641.4 Duration of debarment, sus-
pension and removal. 

A debarment, suspension or removal 
is effective as set out in the debarring 
official’s decision to debar, suspend or 
remove, issued pursuant to § 1641.22. 

(a) Debarment. (1) Debarment gen-
erally should not exceed three years, 
but may be for a shorter period based 
on a consideration of the evidence pre-
sented by the IPA. Debarment may ex-
ceed three years in extraordinary cir-
cumstances. 

(2) If a suspension precedes a debar-
ment, the suspension period shall be 
considered in determining the debar-
ment period. 
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(3) The debarring official may extend 
an existing debarment for an addi-
tional period if the debarring official 
determines, based on additional facts 
not previously in the record, that an 
extension is necessary to protect LSC 
funds. The standards and procedures in 
this part shall be applied in any pro-
ceeding to extend a debarment. 

(b) Suspension. (1) The debarring offi-
cial may determine that a cause for 
suspension exists, but that an inves-
tigation or other legal or debarment 
proceeding should be completed before 
proceeding to a debarment. Suspension 
shall be for a temporary period pending 
the completion of an investigation or 
other legal or debarment proceedings, 
including a proceeding conducted by 
the OIG, a law enforcement or other 
government agency, an investigative or 
audit official from another OIG, a 
court, or a state licensing body or 
other organization with authority over 
IPAs. 

(2) If debarment proceedings are not 
initiated within 12 months after the 
date of the suspension notice, the sus-
pension shall be terminated unless an 
official or organization conducting a 
proceeding referred to in paragraph 
(b)(1) of this section requests its exten-
sion in writing. In such cases, the sus-
pension may be extended up to an addi-
tional six months. In no event may a 
suspension be imposed for more than 18 
months, unless debarment proceedings 
have been initiated within that period. 

(3) The OIG shall notify the appro-
priate official or organization con-
ducting a proceeding referred to in 
paragraph (b)(1) of this section, if any, 
of the suspension within 10 days of its 
implementation, and shall notify such 
official or organization of an impend-
ing termination of a suspension at 
least 30 days before the 12-month pe-
riod expires to allow an opportunity to 
request an extension. 

(4) The limit on the duration of a sus-
pension in paragraph (b)(2) of this sec-
tion may be waived by the affected 
IPA. 

(c) Removal. Removal shall be effec-
tive for the years remaining on the ex-
isting contract(s) between the IPA and 
the recipient(s). 

Subpart B—Debarment 
§ 1641.5 Debarment. 

(a) IPAs debarred from providing 
audit services for all recipients are pro-
hibited from soliciting or entering into 
any new contracts for audit services 
with recipients for the duration of the 
specified period of debarment. Recipi-
ents shall not knowingly award con-
tracts to, extend or modify existing 
contracts with, or solicit proposals 
from, such IPAs. Debarred IPAs also 
are prohibited from providing audit 
services to recipients as agents or rep-
resentatives of other IPAs. 

(b) IPAs debarred from providing 
audit services for one or more specific 
recipient(s) are prohibited from solic-
iting or entering into any new con-
tracts for audit services with such re-
cipient(s) for the duration of the period 
of debarment as determined pursuant 
to this part. The affected recipient(s) 
shall not knowingly award contracts 
to, extend or modify existing contracts 
with, or solicit proposals from, such 
IPAs. Debarred IPAs also are prohib-
ited from providing audit services to 
the affected recipient(s) as agents or 
representatives of other IPAs, and are 
required to provide prior written notice 
to the debarring official before pro-
viding such services to other recipi-
ents. Debarred IPAs also must provide 
prior written notice of the debarment 
to any recipient for which the IPA pro-
vides audit services. 

§ 1641.6 Procedures for debarment. 
Before debarring an IPA, the OIG 

shall provide the IPA with a hearing in 
accordance with the procedures set out 
in §§ 1641.7 through 1641.9. Such hearing 
shall be held entirely by written sub-
missions, except: 

(a) Additional proceedings shall be 
held under § 1641.10 if the debarring offi-
cial finds there is a genuine dispute of 
material fact; and/or 

(b) A meeting may be held under 
§ 1641.9(c). 

§ 1641.7 Causes for debarment. 
The debarring official may debar an 

IPA from performing audit services in 
accordance with the procedures set 
forth in this part upon a finding by a 
preponderance of the evidence that: 
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(a) The IPA has failed significantly 
to comply with government auditing 
standards established by the Comp-
troller General of the United States, 
generally accepted auditing standards 
and/or OIG audit guidance as stated in 
the OIG Audit Guide for Recipients and 
Auditors, including the Compliance 
Supplement for Audits of LSC Recipi-
ents, and in OIG Audit Bulletins; 

(b) The IPA is currently debarred 
from contracting with any Federal 
agency or entity receiving Federal 
funds, including when the IPA has stip-
ulated to such debarment; 

(c) The IPA’s license to practice ac-
counting has been revoked, terminated 
or suspended by a state licensing body 
or other organization with authority 
over IPAs; 

(d) The IPA has been convicted of 
any offense indicating a breach of 
trust, dishonesty or lack of integrity, 
or conspiracy to commit such an of-
fense, and the conviction is final; or 

(e) The IPA has been found subject to 
a civil judgment for any action indi-
cating a breach of trust, dishonesty or 
lack of integrity, or conspiracy to take 
such action, and the judgment is final. 

§ 1641.8 Notice of proposed debarment. 
(a) Before debarring an IPA, the OIG 

shall send the IPA written notice of 
the proposed debarment. The notice 
shall be sent in a manner that provides 
evidence of its receipt and shall: 

(1) State that debarment is being 
considered; 

(2) Identify the reasons for the pro-
posed debarment sufficient to put the 
IPA on notice of the conduct or trans-
action(s) upon which a debarment pro-
ceeding is based; 

(3) Identify the regulatory provisions 
governing the debarment proceeding; 
and 

(4) State that debarment may be for 
a period of up to three years or longer 
under extraordinary circumstances. If 
the OIG has determined that extraor-
dinary circumstances warranting de-
barment in excess of three years may 
exist, the notice shall so state. 

(b) A copy of the notice also shall be 
sent to the affected recipient(s), if any, 
which may comment on the proposed 
action in the time frame set out in 
§ 1641.9. 

§ 1641.9 Response to notice of pro-
posed debarment. 

(a) The IPA shall have 30 days from 
receipt of the notice within which to 
respond. 

(b) The response shall be in writing 
and may include information and argu-
ment in opposition to the proposed de-
barment, including any additional spe-
cific information pertaining to the pos-
sible causes for debarment, and infor-
mation and argument in mitigation of 
the proposed period of debarment. 

(c) The response may request a meet-
ing with the debarring official to per-
mit the IPA to discuss issues of fact or 
law relating to the proposed debar-
ment, or to otherwise resolve the pend-
ing matters. Any such meeting shall 
take the form that the debarring offi-
cial deems appropriate and shall be 
held within 20 days of the response. If 
the IPA requests an in person meeting, 
it shall be held at LSC headquarters. 

(d) Failure to respond to the notice 
shall be deemed an admission of the ex-
istence of the cause(s) for debarment 
set forth in the notice and an accept-
ance of the period of debarment. In 
such circumstances, without further 
proceedings, the debarring official may 
enter a final decision stating the period 
of debarment. 

§ 1641.10 Additional proceedings as to 
disputed material facts. 

(a) In actions not based upon a con-
viction or civil judgment under § 1641.7 
(d) or (e), if the debarring official finds 
that the IPA’s submission raises a gen-
uine dispute of material fact, the IPA 
shall be afforded an opportunity to ap-
pear (with counsel, if desired), submit 
documentary evidence, present wit-
nesses, and confront any witnesses the 
OIG presents. If the debarring official 
finds that the IPA’s submission does 
not raise a genuine issue of material 
fact, additional proceedings will not be 
provided. In such case, the hearing 
shall be held entirely by written sub-
missions, except that a meeting may be 
held under § 1641.9(c). 

(b) If the debarring official deter-
mines additional proceedings to be 
warranted, OIG shall notify the IPA. 
Such notice shall include notice of the 
procedures under which such pro-
ceedings shall be conducted. 
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(c) A transcribed record of any addi-
tional proceedings shall be prepared 
and a copy shall be made available to 
the IPA without cost. 

(d) The debarring official may refer 
disputed material facts to a fact finder, 
who need not be a member of the OIG 
staff, for fact finding, analysis and rec-
ommendation. 

Subpart C—Suspension 

§ 1641.11 Suspension. 

(a) IPAs suspended from providing 
audit services for all recipients are pro-
hibited from soliciting or entering into 
any new contracts for audit services 
with recipients for the duration of the 
suspension. Recipients shall not know-
ingly award contracts to, extend or 
modify existing contracts with, or so-
licit proposals from, such IPAs. Sus-
pended IPAs also are prohibited from 
providing audit services to recipients 
as agents or representatives of other 
IPAs. 

(b) IPAs suspended from providing 
audit services for one or more specific 
recipient(s) are prohibited from solic-
iting or entering into any new con-
tracts for audit services with such re-
cipient(s) for the duration of the period 
of suspension as determined pursuant 
to this part. The affected recipient(s) 
shall not knowingly award contracts 
to, extend or modify existing contracts 
with, or solicit proposals from, such 
IPAs. Suspended IPAs also are prohib-
ited from providing audit services to 
the affected recipient(s) as agents or 
representatives of other IPAs, and are 
required to provide prior written notice 
to the debarring official before pro-
viding such services to other recipi-
ents. Suspended IPAs also must pro-
vide prior written notice of the suspen-
sion to any recipient for which the IPA 
provides audit services. 

§ 1641.12 Procedures for suspension. 

Before suspending an IPA, the OIG 
shall provide the IPA with a show 
cause hearing in accordance with the 
procedures set out in §§ 1641.13 through 
1641.15. Such hearing shall be held en-
tirely by written submissions, except 
that a meeting may be held under 
§ 1641.15(c). 

§ 1641.13 Causes for suspension. 

The debarring official may suspend 
an IPA in accordance with the proce-
dures set forth in this part upon ade-
quate evidence that: 

(a) A cause for debarment under 
§ 1641.7 may exist; 

(b) The IPA has been indicted for or 
convicted of any offense described in 
§ 1641.7; 

(c) The IPA has been found subject to 
a civil judgment described in § 1641.7(e), 
whether the judgment is final or not. 

(d) The IPA has been suspended from 
contracting with a Federal agency or 
entity receiving Federal funds includ-
ing when the IPA has stipulated to the 
suspension. 

§ 1641.14 Notice of proposed suspen-
sion. 

(a) Before suspending an IPA, OIG 
shall send it written notice of cause to 
suspend. Such notice shall: 

(1) Include a directive to show cause, 
signed by the debarring official, which 
shall inform the IPA that unless the 
IPA responds within 10 days as pro-
vided in § 1641.15, a suspension will be 
imposed; 

(2) Identify the reasons for the pro-
posed suspension sufficient to put the 
IPA on notice of the conduct or trans-
action(s) upon which a suspension pro-
ceeding is based; 

(3) Identify the regulatory provisions 
governing the suspension proceeding; 
and 

(4) State that, if imposed, the suspen-
sion shall be for a temporary period 
pending the completion of an inves-
tigation or other legal or debarment 
proceeding. 

(b) A copy of the notice also shall be 
sent to the affected recipient(s), if any, 
who may comment on the proposed ac-
tion in the time frame set out in 
§ 1641.15. 

§ 1641.15 Response to notice of pro-
posed suspension. 

(a) The IPA shall have 10 days from 
receipt of the notice within which to 
respond. 
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(b) The response shall be in writing 
and may include information and argu-
ment in opposition to the proposed sus-
pension, including any additional spe-
cific information pertaining to the pos-
sible causes for suspension, and infor-
mation and argument in mitigation of 
the proposed period of suspension. 

(c) The response may request a meet-
ing with the OIG official identified in 
the notice to permit the IPA to discuss 
issues of fact or law relating to the 
proposed suspension, or to otherwise 
resolve the pending matters. 

(1) Any such meeting shall take such 
form as the debarring official deems 
appropriate and shall be held within 10 
days of the response. 

(2) No meeting will be held if a law 
enforcement official, an investigative 
or audit official from another OIG, a 
state licensing body or other organiza-
tion with authority over IPAs, or a 
governmental agency has advised in 
writing that the substantial interest of 
a governmental unit would be preju-
diced by such a meeting and the debar-
ring official determines that the sus-
pension is based on the same facts as 
the pending legal proceedings ref-
erenced by the law enforcement offi-
cial. 

(d) Failure to respond to the notice 
shall be deemed an admission of the ex-
istence of the cause(s) for suspension 
set forth in the notice and an accept-
ance of the period of suspension. In 
such circumstances, the OIG may pro-
ceed to a final decision without further 
proceedings. 

Subpart D—Removal 

§ 1641.16 Removal. 

Removed IPAs are prohibited from 
performing audit services in subse-
quent years under an existing con-
tract(s) with one or more specific re-
cipients. The affected recipient(s) shall 
not extend existing contracts with 
such IPAs. Removed IPAs also are pro-
hibited from providing audit services 
to the affected recipient(s) as agents or 
representatives of other IPAs, and are 
required to provide prior written notice 
to the debarring official before pro-
viding such services to other recipi-
ents. Removed IPAs also must provide 

prior written notice of the removal to 
any such recipient. 

§ 1641.17 Procedures for removal. 

(a) Before removing an IPA, the OIG 
shall provide the IPA with a hearing in 
accordance with the procedures set out 
in §§ 1641.18 through 1641.21. Such hear-
ing shall be held entirely by written 
submissions, except: 

(1) Additional proceedings shall be 
held under § 1641.21 if the debarring offi-
cial finds there is a genuine dispute of 
material fact; and/or 

(2) A meeting may be held under 
§ 1641.20(c). 

(b) A Notice of Proposed Removal 
normally will be accompanied by a No-
tice of Proposed Debarment, and the 
proceedings may be consolidated. 

§ 1641.18 Causes for removal. 

The debarring official may remove an 
IPA from performing audit services in 
accordance with the procedures set 
forth in this part upon a finding by a 
preponderance of the evidence that: 

(a) The IPA has failed significantly 
to comply with government auditing 
standards established by the Comp-
troller General of the United States, 
generally accepted auditing standards 
and/or OIG audit guidance as stated in 
the OIG Audit Guide for Recipients and 
Auditors, including the Compliance 
Supplement for Audits of LSC Recipi-
ents, and in OIG Audit Bulletins; 

(b) The IPA is currently debarred 
from contracting with any Federal 
agency or entity receiving Federal 
funds, including when the IPA has stip-
ulated to such debarment; 

(c) The IPA’s license to practice ac-
counting has been revoked, terminated 
or suspended by a state licensing body 
or other organization with authority 
over IPAs; 

(d) The IPA has been convicted of 
any offense indicating a breach of 
trust, dishonesty or lack of integrity, 
or conspiracy to commit such an of-
fense, and the conviction is final; or 

(e) The IPA has been found subject to 
a civil judgment for any action indi-
cating a breach of trust, dishonesty or 
lack of integrity, or conspiracy to take 
such action, and the judgment is final. 
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§ 1641.19 Notice of proposed removal. 

(a) Before removing an IPA, the OIG 
shall send the IPA written notice of 
the proposed removal. The notice shall 
be sent in a manner that provides evi-
dence of its receipt and shall: 

(1) State that removal is being con-
sidered; 

(2) Identify the reasons for the pro-
posed removal sufficient to put the IPA 
on notice of the conduct or trans-
action(s) upon which a removal pro-
ceeding is based; 

(3) Identify the regulatory provisions 
governing the removal proceeding; and 

(4) State that removal shall be for 
the years remaining on the existing 
contract(s) between the IPA and the re-
cipient(s). 

(b) A copy of the notice also shall be 
sent to the affected recipient(s), if any, 
which may comment on the proposed 
action in the time frame set out in 
§ 1641.20. 

§ 1641.20 Response to notice of pro-
posed removal. 

(a) The IPA shall have 30 days from 
receipt of the notice within which to 
respond. 

(b) The response shall be in writing 
and may include information and argu-
ment in opposition to the proposed re-
moval, including any additional spe-
cific information pertaining to the pos-
sible causes for removal. 

(c) The response may request a meet-
ing with the debarring official to per-
mit the IPA to discuss issues of fact or 
law relating to the proposed removal, 
or to otherwise resolve the pending 
matters. Any such meeting shall take 
the form that the debarring official 
deems appropriate and shall be held 
within 20 days of the response. If the 
IPA requests an in person meeting, it 
shall be held at LSC headquarters. 

(d) Failure to respond to the notice 
shall be deemed an admission of the ex-
istence of the cause(s) for removal set 
forth in the notice and an acceptance 
of the removal. In such circumstances, 
without further proceedings, the debar-
ring official may enter a final decision 
removing the IPA. 

§ 1641.21 Additional proceedings as to 
disputed material facts. 

(a) In actions not based upon a con-
viction or civil judgment under 
§ 1641.18(d) or (e), if the debarring offi-
cial finds that the IPA’s submission 
raises a genuine dispute of material 
fact, the IPA shall be afforded an op-
portunity to appear (with counsel, if 
desired), submit documentary evi-
dence, present witnesses, and confront 
any witnesses the OIG presents. If the 
debarring official finds that the IPA’s 
submission does not raise a genuine 
issue of material fact, additional pro-
ceedings will not be provided. In such 
case, the hearing shall be held entirely 
by written submissions, except that a 
meeting may be held under § 1641.20(c). 

(b) If the debarring official deter-
mines additional proceedings to be 
warranted, OIG shall notify the IPA. 
Such notice shall include notice of the 
procedures under which such pro-
ceedings shall be conducted. 

(c) A transcribed record of any addi-
tional proceedings shall be prepared 
and a copy shall be made available to 
the IPA without cost. 

(d) The debarring official may refer 
disputed material facts to a fact finder, 
who need not be a member of the OIG 
staff, for fact finding, analysis and rec-
ommendation. 

Subpart E—Decisions 

§ 1641.22 Decisions of debarring offi-
cial. 

(a) Standard of proof. (1) A debarment 
or removal must be based on a finding 
that the cause or causes for debarment 
or removal are established by a prepon-
derance of the evidence in the adminis-
trative record of the case. 

(2) A suspension must be based on a 
finding that the cause or causes are es-
tablished by adequate evidence in the 
administrative record of the case. 

(b) The administrative record con-
sists of any information, reports, docu-
ments or other evidence identified and 
relied upon in the Notice of Proposed 
Debarment, the Notice of Proposed 
Suspension, or the Notice of Proposed 
Removal, together with any relevant 
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material contained in the IPA’s re-
sponse or submitted by an affected re-
cipient. In the case of debarment or re-
moval, when additional proceedings are 
necessary to determine disputed mate-
rial facts, the administrative record 
also shall consist of any relevant mate-
rial submitted or presented at such 
proceedings. 

(c) Failure of the OIG to meet a time 
requirement of this part does not pre-
clude the OIG from debarring, sus-
pending or removing an IPA. In ex-
traordinary circumstances, the OIG 
may grant an IPA an extension of the 
time requirements set out in this part. 

(d) Notice of decisions. IPAs shall be 
given prompt notice of the debarring 
official’s decision. A copy of the deci-
sion also will be sent to the affected re-
cipient. If the debarring official debars, 
suspends or removes an IPA, the deci-
sion shall: 

(1) Set forth the finding(s) upon 
which the decision is based; 

(2) Set forth the effect of the debar-
ment, suspension or removal action 
and the effective dates of the action; 

(3) Refer the IPA to its procedural 
rights of appeal and reconsideration 
under § 1641.24; and 

(4) Inform the IPA that a copy of the 
debarring official’s decision will be a 
public document and the fact of debar-
ment, suspension or removal will be a 
matter of public record. 

(e) If the debarring official decides 
that a debarment, suspension, or re-
moval is not warranted, the Notice 
may be withdrawn or the proceeding 
may be otherwise terminated. 

(f) If the debarring official deems it 
appropriate, the debarring official 
may, at any time, settle by agreement 
with the IPA a debarment, suspension, 
or removal action. Such a negotiated 
settlement may include the imposition 
of appropriate conditions on the IPA. 

§ 1641.23 Exceptions to debarment, 
suspension and removal. 

Exceptions to the effects of debar-
ment, suspension or removal may be 
available in unique circumstances, 
when there are compelling reasons to 
use a particular IPA for a specific task. 
Requests for such exceptions may be 
submitted only by the recipient requir-
ing audit services. The Inspector Gen-

eral may except a contract from the ef-
fects of debarment, suspension or re-
moval upon a written determination 
that a compelling reason exists for 
using the IPA in the particular in-
stance. 

§ 1641.24 Appeal and reconsideration 
of debarring official decisions. 

(a) Appeal and reconsideration gen-
erally. A debarred, suspended or re-
moved IPA may submit the debarring 
official’s decision for appeal or recon-
sideration in accordance with this sec-
tion. Within 60 days, IPAs shall be 
given notice of decisions on appeal and 
reconsideration. The relief, if any, 
granted upon appeal or reconsideration 
shall be limited to the relief stated in 
the decision on the appeal or reconsid-
eration. 

(b) Appeal. (1) A debarred, suspended 
or removed IPA may appeal the deci-
sion to the Inspector General, who may 
uphold, reverse or modify the debarring 
official’s decision. 

(2) The appeal shall be filed in writ-
ing: 

(i) By a debarred or removed IPA, 
within 30 days of receipt of the deci-
sion; 

(ii) By a suspended IPA, within 15 
days of receipt of the decision. 

(3) The Inspector General, at his or 
her discretion and after determining 
that a compelling reason exists, may 
stay the effect of the debarment, sus-
pension or removal pending conclusion 
of his or her review of the matter. 

(c) Reconsideration. (1) A debarred, 
suspended or removed IPA may submit 
a request to the debarring official to 
reconsider the debarment, suspension 
or removal decision, reduce the period 
of debarment or removal, or terminate 
the suspension. 

(2) Such requests shall be in writing 
and supported by documentation that 
the requested action is justified by: 

(i) In the case of suspension, reversal 
of the conviction or civil judgment 
upon which the suspension was based; 

(ii) Newly discovered material evi-
dence; 

(iii) Bona fide change in ownership or 
management; 

(iv) Elimination of other causes for 
which the debarment, suspension or re-
moval was imposed; or 
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(v) Other reasons the debarring offi-
cial deems appropriate. 

(3) A request for reconsideration of a 
suspension which was based a convic-
tion, civil judgment, or sanction that 
has been reversed may be filed at any 
time. 

(4) Requests for reconsideration 
based on other grounds may only be 
filed during the period commencing 60 
days after the debarring official’s deci-
sion imposing the debarment or sus-
pension. Only one such request may be 
filed in any twelve month period. 

(5) The debarring official’s decision 
on a request for reconsideration is sub-
ject to the appeal procedure set forth 
in paragraph (b) of this section. 

PART 1642 [RESERVED] 

PART 1643—RESTRICTION ON AS-
SISTED SUICIDE, EUTHANASIA, 
AND MERCY KILLING 

Sec. 
1643.1 Purpose. 
1643.2 Definitions. 
1643.3 Prohibition. 
1643.4 Applicability. 
1643.5 Recipient policies and recordkeeping. 

AUTHORITY: Pub. L. 105–12; 42 U.S.C. 
2996f(b)(11). 

SOURCE: 62 FR 67749, Dec. 30, 1997, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 1643.1 Purpose. 

This part is intended to ensure that 
recipients do not use any LSC funds for 
any assisted suicide, euthanasia or 
mercy killing activities prohibited by 
this part. 

§ 1643.2 Definitions. 

(a) Assisted suicide means the provi-
sion of any means to another person 
with the intent of enabling or assisting 
that person to commit suicide. 

(b) Euthanasia (or mercy killing) is the 
use of active means by one person to 
cause the death of another person for 
reasons assumed to be merciful, regard-
less of whether the person killed con-
sents to be killed. 

(c) Suicide means the act or instance 
of taking one’s own life voluntarily and 
intentionally. 

§ 1643.3 Prohibition. 

No recipient may use LSC funds to 
assist in, support, or fund any activity 
or service which has a purpose of as-
sisting in, or to bring suit or provide 
any other form of legal assistance for 
the purpose of: 

(a) Securing or funding any item, 
benefit, program, or service furnished 
for the purpose of causing, or the pur-
pose of assisting in causing, the sui-
cide, euthanasia, or mercy killing of 
any individual; 

(b) Compelling any person, institu-
tion, or governmental entity to provide 
or fund any item, benefit, program, or 
service for such purpose; or 

(c) Asserting or advocating a legal 
right to cause, or to assist in causing, 
the suicide, euthanasia, or mercy kill-
ing of any individual. 

§ 1643.4 Applicability. 

(a) Nothing in § 1643.3 shall be inter-
preted to apply to: 

(1) The withholding or withdrawing 
of medical treatment or medical care; 

(2) The withholding or withdrawing 
of nutrition or hydration; 

(3) Abortion; 
(4) The use of items, goods, benefits, 

or services furnished for purposes relat-
ing to the alleviation of pain or dis-
comfort even if they may increase the 
risk of death, unless they are furnished 
for the purpose of causing or assisting 
in causing death; or 

(5) The provision of factual informa-
tion regarding applicable law on as-
sisted suicide, euthanasia and mercy 
killing. Nor shall § 1643.3 be interpreted 
as limiting or interfering with the op-
eration of any other statute or regula-
tion governing the activities listed in 
this paragraph. 

(b) This part does not apply to activi-
ties funded with a recipient’s non-LSC 
funds. 

§ 1643.5 Recipient policies and record-
keeping. 

The recipient shall adopt written 
policies to guide its staff in complying 
with this part and shall maintain 
records sufficient to document the re-
cipient’s compliance with this part. 
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