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(i) The agreement meets the require-
ments of paragraph (2) of the definition 
of qualifying master netting agreement 
in § 3.2; and 

(ii) In the event of a legal challenge 
(including one resulting from default 
or from receivership, insolvency, liq-
uidation, or similar proceeding) the 
relevant court and administrative au-
thorities would find the agreement to 
be legal, valid, binding, and enforceable 
under the law of the relevant jurisdic-
tions; and 

(2) Establish and maintain written 
procedures to monitor possible changes 
in relevant law and to ensure that the 
agreement continues to satisfy the re-
quirements of the definition of quali-
fying master netting agreement in § 3.2. 

(e) Repo-style transaction. In order to 
recognize an exposure as a repo-style 
transaction as defined in § 3.2, a na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion must conduct sufficient legal re-
view to conclude with a well-founded 
basis (and maintain sufficient written 
documentation of that legal review) 
that the agreement underlying the ex-
posure: 

(1) Meets the requirements of para-
graph (3) of the definition of repo-style 
transaction in § 3.2, and 

(2) Is legal, valid, binding, and en-
forceable under applicable law in the 
relevant jurisdictions. 

(f) Failure of a QCCP to satisfy the 
rule’s requirements. If a national bank 
or Federal savings association deter-
mines that a CCP ceases to be a QCCP 
due to the failure of the CCP to satisfy 
one or more of the requirements set 
forth in paragraphs (2)(i) through 
(2)(iii) of the definition of a QCCP in 
§ 3.2, the national bank or Federal sav-
ings association may continue to treat 
the CCP as a QCCP for up to three 
months following the determination. If 
the CCP fails to remedy the relevant 
deficiency within three months after 
the initial determination, or the CCP 
fails to satisfy the requirements set 
forth in paragraphs (2)(i) through 
(2)(iii) of the definition of a QCCP con-
tinuously for a three-month period 
after remedying the relevant defi-
ciency, a national bank or Federal sav-
ings association may not treat the CCP 
as a QCCP for the purposes of this part 
until after the national bank or Fed-

eral savings association has deter-
mined that the CCP has satisfied the 
requirements in paragraphs (2)(i) 
through (2)(iii) of the definition of a 
QCCP for three continuous months. 

§§ 3.4–3.9 [Reserved] 

Subpart B—Capital Ratio 
Requirements and Buffers 

SOURCE: 78 FR 62157, 62273, Oct. 11, 2013, un-
less otherwise noted. 

§ 3.10 Minimum capital requirements. 

(a) Minimum capital requirements. (1) A 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation must maintain the following 
minimum capital ratios: 

(i) A common equity tier 1 capital 
ratio of 4.5 percent. 

(ii) A tier 1 capital ratio of 6 percent. 
(iii) A total capital ratio of 8 percent. 
(iv) A leverage ratio of 4 percent. 
(v) For advanced approaches national 

banks or Federal savings associations 
or, for Category III OCC-regulated in-
stitutions, a supplementary leverage 
ratio of 3 percent. 

(vi) For Federal savings associations, 
a tangible capital ratio of 1.5 percent. 

(2) A qualifying community banking 
organization (as defined in § 3.12), that 
is subject to the community bank le-
verage ratio framework (as defined in 
§ 3.12), is considered to have met the 
minimum capital requirements in this 
paragraph (a). 

(b) Standardized capital ratio calcula-
tions. Other than as provided in para-
graph (c) of this section: 

(1) Common equity tier 1 capital ratio. A 
national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s common equity tier 1 cap-
ital ratio is the ratio of the national 
bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
common equity tier 1 capital to stand-
ardized total risk-weighted assets; 

(2) Tier 1 capital ratio. A national 
bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
tier 1 capital ratio is the ratio of the 
national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s tier 1 capital to standard-
ized total risk-weighted assets; 

(3) Total capital ratio. A national 
bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
total capital ratio is the ratio of the 
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national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s total capital to standard-
ized total risk-weighted assets; and 

(4) Leverage ratio. A national bank’s 
or Federal savings association’s lever-
age ratio is the ratio of the national 
bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
tier 1 capital to the national bank’s or 
Federal savings association’s average 
total consolidated assets as reported on 
the national bank’s or Federal savings 
association’s Call Report minus 
amounts deducted from tier 1 capital 
under § 3.22(a), (c) and (d). 

(5) Federal savings association tangible 
capital ratio. A Federal savings associa-
tion’s tangible capital ratio is the ratio 
of the Federal savings association’s 
core capital (tier 1 capital) to average 
total assets as calculated under this 
subpart B. For purposes of this para-
graph (b)(5), the term ‘‘total assets’’ 
means ‘‘total assets’’ as defined in part 
6, subpart A of this chapter, subject to 
subpart G of this part. 

(c) Advanced approaches and Category 
III capital ratio calculations. An ad-
vanced approaches national bank or 
Federal savings association that has 
completed the parallel run process and 
received notification from the OCC 
pursuant to § 3.121(d) must determine 
its regulatory capital ratios as de-
scribed in paragraphs (c)(1) through (3) 
of this section. An advanced ap-
proaches national bank or Federal sav-
ings association must determine its 
supplementary leverage ratio in ac-
cordance with paragraph (c)(4) of this 
section, beginning with the calendar 
quarter immediately following the 
quarter in which the national bank or 
Federal savings association institution 
meets any of the criteria in § 3.100(b)(1). 
A Category III national bank or Fed-
eral savings association must deter-
mine its supplementary leverage ratio 
in accordance with paragraph (c)(4) of 
this section, beginning with the cal-
endar quarter immediately following 
the quarter in which the national bank 
or Federal savings association is iden-
tified as a Category III national bank 
or Federal savings association. 

(1) Common equity tier 1 capital ratio. 
The national bank’s or Federal savings 
association’s common equity tier 1 cap-
ital ratio is the lower of: 

(i) The ratio of the national bank’s or 
Federal savings association’s common 
equity tier 1 capital to standardized 
total risk-weighted assets; and 

(ii) The ratio of the national bank’s 
or Federal savings association’s com-
mon equity tier 1 capital to advanced 
approaches total risk-weighted assets. 

(2) Tier 1 capital ratio. The national 
bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
tier 1 capital ratio is the lower of: 

(i) The ratio of the national bank’s or 
Federal savings association’s tier 1 
capital to standardized total risk- 
weighted assets; and 

(ii) The ratio of the national bank’s 
or Federal savings association’s tier 1 
capital to advanced approaches total 
risk-weighted assets. 

(3) Total capital ratio. The national 
bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
total capital ratio is the lower of: 

(i) The ratio of the national bank’s or 
Federal savings association’s total cap-
ital to standardized total risk-weighted 
assets; and 

(ii) The ratio of the national bank’s 
or Federal savings association’s ad-
vanced-approaches-adjusted total cap-
ital to advanced approaches total risk- 
weighted assets. A national bank’s or 
Federal savings association’s ad-
vanced-approaches-adjusted total cap-
ital is the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s total capital after 
being adjusted as follows: 

(A) An advanced approaches national 
bank or Federal savings association 
must deduct from its total capital any 
allowance for loan and lease losses or 
adjusted allowance for credit losses, as 
applicable, included in its tier 2 capital 
in accordance with § 3.20(d)(3); and 

(B) An advanced approaches national 
bank or Federal savings association 
must add to its total capital any eligi-
ble credit reserves that exceed the na-
tional bank’s or Federal savings asso-
ciation’s total expected credit losses to 
the extent that the excess reserve 
amount does not exceed 0.6 percent of 
the national bank’s or Federal savings 
association’s credit risk-weighted as-
sets. 

(4) Supplementary leverage ratio. (i) An 
advanced approaches national bank’s 
or Federal savings association’s or a 
Category III national bank’s or Federal 
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savings association’s supplementary le-
verage ratio is the ratio of its tier 1 
capital to total leverage exposure, the 
latter of which is calculated as the sum 
of: 

(A) The mean of the on-balance sheet 
assets calculated as of each day of the 
reporting quarter; and 

(B) The mean of the off-balance sheet 
exposures calculated as of the last day 
of each of the most recent three 
months, minus the applicable deduc-
tions under § 3.22(a), (c), and (d). 

(ii) For purposes of this part, total le-
verage exposure means the sum of the 
items described in paragraphs 
(c)(4)(ii)(A) through (H) of this section, 
as adjusted pursuant to paragraph 
(c)(4)(ii)(I) for a clearing member na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion: 

(A) The balance sheet carrying value 
of all of the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s on-balance sheet 
assets, plus the value of securities sold 
under a repurchase transaction or a se-
curities lending transaction that quali-
fies for sales treatment under U.S. 
GAAP, less amounts deducted from tier 
1 capital under § 3.22(a), (c), and (d), and 
less the value of securities received in 
security-for-security repo-style trans-
actions, where the national bank or 
Federal savings association acts as a 
securities lender and includes the secu-
rities received in its on-balance sheet 
assets but has not sold or re-hypoth-
ecated the securities received; 

(B) The PFE for each derivative con-
tract or each single-product netting set 
of derivative contracts (including a 
cleared transaction except as provided 
in paragraph (c)(4)(ii)(I) of this section 
and, at the discretion of the national 
bank or Federal savings association, 
excluding a forward agreement treated 
as a derivative contract that is part of 
a repurchase or reverse repurchase or a 
securities borrowing or lending trans-
action that qualifies for sales treat-
ment under U.S. GAAP), to which the 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation is a counterparty as determined 
under § 3.34, but without regard to 
§ 3.34(b), provided that: 

(1) A national bank or Federal sav-
ings association may choose to exclude 
the PFE of all credit derivatives or 
other similar instruments through 

which it provides credit protection 
when calculating the PFE under § 3.34, 
but without regard to § 3.34(b), provided 
that it does not adjust the net-to-gross 
ratio (NGR); and 

(2) A national bank or Federal sav-
ings association that chooses to ex-
clude the PFE of credit derivatives or 
other similar instruments through 
which it provides credit protection pur-
suant to paragraph (c)(4)(ii)(B)(1) of 
this section must do so consistently 
over time for the calculation of the 
PFE for all such instruments; 

(C) The amount of cash collateral 
that is received from a counterparty to 
a derivative contract and that has off-
set the mark-to-fair value of the deriv-
ative asset, or cash collateral that is 
posted to a counterparty to a deriva-
tive contract and that has reduced the 
national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s on-balance sheet assets, un-
less such cash collateral is all or part 
of variation margin that satisfies the 
following requirements: 

(1) For derivative contracts that are 
not cleared through a QCCP, the cash 
collateral received by the recipient 
counterparty is not segregated (by law, 
regulation or an agreement with the 
counterparty); 

(2) Variation margin is calculated 
and transferred on a daily basis based 
on the mark-to-fair value of the deriva-
tive contract; 

(3) The variation margin transferred 
under the derivative contract or the 
governing rules for a cleared trans-
action is the full amount that is nec-
essary to fully extinguish the net cur-
rent credit exposure to the 
counterparty of the derivative con-
tracts, subject to the threshold and 
minimum transfer amounts applicable 
to the counterparty under the terms of 
the derivative contract or the gov-
erning rules for a cleared transaction; 

(4) The variation margin is in the 
form of cash in the same currency as 
the currency of settlement set forth in 
the derivative contract, provided that 
for the purposes of this paragraph, cur-
rency of settlement means any cur-
rency for settlement specified in the 
governing qualifying master netting 
agreement and the credit support 
annex to the qualifying master netting 
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agreement, or in the governing rules 
for a cleared transaction; 

(5) The derivative contract and the 
variation margin are governed by a 
qualifying master netting agreement 
between the legal entities that are the 
counterparties to the derivative con-
tract or by the governing rules for a 
cleared transaction, and the qualifying 
master netting agreement or the gov-
erning rules for a cleared transaction 
must explicitly stipulate that the 
counterparties agree to settle any pay-
ment obligations on a net basis, taking 
into account any variation margin re-
ceived or provided under the contract if 
a credit event involving either 
counterparty occurs; 

(6) The variation margin is used to 
reduce the current credit exposure of 
the derivative contract, calculated as 
described in § 3.34(a), and not the PFE; 
and 

(7) For the purpose of the calculation 
of the NGR described in 
§ 3.34(a)(2)(ii)(B), variation margin de-
scribed in paragraph (c)(4)(ii)(C)(6) of 
this section may not reduce the net 
current credit exposure or the gross 
current credit exposure; 

(D) The effective notional principal 
amount (that is, the apparent or stated 
notional principal amount multiplied 
by any multiplier in the derivative 
contract) of a credit derivative, or 
other similar instrument, through 
which the national bank or Federal 
savings association provides credit pro-
tection, provided that: 

(1) The national bank or Federal sav-
ings association may reduce the effec-
tive notional principal amount of the 
credit derivative by the amount of any 
reduction in the mark-to-fair value of 
the credit derivative if the reduction is 
recognized in common equity tier 1 
capital; 

(2) The national bank or Federal sav-
ings association may reduce the effec-
tive notional principal amount of the 
credit derivative by the effective no-
tional principal amount of a purchased 
credit derivative or other similar in-
strument, provided that the remaining 
maturity of the purchased credit deriv-
ative is equal to or greater than the re-
maining maturity of the credit deriva-
tive through which the national bank 

or Federal savings association provides 
credit protection and that: 

(i) With respect to a credit derivative 
that references a single exposure, the 
reference exposure of the purchased 
credit derivative is to the same legal 
entity and ranks pari passu with, or is 
junior to, the reference exposure of the 
credit derivative through which the na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion provides credit protection; or 

(ii) With respect to a credit deriva-
tive that references multiple expo-
sures, the reference exposures of the 
purchased credit derivative are to the 
same legal entities and rank pari passu 
with the reference exposures of the 
credit derivative through which the na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion provides credit protection, and the 
level of seniority of the purchased 
credit derivative ranks pari passu to 
the level of seniority of the credit de-
rivative through which the national 
bank or Federal savings association 
provides credit protection; 

(iii) Where a national bank or Federal 
savings association has reduced the ef-
fective notional amount of a credit de-
rivative through which the national 
bank or Federal savings association 
provides credit protection in accord-
ance with paragraph (c)(4)(ii)(D)(1) of 
this section, the national bank or Fed-
eral savings association must also re-
duce the effective notional principal 
amount of a purchased credit deriva-
tive used to offset the credit derivative 
through which the national bank or 
Federal savings association provides 
credit protection, by the amount of 
any increase in the mark-to-fair value 
of the purchased credit derivative that 
is recognized in common equity tier 1 
capital; and 

(iv) Where the national bank or Fed-
eral savings association purchases 
credit protection through a total re-
turn swap and records the net pay-
ments received on a credit derivative 
through which the national bank or 
Federal savings association provides 
credit protection in net income, but 
does not record offsetting deterioration 
in the mark-to-fair value of the credit 
derivative through which the national 
bank or Federal savings association 
provides credit protection in net in-
come (either through reductions in fair 
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value or by additions to reserves), the 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation may not use the purchased 
credit protection to offset the effective 
notional principal amount of the re-
lated credit derivative through which 
the national bank or Federal savings 
association provides credit protection; 

(E) Where a national bank or Federal 
savings association acting as a prin-
cipal has more than one repo-style 
transaction with the same 
counterparty and has offset the gross 
value of receivables due from a 
counterparty under reverse repurchase 
transactions by the gross value of 
payables under repurchase transactions 
due to the same counterparty, the 
gross value of receivables associated 
with the repo-style transactions less 
any on-balance sheet receivables 
amount associated with these repo- 
style transactions included under para-
graph (c)(4)(ii)(A) of this section, un-
less the following criteria are met: 

(1) The offsetting transactions have 
the same explicit final settlement date 
under their governing agreements; 

(2) The right to offset the amount 
owed to the counterparty with the 
amount owed by the counterparty is le-
gally enforceable in the normal course 
of business and in the event of receiver-
ship, insolvency, liquidation, or similar 
proceeding; and 

(3) Under the governing agreements, 
the counterparties intend to settle net, 
settle simultaneously, or settle accord-
ing to a process that is the functional 
equivalent of net settlement, (that is, 
the cash flows of the transactions are 
equivalent, in effect, to a single net 
amount on the settlement date), where 
both transactions are settled through 
the same settlement system, the set-
tlement arrangements are supported by 
cash or intraday credit facilities in-
tended to ensure that settlement of 
both transactions will occur by the end 
of the business day, and the settlement 
of the underlying securities does not 
interfere with the net cash settlement; 

(F) The counterparty credit risk of a 
repo-style transaction, including where 
the national bank or Federal savings 
association acts as an agent for a repo- 
style transaction and indemnifies the 
customer with respect to the perform-
ance of the customer’s counterparty in 

an amount limited to the difference be-
tween the fair value of the security or 
cash its customer has lent and the fair 
value of the collateral the borrower has 
provided, calculated as follows: 

(1) If the transaction is not subject to 
a qualifying master netting agreement, 
the counterparty credit risk (E*) for 
transactions with a counterparty must 
be calculated on a transaction by 
transaction basis, such that each 
transaction i is treated as its own net-
ting set, in accordance with the fol-
lowing formula, where Ei is the fair 
value of the instruments, gold, or cash 
that the national bank or Federal sav-
ings association has lent, sold subject 
to repurchase, or provided as collateral 
to the counterparty, and Ci is the fair 
value of the instruments, gold, or cash 
that the national bank or Federal sav-
ings association has borrowed, pur-
chased subject to resale, or received as 
collateral from the counterparty: 
Ei* = max {0, [Ei ¥ Ci]}; and 

(2) If the transaction is subject to a 
qualifying master netting agreement, 
the counterparty credit risk (E*) must 
be calculated as the greater of zero and 
the total fair value of the instruments, 
gold, or cash that the national bank or 
Federal savings association has lent, 
sold subject to repurchase or provided 
as collateral to a counterparty for all 
transactions included in the qualifying 
master netting agreement (SEi), less 
the total fair value of the instruments, 
gold, or cash that the national bank or 
Federal savings association borrowed, 
purchased subject to resale or received 
as collateral from the counterparty for 
those transactions (SCi), in accordance 
with the following formula: 
E* = max {0, [SEi ¥ SCi]} 

(G) If a national bank or Federal sav-
ings association acting as an agent for 
a repo-style transaction provides a 
guarantee to a customer of the secu-
rity or cash its customer has lent or 
borrowed with respect to the perform-
ance of the customer’s counterparty 
and the guarantee is not limited to the 
difference between the fair value of the 
security or cash its customer has lent 
and the fair value of the collateral the 
borrower has provided, the amount of 
the guarantee that is greater than the 
difference between the fair value of the 
security or cash its customer has lent 
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and the value of the collateral the bor-
rower has provided; 

(H) The credit equivalent amount of 
all off-balance sheet exposures of the 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation, excluding repo-style trans-
actions, repurchase or reverse repur-
chase or securities borrowing or lend-
ing transactions that qualify for sales 
treatment under U.S. GAAP, and deriv-
ative transactions, determined using 
the applicable credit conversion factor 
under § 3.33(b), provided, however, that 
the minimum credit conversion factor 
that may be assigned to an off-balance 
sheet exposure under this paragraph is 
10 percent; and 

(I) For a national bank or Federal 
savings association that is a clearing 
member: 

(1) A clearing member national bank 
or Federal savings association that 
guarantees the performance of a clear-
ing member client with respect to a 
cleared transaction must treat its ex-
posure to the clearing member client 
as a derivative contract for purposes of 
determining its total leverage expo-
sure; 

(2) A clearing member national bank 
or Federal savings association that 
guarantees the performance of a CCP 
with respect to a transaction cleared 
on behalf of a clearing member client 
must treat its exposure to the CCP as 
a derivative contract for purposes of 
determining its total leverage expo-
sure; 

(3) A clearing member national bank 
or Federal savings association that 
does not guarantee the performance of 
a CCP with respect to a transaction 
cleared on behalf of a clearing member 
client may exclude its exposure to the 
CCP for purposes of determining its 
total leverage exposure; 

(4) A national bank or Federal sav-
ings association that is a clearing 
member may exclude from its total le-
verage exposure the effective notional 
principal amount of credit protection 
sold through a credit derivative con-
tract, or other similar instrument, 
that it clears on behalf of a clearing 
member client through a CCP as cal-
culated in accordance with part 
(c)(4)(ii)(D); and 

(5) Notwithstanding paragraphs 
(c)(4)(ii)(I)(1) through (3) of this sec-

tion, a national bank or Federal sav-
ings association may exclude from its 
total leverage exposure a clearing 
member’s exposure to a clearing mem-
ber client for a derivative contract, if 
the clearing member client and the 
clearing member are affiliates and con-
solidated for financial reporting pur-
poses on the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s balance sheet. 

(5) Federal savings association tangible 
capital ratio. A Federal savings associa-
tion’s tangible capital ratio is the ratio 
of the Federal savings association’s 
core capital (tier 1 capital) to average 
total assets as calculated under this 
subpart B. For purposes of this para-
graph (c)(5), the term ‘‘total assets’’ 
means ‘‘total assets’’ as defined in part 
6, subpart A of this chapter, subject to 
subpart G of this part. 

(d) Capital adequacy. (1) Notwith-
standing the minimum requirements in 
this part, a national bank or Federal 
savings association must maintain cap-
ital commensurate with the level and 
nature of all risks to which the na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion is exposed. The supervisory eval-
uation of a national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s capital adequacy 
is based on an individual assessment of 
numerous factors, including those list-
ed at this section (national banks), 12 
CFR 167.3(c) (Federal savings associa-
tions). 

(2) A national bank or Federal sav-
ings association must have a process 
for assessing its overall capital ade-
quacy in relation to its risk profile and 
a comprehensive strategy for maintain-
ing an appropriate level of capital. 

[78 FR 62157, 62273, Oct. 11, 2013, as amended 
at 79 FR 57740, Sept. 26, 2014; 80 FR 41415, 
July 15, 2015; 84 FR 4238, Feb. 14, 2019; 84 FR 
35248, July 22, 2019; 84 FR 59264, Nov. 1, 2019; 
84 FR 61792, Nov. 13, 2019] 

§ 3.11 Capital conservation buffer and 
countercyclical capital buffer 
amount. 

(a) Capital conservation buffer—(1) 
Composition of the capital conservation 
buffer. The capital conservation buffer 
is composed solely of common equity 
tier 1 capital. 

(2) Definitions. For purposes of this 
section, the following definitions 
apply: 
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(i) Eligible retained income. The eligi-
ble retained income of a national bank 
or Federal savings association is the 
national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s net income, calculated in 
accordance with the instructions to the 
Call Report, for the four calendar quar-
ters preceding the current calendar 
quarter, net of any distributions and 
associated tax effects not already re-
flected in net income. 

(ii) Maximum payout ratio. The max-
imum payout ratio is the percentage of 
eligible retained income that a na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion can pay out in the form of dis-
tributions and discretionary bonus 
payments during the current calendar 
quarter. The maximum payout ratio is 
based on the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s capital conserva-
tion buffer, calculated as of the last 
day of the previous calendar quarter, 
as set forth in Table 1 to § 3.11. 

(iii) Maximum payout amount. A na-
tional bank’s or Federal savings asso-
ciation’s maximum payout amount for 
the current calendar quarter is equal 
to the national bank’s or Federal sav-
ings association’s eligible retained in-
come, multiplied by the applicable 
maximum payout ratio, as set forth in 
Table 1 to § 3.11. 

(iv) Private sector credit exposure. Pri-
vate sector credit exposure means an 
exposure to a company or an individual 
that is not an exposure to a sovereign, 
the Bank for International Settle-
ments, the European Central Bank, the 
European Commission, the European 
Stability Mechanism, the European Fi-
nancial Stability Facility, the Inter-
national Monetary Fund, a MDB, a 
PSE, or a GSE. 

(3) Calculation of capital conservation 
buffer. (i) A national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s capital conserva-
tion buffer is equal to the lowest of the 
following ratios, calculated as of the 
last day of the previous calendar quar-
ter: 

(A) The national bank or Federal sav-
ings association’s common equity tier 1 
capital ratio minus the national bank 
or Federal savings association ’s min-
imum common equity tier 1 capital 
ratio requirement under § 3.10; 

(B) The national bank or Federal sav-
ings association’s tier 1 capital ratio 

minus the national bank or Federal 
savings association’s minimum tier 1 
capital ratio requirement under § 3.10; 
and 

(C) The national bank or Federal sav-
ings association’s total capital ratio 
minus the national bank or Federal 
savings association’s minimum total 
capital ratio requirement under § 3.10; 
or 

(ii) Notwithstanding paragraphs 
(a)(3)(i)(A)–(C) of this section, if the na-
tional bank’s or Federal savings asso-
ciation’s common equity tier 1, tier 1 
or total capital ratio is less than or 
equal to the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s minimum com-
mon equity tier 1, tier 1 or total cap-
ital ratio requirement under § 3.10, re-
spectively, the national bank’s or Fed-
eral savings association’s capital con-
servation buffer is zero. 

(4) Limits on distributions and discre-
tionary bonus payments. (i) A national 
bank or Federal savings association 
shall not make distributions or discre-
tionary bonus payments or create an 
obligation to make such distributions 
or payments during the current cal-
endar quarter that, in the aggregate, 
exceed the maximum payout amount. 

(ii) A national bank or Federal sav-
ings association with a capital con-
servation buffer that is greater than 2.5 
percent plus 100 percent of its applica-
ble countercyclical capital buffer, in 
accordance with paragraph (b) of this 
section, is not subject to a maximum 
payout amount under this section. 

(iii) Negative eligible retained income. 
Except as provided in paragraph 
(a)(4)(iv) of this section, a national 
bank or Federal savings association 
may not make distributions or discre-
tionary bonus payments during the 
current calendar quarter if the na-
tional bank’s or Federal savings asso-
ciation’s: 

(A) Eligible retained income is nega-
tive; and 

(B) Capital conservation buffer was 
less than 2.5 percent as of the end of 
the previous calendar quarter. 

(iv) Prior approval. Notwithstanding 
the limitations in paragraphs (a)(4)(i) 
through (iii) of this section, the OCC 
may permit a national bank or Federal 
savings association to make a distribu-
tion or discretionary bonus payment 
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upon a request of the national bank or 
Federal savings association, if the OCC 
determines that the distribution or dis-
cretionary bonus payment would not 
be contrary to the purposes of this sec-
tion, or to the safety and soundness of 

the national bank or Federal savings 
association. In making such a deter-
mination, the OCC will consider the na-
ture and extent of the request and the 
particular circumstances giving rise to 
the request. 

TABLE 1 TO § 3.11—CALCULATION OF MAXIMUM PAYOUT AMOUNT 

Capital conservation buffer Maximum payout ratio 

Greater than 2.5 percent plus 100 percent of the national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount.

No payout ratio limitation applies. 

Less than or equal to 2.5 percent plus 100 percent of the national bank’s or Federal sav-
ings association’s applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount, and greater than 
1.875 percent plus 75 percent of the national bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount.

60 percent. 

Less than or equal to 1.875 percent plus 75 percent of the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount, and greater than 
1.25 percent plus 50 percent of the national bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount.

40 percent. 

Less than or equal to 1.25 percent plus 50 percent of the national bank’s or Federal sav-
ings association’s applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount, and greater than 
0.625 percent plus 25 percent of the national bank’s or Federal savings association’s 
applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount.

20 percent. 

Less than or equal to 0.625 percent plus 25 percent of the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s applicable countercyclical capital buffer amount.

0 percent. 

(v) Other limitations on distributions. 
Additional limitations on distributions 
may apply to a national bank or Fed-
eral savings association under subparts 
H and I of this part; 12 CFR 5.46, 12 CFR 
part 5, subpart E; 12 CFR part 6. 

(b) Countercyclical capital buffer 
amount—(1) General. An advanced ap-
proaches national bank or Federal sav-
ings association, and a Category III na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion, must calculate a countercyclical 
capital buffer amount in accordance 
with paragraphs (b)(1)(i) through (iv) of 
this section for purposes of deter-
mining its maximum payout ratio 
under Table 1 to this section. 

(i) Extension of capital conservation 
buffer. The countercyclical capital 
buffer amount is an extension of the 
capital conservation buffer as de-
scribed in paragraph (a) of this section. 

(ii) Amount. An advanced approaches 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation, and a Category III national 
bank or Federal savings association, 
has a countercyclical capital buffer 
amount determined by calculating the 
weighted average of the counter-
cyclical capital buffer amounts estab-
lished for the national jurisdictions 
where the national bank’s or Federal 
savings association’s private sector 
credit exposures are located, as speci-

fied in paragraphs (b)(2) and (3) of this 
section. 

(iii) Weighting. The weight assigned 
to a jurisdiction’s countercyclical cap-
ital buffer amount is calculated by di-
viding the total risk-weighted assets 
for the national bank’s or Federal sav-
ings association’s private sector credit 
exposures located in the jurisdiction by 
the total risk-weighted assets for all of 
the national bank’s or Federal savings 
association’s private sector credit ex-
posures. The methodology a national 
bank or Federal savings association 
uses for determining risk-weighted as-
sets for purposes of this paragraph (b) 
must be the methodology that deter-
mines its risk-based capital ratios 
under § 3.10. Notwithstanding the pre-
vious sentence, the risk-weighted asset 
amount for a private sector credit ex-
posure that is a covered position under 
subpart F of this part is its specific 
risk add-on as determined under § 3.210 
multiplied by 12.5. 

(iv) Location. (A) Except as provided 
in paragraphs (b)(1)(iv)(B) and 
(b)(1)(iv)(C) of this section, the location 
of a private sector credit exposure is 
the national jurisdiction where the 
borrower is located (that is, where it is 
incorporated, chartered, or similarly 
established or, if the borrower is an in-
dividual, where the borrower resides). 
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10 The OCC expects that any adjustment 
will be based on a determination made joint-
ly by the Board, OCC, and FDIC. 

(B) If, in accordance with subparts D 
or E of this part, the national bank or 
Federal savings association has as-
signed to a private sector credit expo-
sure a risk weight associated with a 
protection provider on a guarantee or 
credit derivative, the location of the 
exposure is the national jurisdiction 
where the protection provider is lo-
cated. 

(C) The location of a securitization 
exposure is the location of the under-
lying exposures, or, if the underlying 
exposures are located in more than one 
national jurisdiction, the national ju-
risdiction where the underlying expo-
sures with the largest aggregate unpaid 
principal balance are located. For pur-
poses of this paragraph (b), the loca-
tion of an underlying exposure shall be 
the location of the borrower, deter-
mined consistent with paragraph 
(b)(1)(iv)(A) of this section. 

(2) Countercyclical capital buffer 
amount for credit exposures in the United 
States—(i) Initial countercyclical capital 
buffer amount with respect to credit expo-
sures in the United States. The initial 
countercyclical capital buffer amount 
in the United States is zero. 

(ii) Adjustment of the countercyclical 
capital buffer amount. The OCC will ad-
just the countercyclical capital buffer 
amount for credit exposures in the 
United States in accordance with appli-
cable law.10 

(iii) Range of countercyclical capital 
buffer amount. The OCC will adjust the 
countercyclical capital buffer amount 
for credit exposures in the United 
States between zero percent and 2.5 
percent of risk-weighted assets. 

(iv) Adjustment determination. The 
OCC will base its decision to adjust the 
countercyclical capital buffer amount 
under this section on a range of macro-
economic, financial, and supervisory 
information indicating an increase in 
systemic risk including, but not lim-
ited to, the ratio of credit to gross do-
mestic product, a variety of asset 
prices, other factors indicative of rel-
ative credit and liquidity expansion or 
contraction, funding spreads, credit 
condition surveys, indices based on 

credit default swap spreads, options 
implied volatility, and measures of sys-
temic risk. 

(v) Effective date of adjusted counter-
cyclical capital buffer amount—(A) In-
crease adjustment. A determination by 
the OCC under paragraph (b)(2)(ii) of 
this section to increase the counter-
cyclical capital buffer amount will be 
effective 12 months from the date of 
announcement, unless the OCC estab-
lishes an earlier effective date and in-
cludes a statement articulating the 
reasons for the earlier effective date. 

(B) Decrease adjustment. A determina-
tion by the OCC to decrease the estab-
lished countercyclical capital buffer 
amount under paragraph (b)(2)(ii) of 
this section will be effective on the day 
following announcement of the final 
determination or the earliest date per-
missible under applicable law or regu-
lation, whichever is later. 

(vi) Twelve month sunset. The counter-
cyclical capital buffer amount will re-
turn to zero percent 12 months after 
the effective date that the adjusted 
countercyclical capital buffer amount 
is announced, unless the OCC an-
nounces a decision to maintain the ad-
justed countercyclical capital buffer 
amount or adjust it again before the 
expiration of the 12-month period. 

(3) Countercyclical capital buffer 
amount for foreign jurisdictions. The OCC 
will adjust the countercyclical capital 
buffer amount for private sector credit 
exposures to reflect decisions made by 
foreign jurisdictions consistent with 
due process requirements described in 
paragraph (b)(2) of this section. 

[78 FR 62157, 62273, Oct. 11, 2013, as amended 
at 84 FR 35249, July 22, 2019; 84 FR 59265, Nov. 
1, 2019] 

§ 3.12 Community bank leverage ratio 
framework. 

(a) Community bank leverage ratio 
framework. (1) Notwithstanding any 
other provision in this part, a quali-
fying community banking organization 
that has made an election to use the 
community bank leverage ratio frame-
work under paragraph (a)(3) of this sec-
tion shall be considered to have met 
the minimum capital requirements 
under § 3.10, the capital ratio require-
ments for the well capitalized capital 
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category under § 6.4(b)(1) of this chap-
ter, and any other capital or leverage 
requirements to which the qualifying 
community banking organization is 
subject, if it has a leverage ratio great-
er than 9 percent. 

(2) For purposes of this section, a 
qualifying community banking organi-
zation means a national bank or Fed-
eral savings association that is not an 
advanced approaches national bank or 
Federal savings association and that 
satisfies all of the following criteria: 

(i) Has a leverage ratio of greater 
than 9 percent; 

(ii) Has total consolidated assets of 
less than $10 billion, calculated in ac-
cordance with the reporting instruc-
tions to the Call Report as of the end of 
the most recent calendar quarter; 

(iii) Has off-balance sheet exposures 
of 25 percent or less of its total consoli-
dated assets as of the end of the most 
recent calendar quarter, calculated as 
the sum of the notional amounts of the 
exposures listed in paragraphs 
(a)(2)(iii)(A) through (I) of this section, 
divided by total consolidated assets, 
each as of the end of the most recent 
calendar quarter: 

(A) The unused portion of commit-
ments (except for unconditionally 
cancellable commitments); 

(B) Self-liquidating, trade-related 
contingent items that arise from the 
movement of goods; 

(C) Transaction-related contingent 
items, including performance bonds, 
bid bonds, warranties, and performance 
standby letters of credit; 

(D) Sold credit protection through 
(1) Guarantees; and 
(2) Credit derivatives; 
(E) Credit-enhancing representations 

and warranties; 
(F) Securities lent and borrowed, cal-

culated in accordance with the report-
ing instructions to the Call Report; 

(G) Financial standby letters of cred-
it; 

(H) Forward agreements that are not 
derivative contracts; and 

(I) Off-balance sheet securitization 
exposures; and 

(iv) Has total trading assets plus 
trading liabilities, calculated in ac-
cordance with the reporting instruc-
tions to the Call Report of 5 percent or 
less of the national bank’s or Federal 

savings association’s total consolidated 
assets, each as of the end of the most 
recent calendar quarter. 

(3)(i) A qualifying community bank-
ing organization may elect to use the 
community bank leverage ratio frame-
work if it makes an opt-in election 
under this paragraph (a)(3). 

(ii) For purposes of this paragraph 
(a)(3), a qualifying community banking 
organization makes an election to use 
the community bank leverage ratio 
framework by completing the applica-
ble reporting requirements of its Call 
Report. 

(iii)(A) A qualifying community 
banking organization that has elected 
to use the community bank leverage 
ratio framework may opt out of the 
community bank leverage ratio frame-
work by completing the applicable 
risk-based and leverage ratio reporting 
requirements necessary to demonstrate 
compliance with § 3.10(a)(1) in its Call 
Report or by otherwise providing this 
information to the OCC. 

(B) A qualifying community banking 
organization that opts out of the com-
munity bank leverage ratio framework 
pursuant to paragraph (a)(3)(iii)(A) of 
this section must comply with 
§ 3.10(a)(1) immediately. 

(b) Calculation of the leverage ratio. A 
qualifying community banking organi-
zation’s leverage ratio is calculated in 
accordance with § 3.10(b)(4), except that 
a qualifying community banking orga-
nization is not required to: 

(1) Make adjustments and deductions 
from tier 2 capital for purposes of 
§ 3.22(c); or 

(2) Calculate and deduct from tier 1 
capital an amount resulting from in-
sufficient tier 2 capital under § 3.22(f). 

(c) Treatment when ceasing to meet the 
qualifying community banking organiza-
tion requirements. (1) Except as provided 
in paragraphs (c)(5) and (6) of this sec-
tion, if a national bank or Federal sav-
ings association ceases to meet the def-
inition of a qualifying community 
banking organization, the national 
bank or Federal savings association 
has two reporting periods under its 
Call Report (grace period) to either 
satisfy the requirements to be a quali-
fying community banking organization 
or to comply with § 3.10(a)(1) and report 
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the required capital measures under 
§ 3.10(a)(1) on its Call Report. 

(2) The grace period begins as of the 
end of the calendar quarter in which 
the national bank or Federal savings 
association ceases to satisfy the cri-
teria to be a qualifying community 
banking organization provided in para-
graph (a)(2) of this section. The grace 
period ends on the last day of the sec-
ond consecutive calendar quarter fol-
lowing the beginning of the grace pe-
riod. 

(3) During the grace period, the na-
tional bank or Federal savings associa-
tion continues to be treated as a quali-
fying community banking organization 
for the purpose of this part and must 
continue calculating and reporting its 
leverage ratio under this section unless 
the national bank or Federal savings 
association has opted out of using the 
community bank leverage ratio frame-
work under paragraph (a)(3) of this sec-
tion. 

(4) During the grace period, the quali-
fying community banking organization 
continues to be considered to have met 
the minimum capital requirements 
under § 3.10(a)(1), the capital ratio re-
quirements for the well capitalized 
capital category under § 6.4(b)(1)(i)(A) 
through (D) of this chapter, and any 
other capital or leverage requirements 
to which the qualifying community 
banking organization is subject, and 
must continue calculating and report-
ing its leverage ratio under this sec-
tion. 

(5) Notwithstanding paragraphs (c)(1) 
through (4) of this section, a national 
bank or Federal savings association 
that no longer meets the definition of a 
qualifying community banking organi-
zation as a result of a merger or acqui-
sition has no grace period and imme-
diately ceases to be a qualifying com-
munity banking organization. Such a 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation must comply with the min-
imum capital requirements under 
§ 3.10(a)(1) and must report the required 
capital measures under § 3.10(a)(1) for 
the quarter in which it ceases to be a 
qualifying community banking organi-
zation. 

(6) Notwithstanding paragraphs (c)(1) 
through (4) of this section, a national 
bank or Federal savings association 

that has a leverage ratio of 8 percent or 
less does not have a grace period and 
must comply with the minimum cap-
ital requirements under § 3.10(a)(1) and 
must report the required capital meas-
ures under § 3.10(a)(1) for the quarter in 
which it reports a leverage ratio of 8 
percent or less. 

[84 FR 61792, Nov. 13, 2019] 

§§ 3.13–3.19 [Reserved] 

Subpart C—Definition of Capital 

SOURCE: 78 FR 62157, 62273, Oct. 11, 2013, un-
less otherwise noted. 

§ 3.20 Capital components and eligi-
bility criteria for regulatory capital 
instruments. 

(a) Regulatory capital components. A 
national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s regulatory capital compo-
nents are: 

(1) Common equity tier 1 capital; 
(2) Additional tier 1 capital; and 
(3) Tier 2 capital. 
(b) Common equity tier 1 capital. Com-

mon equity tier 1 capital is the sum of 
the common equity tier 1 capital ele-
ments in this paragraph (b), minus reg-
ulatory adjustments and deductions in 
§ 3.22. The common equity tier 1 capital 
elements are: 

(1) Any common stock instruments 
(plus any related surplus) issued by the 
national bank or Federal savings asso-
ciation, net of treasury stock, and any 
capital instruments issued by mutual 
banking organizations, that meet all 
the following criteria: 

(i) The instrument is paid-in, issued 
directly by the national bank or Fed-
eral savings association, and represents 
the most subordinated claim in a re-
ceivership, insolvency, liquidation, or 
similar proceeding of the national 
bank or Federal savings association; 

(ii) The holder of the instrument is 
entitled to a claim on the residual as-
sets of the national bank or Federal 
savings association that is propor-
tional with the holder’s share of the 
national bank’s or Federal savings as-
sociation’s issued capital after all sen-
ior claims have been satisfied in a re-
ceivership, insolvency, liquidation, or 
similar proceeding; 
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