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(e) An agreement to initiate may be 
amended by consent of the parties or 
terminated at any time upon written 
notice by any party. 

(f) Entering into an agreement to ini-
tiate an exchange does not legally bind 
any party to proceed with processing 
or to consummate a proposed ex-
change, or to reimburse or pay dam-
ages to any party to a proposed ex-
change that is not consummated or to 
anyone doing business with any such 
party. 

(g) The withdrawal from an exchange 
proposal by the authorized officer at 
any time prior to the notice of decision 
pursuant to § 254.13 of this subpart is 
not appealable under 36 CFR part 214 or 
215. 

[59 FR 10867, Mar. 8, 1984, as amended at 64 
FR 25822, May 13, 1999; 78 FR 33725, June 5, 
2013] 

§ 254.5 Assembled land exchanges. 
(a) Whenever the authorized officer 

determines it to be practicable, an as-
sembled land exchange arrangement 
may be used to facilitate exchanges 
and reduce costs. 

(b) The parties to an exchange may 
agree to such an arrangement where 
multiple ownership parcels of non-Fed-
eral lands are consolidated into a pack-
age for the purpose of completing one 
exchange transaction. 

(c) An assembled land exchange ar-
rangement must be documented in the 
agreement to initiate an exchange, 
pursuant to § 254.4 of this subpart. 

(d) Value of the Federal and non-Fed-
eral lands involved in an assembled 
land exchange arrangement shall be es-
timated pursuant to § 254.9 of this sub-
part. 

[59 FR 10867, Mar. 8, 1994; 59 FR 15501, Apr. 1, 
1994] 

§ 254.6 Segregative effect. 
(a) If a proposal is made to exchange 

Federal lands, the authorized officer 
may request the appropriate State Of-
fice of the Bureau of Management 
(BLM) to segregate the Federal lands 
by a notation on the public land 
records. Subject to valid existing 
rights, the Federal lands shall be seg-
regated from appropriation under the 
public land laws and mineral laws for a 

period not to exceed 5 years from the 
date of record notation. 

(b) Any interests of the United States 
in the non-Federal lands that are cov-
ered by the exchange proposal may be 
noted and segregated from appropria-
tion under the mineral laws for a pe-
riod not to exceed 5 years from the 
date of notation. 

(c) The segregative effect terminates 
as follows: 

(1) Automatically, upon issuance of a 
patent or other document of convey-
ance to the affected lands; 

(2) On the date and time specified in 
an opening order, published in the FED-
ERAL REGISTER by the appropriate BLM 
State Office, if a decision is made not 
to proceed with the exchange or upon 
removal of any lands from the ex-
change proposal; or 

(3) Automatically, at the end of the 
segregation period not to exceed 5 
years from the date of notation on the 
public land records, whichever occurs 
first. 

§ 254.7 Assumption of costs. 

(a) Generally, each party to an ex-
change will bear their own costs of the 
exchange. However, if the authorized 
officer finds it is in the public interest 
as specified in paragraph (b) of this sec-
tion, an agreement to initiate an ex-
change may provide that: 

(1) One or more of the parties may as-
sume, without compensation, all or 
part of the costs or other responsibil-
ities or requirements that the author-
ized officer determines would ordi-
narily be borne by the other parties; or 

(2) Subject to the limitation in para-
graph (c) of this section, the parties 
may agree to make adjustments to the 
relative values involved in an exchange 
transaction, in order to compensate 
parties for assuming costs or other re-
sponsibilities or requirements that the 
authorized officer determines would or-
dinarily be borne by the other parties. 
These costs or services may include but 
are not limited to: land surveys; ap-
praisals; mineral examinations; timber 
cruises; title searches; title curative 
actions; cultural resource surveys and 
mitigation; hazardous substance sur-
veys and controls; removal of encum-
brances; arbitration, including all fees; 
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bargaining; cure of deficiencies pre-
venting highest and best use of the 
land; conduct of public hearings; as-
semblage of non-Federal parcels from 
multiple ownerships; and the expenses 
of complying with laws, regulations, 
and policies applicable to exchange 
transactions, or which are necessary to 
bring the Federal and non-Federal 
lands involved in the exchange to their 
highest and best use for appraisal and 
exchange purposes. 

(b) As a condition of an agreement to 
initiate, the authorized officer may 
agree to assume without compensation 
costs ordinarily borne by the non-Fed-
eral party or to compensate the non- 
Federal party for assuming Federal 
costs only on an exceptional basis 
when it is clearly in the public interest 
and when the authorized officer deter-
mines and documents that each of the 
following circumstances exist: 

(1) The amount of such cost assumed 
or compensation is reasonable and ac-
curately reflects the value of the cost 
or service provided, or any responsi-
bility and requirement assumed; 

(2) The proposed exchange is a high 
priority of the agency; 

(3) The land exchange must be expe-
dited to protect important Federal re-
source values, such as congressionally 
designated areas or endangered species 
habitat; 

(4) Cash equalization funds are avail-
able for compensation of the non-Fed-
eral party; and 

(5) There are no other practicable 
means available to the authorized offi-
cer for meeting Federal exchange proc-
essing costs, responsibilities, or re-
quirements. 

(c) The total amount of an adjust-
ment agreed to as compensation for 
costs pursuant to this section shall not 
exceed the limitations set forth in 
§ 254.12(b) of this subpart. 

[59 FR 10867, Mar. 8, 1994; 59 FR 15501, Apr. 1, 
1994] 

§ 254.8 Notice of exchange proposal. 
(a) Upon entering into an agreement 

to initiate an exchange, the authorized 
officer shall publish a notice once a 
week for four consecutive weeks in 
newspapers of general circulation in 
the counties in which the Federal and 
non-Federal lands or interests proposed 

for exchange are located. The author-
ized officer shall notify authorized 
users, the jurisdictional State and 
local governments, and the congres-
sional delegation and shall make other 
distribution of the notice as appro-
priate. At a minimum, the notice shall 
include: 

(1) The identity of the parties in-
volved in the proposed exchange; 

(2) A description of the Federal and 
non-Federal lands being considered for 
exchange; 

(3) A statement as to the effect of 
segregation from appropriation under 
the public land laws and mineral laws, 
if applicable; 

(4) An invitation to the public to sub-
mit in writing any comments on or 
concerns about the exchange proposal, 
including advising the agency as to any 
liens, encumbrances, or other claims 
relating to the lands being considered 
for exchange; and 

(5) The deadline by which comments 
must be received, and the name, title, 
and address of the official to whom 
comments must be sent and from 
whom additional information may be 
obtained. 

(b) To be assured of consideration in 
the environmental analysis of the pro-
posed exchange, all comments must be 
made in writing to the authorized offi-
cer and postmarked or delivered within 
45 days after the initial date of publica-
tion. 

(c) The authorized officer is not re-
quired to republish legal descriptions 
of any lands that may be excluded from 
the final exchange transaction, pro-
vided such lands were identified in the 
notice of exchange proposal. In addi-
tion, minor corrections of land descrip-
tions and other insignificant changes 
do not require republication. 

§ 254.9 Appraisals. 

The Federal and non-Federal parties 
to an exchange shall comply with the 
appraisal standards as set forth in 
paragraphs (a) through (d) of this sec-
tion, and, to the extent appropriate, 
with the Uniform Appraisal Standards 
for Federal Land Acquisitions: Inter-
agency Land Acquisition Conference 
1992 (Washington, DC, 1992), ISBN 0–16– 
038050–2 when appraising the values of 
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