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Subpart E—Certification 
Procedures 

§ 26.81 What are the requirements for 
Unified Certification Programs? 

(a) You and all other DOT recipients 
in your state must participate in a 
Unified Certification Program (UCP). 

(1) Within three years of March 4, 
1999, you and the other recipients in 
your state must sign an agreement es-
tablishing the UCP for that state and 
submit the agreement to the Secretary 
for approval. The Secretary may, on 
the basis of extenuating circumstances 
shown by the recipients in the state, 
extend this deadline for no more than 
one additional year. 

(2) The agreement must provide for 
the establishment of a UCP meeting all 
the requirements of this section. The 
agreement must specify that the UCP 
will follow all certification procedures 
and standards of this part, on the same 
basis as recipients; that the UCP shall 
cooperate fully with oversight, review, 
and monitoring activities of DOT and 
its operating administrations; and that 
the UCP shall implement DOT direc-
tives and guidance concerning certifi-
cation matters. The agreement shall 
also commit recipients to ensuring 
that the UCP has sufficient resources 
and expertise to carry out the require-
ments of this part. The agreement 
shall include an implementation sched-
ule ensuring that the UCP is fully oper-
ational no later than 18 months fol-
lowing the approval of the agreement 
by the Secretary. 

(3) Subject to approval by the Sec-
retary, the UCP in each state may take 
any form acceptable to the recipients 
in that state. 

(4) The Secretary shall review the 
UCP and approve it, disapprove it, or 
remand it to the recipients in the state 
for revisions. A complete agreement 
which is not disapproved or remanded 
within 180 days of its receipt is deemed 
to be accepted. 

(5) If you and the other recipients in 
your state fail to meet the deadlines 
set forth in this paragraph (a), you 
shall have the opportunity to make an 
explanation to the Secretary why a 
deadline could not be met and why 
meeting the deadline was beyond your 
control. If you fail to make such an ex-

planation, or the explanation does not 
justify the failure to meet the dead-
line, the Secretary shall direct you to 
complete the required action by a date 
certain. If you and the other recipients 
fail to carry out this direction in a 
timely manner, you are collectively in 
noncompliance with this part. 

(b) The UCP shall make all certifi-
cation decisions on behalf of all DOT 
recipients in the state with respect to 
participation in the DOT DBE Pro-
gram. 

(1) Certification decisions by the UCP 
shall be binding on all DOT recipients 
within the state. 

(2) The UCP shall provide ‘‘one-stop 
shopping’’ to applicants for certifi-
cation, such that an applicant is re-
quired to apply only once for a DBE 
certification that will be honored by 
all recipients in the state. 

(3) All obligations of recipients with 
respect to certification and non-
discrimination must be carried out by 
UCPs, and recipients may use only 
UCPs that comply with the certifi-
cation and nondiscrimination require-
ments of this part. 

(c) All certifications by UCPs shall 
be pre-certifications; i.e., certifications 
that have been made final before the 
due date for bids or offers on a contract 
on which a firm seeks to participate as 
a DBE. 

(d) A UCP is not required to process 
an application for certification from a 
firm having its principal place of busi-
ness outside the state if the firm is not 
certified by the UCP in the state in 
which it maintains its principal place 
of business. The ‘‘home state’’ UCP 
shall share its information and docu-
ments concerning the firm with other 
UCPs that are considering the firm’s 
application. 

(e) Subject to DOT approval as pro-
vided in this section, the recipients in 
two or more states may form a re-
gional UCP. UCPs may also enter into 
written reciprocity agreements with 
other UCPs. Such an agreement shall 
outline the specific responsibilities of 
each participant. A UCP may accept 
the certification of any other UCP or 
DOT recipient. 

(f) Pending the establishment of 
UCPs meeting the requirements of this 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:28 Jun 11, 2021 Jkt 250226 PO 00000 Frm 00314 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Q:\49\49V1.TXT PC31kp
ay

ne
 o

n 
V

M
O

F
R

W
IN

70
2 

w
ith

 $
$_

JO
B



305 

Office of the Secretary of Transportation § 26.83 

section, you may enter into agree-
ments with other recipients, on a re-
gional or inter-jurisdictional basis, to 
perform certification functions re-
quired by this part. You may also grant 
reciprocity to other recipient’s certifi-
cation decisions. 

(g) Each UCP shall maintain a uni-
fied DBE directory containing, for all 
firms certified by the UCP (including 
those from other states certified under 
the provisions of this part), the infor-
mation required by § 26.31. The UCP 
shall make the directory available to 
the public electronically, on the inter-
net, as well as in print. The UCP shall 
update the electronic version of the di-
rectory by including additions, dele-
tions, and other changes as soon as 
they are made and shall revise the 
print version of the Directory at least 
once a year. 

(h) Except as otherwise specified in 
this section, all provisions of this sub-
part and subpart D of this part per-
taining to recipients also apply to 
UCPs. 

[64 FR 5126, Feb. 2, 1999, as amended at 76 FR 
5100, Jan. 28, 2011] 

§ 26.83 What procedures do recipients 
follow in making certification deci-
sions? 

(a) You must ensure that only firms 
certified as eligible DBEs under this 
section participate as DBEs in your 
program. 

(b) You must determine the eligi-
bility of firms as DBEs consistent with 
the standards of subpart D of this part. 
When a UCP is formed, the UCP must 
meet all the requirements of subpart D 
of this part and this subpart that re-
cipients are required to meet. 

(c)(1) You must take all the following 
steps in determining whether a DBE 
firm meets the standards of subpart D 
of this part: 

(i) Perform an on-site visit to the 
firm’s principal place of business. You 
must interview the principal officers 
and review their résumés and/or work 
histories. You may interview key per-
sonnel of the firm if necessary. You 
must also perform an on-site visit to 
job sites if there are such sites on 
which the firm is working at the time 
of the eligibility investigation in your 
jurisdiction or local area. You may 

rely upon the site visit report of any 
other recipient with respect to a firm 
applying for certification; 

(ii) Analyze documentation related to 
the legal structure, ownership, and 
control of the applicant firm. This in-
cludes, but is not limited to, Articles of 
Incorporation/Organization; corporate 
by-laws or operating agreements; orga-
nizational, annual and board/member 
meeting records; stock ledgers and cer-
tificates; and State-issued Certificates 
of Good Standing 

(iii) Analyze the bonding and finan-
cial capacity of the firm; lease and 
loan agreements; bank account signa-
ture cards; 

(iv) Determine the work history of 
the firm, including contracts it has re-
ceived, work it has completed; and pay-
roll records; 

(v) Obtain a statement from the firm 
of the type of work it prefers to per-
form as part of the DBE program and 
its preferred locations for performing 
the work, if any. 

(vi) Obtain or compile a list of the 
equipment owned by or available to the 
firm and the licenses the firm and its 
key personnel possess to perform the 
work it seeks to do as part of the DBE 
program; 

(vii) Obtain complete Federal income 
tax returns (or requests for extensions) 
filed by the firm, its affiliates, and the 
socially and economically disadvan-
taged owners for the last 3 years. A 
complete return includes all forms, 
schedules, and statements filed with 
the Internal Revenue Service. 

(viii) Require potential DBEs to com-
plete and submit an appropriate appli-
cation form, except as otherwise pro-
vided in § 26.85 of this part. 

(2) You must use the application 
form provided in Appendix F to this 
part without change or revision. How-
ever, you may provide in your DBE 
program, with the written approval of 
the concerned operating administra-
tion, for supplementing the form by re-
questing specified additional informa-
tion not inconsistent with this part. 

(3) You must make sure that the ap-
plicant attests to the accuracy and 
truthfulness of the information on the 
application form. This shall be done ei-
ther in the form of an affidavit sworn 
to by the applicant before a person who 
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