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total consolidated assets, subject to re-
view and adjustment by the Board of 
Governors of the Federal Reserve Sys-
tem. 

(gg) Cross-jurisdictional activity. The 
cross-jurisdictional activity of a bank-
ing organization is equal to the cross- 
jurisdictional activity of the banking 
organization as reported on the FR Y– 
15. 

(hh) Foreign banking organization has 
the same meaning as in § 211.21(o) of 
this chapter. 

(ii) FR Y–9C means the Consolidated 
Financial Statements for Holding Com-
panies reporting form. 

(jj) FR Y–9LP means the Parent Com-
pany Only Financial Statements of 
Large Holding Companies. 

(kk) FR Y–15 means the Systemic 
Risk Report. 

(ll) GAAP means generally accepted 
accounting principles as used in the 
United States. 

(mm) Off-balance sheet exposure. The 
off-balance sheet exposure of a banking 
organization is equal to: 

(1) The total exposure of the banking 
organization, as reported by the bank-
ing organization on the FR Y–15; minus 

(2) The total consolidated assets of 
the banking organization for the same 
calendar quarter. 

(nn) State means any state, common-
wealth, territory, or possession of the 
United States, the District of Colum-
bia, the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico, 
the Commonwealth of the Northern 
Mariana Islands, American Samoa, 
Guam, or the United States Virgin Is-
lands. 

(oo) Total consolidated assets. Total 
consolidated assets of a banking orga-
nization are equal to its total consoli-
dated assets calculated based on the 
average of the balances as of the close 
of business for each day for the cal-
endar quarter or an average of the bal-
ances as of the close of business on 
each Wednesday during the calendar 
quarter, as reported on the FR Y–9C. 

(pp) Total nonbank assets. Total 
nonbank assets of a banking organiza-
tion is equal to the total nonbank as-
sets of such banking organization, as 
reported on the FR Y–9LP. 

(qq) U.S. government agency means an 
agency or instrumentality of the 
United States whose obligations are 

fully and explicitly guaranteed as to 
the timely payment of principal and in-
terest by the full faith and credit of the 
United States. 

(rr) U.S. government-sponsored enter-
prise means an entity originally estab-
lished or chartered by the U.S. govern-
ment to serve public purposes specified 
by the U.S. Congress, but whose obliga-
tions are not explicitly guaranteed by 
the full faith and credit of the United 
States. 

(ss) Weighted short-term wholesale 
funding is equal to the weighted short- 
term wholesale funding of a banking 
organization, as reported on the FR Y– 
15. 

(tt) Voting percentage. For purposes of 
this part, the percentage of a class of a 
company’s voting securities controlled 
by a person is the greater of: 

(1) The quotient, expressed as a per-
centage, of the number of shares of the 
class of voting securities controlled by 
the person, divided by the number of 
shares of the class of voting securities 
that are issued and outstanding, both 
as adjusted by § 238.9 of this part; and 

(2) The quotient, expressed as a per-
centage, of the number of votes that 
may be cast by the person on the vot-
ing securities controlled by the person, 
divided by the total votes that are le-
gally entitled to be cast by the issued 
and outstanding shares of the class of 
voting securities, both as adjusted by 
§ 238.9 of this part. 

[Reg. LL, 76 FR 56532, Sept. 13, 2011, as 
amended at 84 FR 59076, Nov. 1, 2019; 85 FR 
12426, Mar. 2, 2020] 

§ 238.3 Administration. 

(a) Delegation of authority. Designated 
Board members and officers and the 
Federal Reserve Banks are authorized 
by the Board to exercise various func-
tions prescribed in this regulation, in 
the Board’s Rules Regarding Delega-
tion of Authority (12 CFR part 265), the 
Board’s Rules of Procedure (12 CFR 
part 262), and in Board orders. 

(b) Appropriate Federal Reserve Bank. 
In administering this regulation, un-
less a different Federal Reserve Bank is 
designated by the Board, the appro-
priate Federal Reserve Bank is as fol-
lows: 
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(1) For a savings and loan holding 
company (or a company applying to be-
come a savings and loan holding com-
pany): the Reserve Bank of the Federal 
Reserve district in which the com-
pany’s banking operations are prin-
cipally conducted, as measured by 
total domestic deposits in its sub-
sidiary savings association on the date 
it became (or will become) a savings 
and loan holding company; 

(2) For an individual or company sub-
mitting a notice under subpart D of 
this part: The Reserve Bank of the Fed-
eral Reserve district in which the 
banking operations of the savings and 
loan holding company to be acquired 
are principally conducted, as measured 
by total domestic deposits on the date 
the notice is filed. 

§ 238.4 Records, reports, and inspec-
tions. 

(a) Records. Each savings and loan 
holding company shall maintain such 
books and records as may be prescribed 
by the Board. Each savings and loan 
holding company and its non-deposi-
tory affiliates shall maintain accurate 
and complete records of all business 
transactions. Such records shall sup-
port and be readily reconcilable to any 
regulatory reports submitted to the 
Board and financial reports prepared in 
accordance with GAAP. 

The records shall be maintained in 
the United States and be readily acces-
sible for examination and other super-
visory purposes within 5 business days 
upon request by the Board, at a loca-
tion acceptable to the Board. 

(b) Reports. Each savings and loan 
holding company and each subsidiary 
thereof, other than a savings associa-
tion, shall file with the Board such re-
ports as may be required by the Board. 
Such reports shall be made under oath 
or otherwise, and shall be in such form 
and for such periods, as the Board may 
prescribe. Each report shall contain in-
formation concerning the operations of 
such savings and loan holding company 
and its subsidiaries as the Board may 
require. 

(c) Registration statement—(1) Filing of 
registration statement. Not later than 90 
days after becoming a savings and loan 
holding company, each savings and 
loan holding company shall register 

with the Board by furnishing informa-
tion in the manner and form prescribed 
by the Board. 

(2) Date of registration. The date of 
registration of a savings and loan hold-
ing company shall be the date on which 
its registration statement is received 
by the Board. 

(3) Extension of time for registration. 
For timely and good cause shown, the 
Board may extend the time within 
which a savings and loan holding com-
pany shall register. 

(d) Release from registration. The 
Board may at any time, upon its own 
motion or upon application, release a 
registered savings and loan holding 
company from any registration there-
tofore made by such company, if the 
Board shall determine that such com-
pany no longer has control of any sav-
ings association or no longer qualifies 
as a savings and loan holding company. 

(e) Examinations. Each savings and 
loan holding company and each sub-
sidiary thereof shall be subject to such 
examinations as the Board may pre-
scribe. The Board shall, to the extent 
deemed feasible, use for the purposes of 
this section reports filed with or ex-
aminations made by other Federal 
agencies or the appropriate State su-
pervisory authority. 

(f) Appointment of agent. The Board 
may require any savings and loan hold-
ing company, or persons connected 
therewith if it is not a corporation, to 
execute and file a prescribed form of ir-
revocable appointment of agent for 
service of process. 

§ 238.5 Audit of savings association 
holding companies. 

(a) General. The Board may require, 
at any time, an independent audit of 
the financial statements of, or the ap-
plication of procedures agreed upon by 
the Board to a savings and loan holding 
company, or nondepository affiliate by 
qualified independent public account-
ants when needed for any safety and 
soundness reason identified by the 
Board. 

(b) Audits required for safety and 
soundness purposes. (1) The Board re-
quires an independent audit for safety 
and soundness purposes if, as of the be-
ginning of its fiscal year, a savings and 
loan holding company controls savings 
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