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Small Business Administration § 130.620 

§ 130.480 Program income. 
(a) Program income and interest 

earned on program income, may only 
be used for authorized purposes, in ac-
cordance with 2 CFR 200.307 and the co-
operative agreement, such as to expand 
the quantity or quality of services, re-
sources or outreach provided by the 
SBDC network. 

(b) Program income may not be re-
ported or used as a matching resource. 
Unused program income must be car-
ried over to the subsequent budget pe-
riod by the SBDC network; however, 
the aggregate amount of network pro-
gram income cannot exceed 25 percent 
of the total SBDC budget (Federal and 
matching expenditures). 

(c) Program income exceeding 25 per-
cent of the total approved SBDC budg-
et must be expended by the SBDC net-
work prior to the end of the budget/ 
project period in which the excess oc-
curs. 

(d) The Lead Center must report the 
consolidated program income sources 
and uses as an attachment to the fi-
nancial status report for the SBDC net-
work during the budget period. The 
SBDC must provide a narrative de-
scribing how program income was used 
to further program objectives. 

[88 FR 76647, Nov. 7, 2023] 

§ 130.490 Property standard. 
See 2 CFR part 200, subpart D. 

[88 FR 76647, Nov. 7, 2023] 

§ 130.500 Funding. 
See 2 CFR 200.305. 

[88 FR 76647, Nov. 7, 2023] 

§ 130.600 Cooperative agreement. 
(a) Cooperative agreement provisions. A 

recipient organization will incorporate 
into its SBDC sub-agreements and con-
tracts the provisions of the cooperative 
agreement. 

(b) Sub-agreements. SBA reserves the 
right to disapprove any sub-agreement 
entered into by recipient organizations 
with SBDC service center organiza-
tions, vendors, or contractors. 

(c) Goals and milestones. (1) The AA/ 
SBDC or designee will develop perform-
ance measurements for SBDC networks 
and include provisions for their 

achievement in the cooperative agree-
ment. 

(2) The AA/SBDC or designee will ne-
gotiate with the designated association 
and Lead Center to establish the an-
nual goals, milestones, and activities 
for the cooperative agreement. 

(3) Failure to meet the goals and 
milestones of the cooperative agree-
ment may be considered in part of the 
determination for suspension, termi-
nation, or non-renewal in accordance 
with the dispute resolution procedures 
set forth in § 130.630. 

(4) Agency loan goals may not be ne-
gotiated or incorporated into the coop-
erative agreement without the prior 
written approval of the AA/SBDC. 

(d) Procurement policies and proce-
dures. (1) Contracts and sub-agreements 
supported with funds provided under 
the cooperative agreement must com-
ply with the procurement procedures of 
the recipient organization. 

(2) Contracting procedures must en-
courage open competition among quali-
fied vendors and promote the effective, 
efficient, and responsible use of pro-
gram resources and OMB guidance. 

(3) Contracting procedures should 
provide for domestic sourcing pref-
erences to the greatest extent prac-
ticable, showing preference for the pur-
chase, acquisition, or use of goods, 
products, or materials produced in the 
United States. 

[88 FR 76647, Nov. 7, 2023] 

§ 130.610 General terms. 

Upon approval of the initial or re-
newal application, SBA will enter into 
a cooperative agreement with the re-
cipient organization, setting forth the 
programmatic and fiscal responsibil-
ities of the recipient organization and 
SBA, the scope of the project to be 
funded, and the budget of the program 
year covered by the cooperative agree-
ment. 

[60 FR 31056, June 13, 1995, as amended at 88 
FR 76647, Nov. 7, 2023] 

§ 130.620 Revisions and amendments 
to cooperative agreements. 

(a) Requests for revisions. The coopera-
tive agreement may not be unilaterally 
amended, modified, or revised by the 
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