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Administration (SAMHSA) in
November 1995.

The meeting will be held by
telephone conference call. The meeting
agenda of the Advisory Committee for
Women’s Services will include a
continuation of a discussion of women’s
substance abuse and mental health
service needs that was begun at the
Committee’s September meeting,
including a discussion of the following:
The SAMHSA fiscal year 1996 budget;
the SAMHSA reauthorization; regional
meetings regarding the proposed
Performance Partnership Grants; policy
on inclusion and attention to the needs
of women and racial/ethnic minority
populations through SAMHSA’s
extramural programs; activities of the
National Women’s Resource Center for
the Prevention and Treatment of
Alcohol, Tobacco and Other Drug Abuse
and Mental Illness; a report on the
representation of women in senior-level
positions at SAMHSA; and the response
to resolutions passed at the committee’s
September meeting.

A summary of the meeting and/or a
roster of committee members may be
obtained from: Pamela J. McDonnell,
Executive Secretary, Advisory
Committee for Women’s Services, Office
for Women’s Services, Substance Abuse
and Mental Health Services
Administration, Parklawn Building,
Room 13–99, 5600 Fishers Lane,
Rockville, Maryland 20857, Telephone:
(301) 443–5184.

Substantive information may be
obtained from the contact whose name
and telephone number is listed below.

Committee Name: Advisory Committee for
Women’s Services.

Meeting Date: November 21, 1995.
Place: 5600 Fishers Lane, Parklawn

Building, Room 12–94, Rockville, Maryland
20857.

Open: 2 p.m. to 4 p.m.
Contact: Pamela J. McDonnell, Room 13–

99, Parklawn Building, Telephone: (301)
443–5184.

Dated: October 19, 1995.
Jeri Lipov,
Committee Management Officer, Substance
Abuse and Mental Health Services
Administration.
[FR Doc. 95–26413 Filed 10–24–95; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4162–20–P

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

Fish and Wildlife Service

Notice of Receipt of Applications for
Permit

The following applicants have
applied for a permit to conduct certain
activities with endangered species. This

notice is provided pursuant to Section
10(c) of the Endangered Species Act of
1973, as amended (16 U.S.C. 1531, et
seq.):
PRT–714601
Applicant: The Burke Memorial Museum,

Seattle, WA.

The applicant requests renewal of
their permit to export and re-import
shipments of nonliving museum/
herbarium specimens of endangered and
threatened species [excluding bald eagle
(Halieaeetus leucocephalus)] previously
accessioned into their collections for the
purpose of scientific research. This
notice covers activities conducted by
the applicant over a five year period.
PRT–807780
Applicant: Hartley Boss, Orrville, OH.

The applicant requests a permit to
import four pairs of captive-hatched
Cabot’s tragopan (Tragopan caboti) from
Peter Verbeek, Wyoming, Ontario,
Canada for the purpose of enhancement
of the species through captive
propagation.
PRT–721476
Applicant: James Clement, Wasilla, AK.

The applicant requests a permit to
reexport and reimport African elephant
(Loxodonta africana) and progent of the
animals currently held by the applicant
and any animals acquired in the United
States by the applicant to/from
worldwide locations to enhance the
survival of the species through
conservation education. This
notification covers activities conducted
by the applicant over a three year
period.
PRT–737979
Applicant: Helen Carpenter, Jefferson, TX.

The applicant requests a permit to
reexport and reimport captive-born
Leopard (Panthera pardus), Tiger
(Panthera tigris), and Jaguar (Panthera
onca) and progeny of the animals
currently held by the applicant and any
of these animals acquired in the United
States by the applicant to/from
worldwide locations to enhance the
survival of the species through
conservation education. This
notification covers activities conducted
by the applicant over a three year
period.
PRT–806954

Applicant: University of California—San
Diego, LaJolla, CA.

The applicant requests a permit to
import blood and tissue samples from
up to ten wild-caught San Esteban
chuckwallas, (Sauromalus varius), to
enhance the survival of the species
through scientific research.

PRT–807615
Applicant: Alan Sackman, Sands Point, NY.

The applicant requests a permit to
import a sport-hunted trophy of one
male bontebok (Damaliscus pygarcus
dorcas) culled from the captive herd
maintained by F.W.M. Bowker,
‘‘Thornkloof’’ Grahamstown, Republic
of South Africa, for the purpose of
enhancement of the survival of the
species.
PRT–807708
Applicant: Philadelphia Zoological Garden,

Philadelphia, PA.

The applicant requests a permit to
import one captive-born female
bicolored tamarin (Saguinus bicolor
bicolor) from the Jersey Wildlife
Preservation Trust, Channel Islands,
United Kingdom for the purpose of
enhancement of the survival of the
species through captive propagation.

Written data or comments should be
submitted to the Director, U.S. Fish and
Wildlife Service, Office of Management
Authority, 4401 North Fairfax Drive,
Room 420(C), Arlington, Virginia 22203
and must be received by the Director
within 30 days of the date of this
publication.

Documents and other information
submitted with these applications are
available for review, subject to the
requirements of the Privacy Act and
Freedom of Information Act, by any
party who submits a written request for
a copy of such documents to the
following office within 30 days of the
date of publication of this notice: U.S.
Fish and Wildlife Service, Office of
Management Authority, 4401 North
Fairfax Drive, Room 420(c), Arlington,
Virginia 22203. Phone: (703/358–2104);
FAX: (703/358–2281).

Dated: October 20, 1995.
Caroline Anderson,
Acting Chief, Branch of Permits, Office of
Management Authority.
[FR Doc. 95–26457 Filed 10–24–95; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4310–55–M

Availability of an Environmental
Assessment and Receipt of an
Application for an Incidental Take
Permit for the 27G Pipeline
Replacement Project, Kern County,
California

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife, Interior.
ACTION: Notice of Availability.

SUMMARY: This notice advises the public
that Chevron Pipeline Company has
applied to the U.S. Fish and Wildlife
Service (Service) for an incidental take
permit pursuant to section 10(a)(1)(B) of
the Endangered Species Act of 1973, as
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amended (Act). The application has
been assigned permit number PRT–
807634. The proposed permit would
authorize the incidental take of the
endangered San Joaquin kit fox (Vulpes
macrotis mutica), blunt-nosed leopard
lizard (Gambelia silus), giant kangaroo
rat (Dipodomys ingens), San Joaquin
woollythreads (Lembertia congdonii),
California jewelflower (Caulanthus
californicus), Kern mallow (Eremalche
kernensis) and the threatened Hoover’s
eriastrum (Eriastrum hooveri) and/or
their habitat during the implementation
of the pipeline replacement activities.
The permit will become effective for the
following currently unlisted, covered
species if they are listed under the Act:
San Joaquin whipsnake (Masticophis
flagelium ruddocki), short-nosed
kangaroo rat (Dipodomys nitatoides
brevinasus), San Joaquin pocket mouse
(Perognathus inoratus), Tulare
grasshopper mouse (Onychomys
torridus tulerensis), San Joaquin
LeConte’s thrasher (Toxostoma lecontei
macmillanorum), western burrowing
owl, (Athene cunicularia hypugea), oil
nest straw (Stylocline citroiem), forked
fiddleneck (Amsinckia vernicosa) and
heart scale (Atriplex cordulata).

The Service also announces the
availability of an environmental
assessment (EA) for the incidental take
permit application, which includes the
proposed habitat conservation plan
(HCP) fully describing the proposed
project and mitigation, and the
accompanying implementing agreement
(IA). This notice is provided pursuant to
section 10(a) of the Act and National
Environmental Policy Act regulations
(40 CFR 1506.6). All comments,
including names and addresses,
received will become part of the official
administrative record and may be made
available to the public.

DATES: Written comments on the permit
application, EA and IA should be
received on or before November 24,
1995.

ADDRESSES: Comments regarding the
application or adequacy of the HCP, EA
and IA should be addressed to Mr. Joel
Medlin, Field Supervisor, U.S. Fish and
Wildlife Service, Sacramento Field
Office, 2800 Cottage Way, Room E–
1823, Sacramento, California 95825.
Please refer to permit number PRT–
807634 when submitting comments.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr.
Michael Horton or Ms. Sheila Larsen,
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service,
Sacramento Field Office (address
above), telephone (916–979–2725).

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

Availability of Documents
Individuals wishing copies of the

documents should immediately contact
the Service’s Sacramento Field Office at
the above referenced address, or by
telephone at (916) 979–2725.
Documents will also be available for
public inspection, by appointment,
during normal business hours at the
above address.

Background
Section 9 of the Act prohibits the

‘‘taking’’ of a species listed as
threatened or endangered. However, the
Service, under limited circumstances,
may issue permits to take listed species
incidental to, and not the purpose of,
otherwise lawful activities. Regulations
governing permits for threatened and
endangered species are promulgated at
50 CFR 17.22 and 17.32.

Chevron Pipeline Company proposes
to replace the pipeline located in Kern
County, Sections 27, 29, 31, 32, and 33,
T31S, R24E, and Section 1, T32S, R23E,
MDB&M. The pipeline construction
corridor is 50 feet wide and 22,240 feet
long, covering an area of approximately
25.5 acres, entirely within the sections
listed above. The HCP boundary is the
same as the pipeline corridor. In the
eastern half of the proposed pipeline
route, the pipeline will be installed
under an existing paved road; the
western half of the pipeline route
consists of an existing pipeline right-of-
way characterized by disturbed saltbush
scrub habitat. Project activities may
result in take of covered species and
temporary disturbance to their habitats
within the 25.5-acre project area. The
proposed project will temporarily
disturb the San Joaquin kit fox, blunt-
nosed leopard lizard, giant kangaroo rat,
San Joaquin woollythreads, California
jewelflower, Kern mallow and the
threatened Hoover’s eriastrum and/or
their habitat during the implementation
of the pipeline replacement activities.
The HCP involves implementation of
measures to minimize effects to the
environment by utilizing existing
roadways for all construction related
activities, and designating Habitat
Management Lands to compensate for
the natural land lost. Chevron Pipeline
Company will dedicate 28 acres of land
in Chevron Corporation’s Lokern Land
Bank, or another approved land bank in
consultation with the Service, for
preservation in perpetuity. In addition,
direct harassment of covered species
will be avoided to the greatest extent
practicable.

The EA considers the environmental
consequences of three alternatives. The

no action alternative may result in the
accidental release of crude oil, which
would have adverse impacts on the
surrounding habitat. The no action
alternative also would likely result in an
increased amount of maintenance
activity and consequently, an increased
amount of disturbance. Alternative 3
would involve similar construction
activities in a project area south of the
proposed route. The alternative route is
less developed and would, therefore,
have a greater potential for take of listed
or candidate species. Both alternatives
have been thoroughly reviewed and
eliminated from further consideration
because they would have the potential
for greater adverse environmental
impacts in both the short and long term.
The Service considers implementation
of the proposed HCP in connection with
a section 10(a)(1)(B) permit to be an
effective means to reconcile oil drilling
activities with the section 9 listed
species take prohibition and other
conservation mandates under the Act.

This notice is provided pursuant to
section 10(c) of the Act and National
Environmental Policy Act of 1969
(NEPA) regulations (40 CFR 1506.6).
The Service will evaluate the
application, associated documents, and
comments submitted thereon to
determine whether the application
meets the requirements of NEPA
regulations and section 10(a) of the Act.
If it is determined that the requirements
are met, a permit will be issued for the
incidental take of the listed species. The
final NEPA and permit determination
will be made no sooner than 30 days
from the date of this notice.

Dated: October 18, 1995.
William F. Shake,
Acting Deputy Regional Director, Region 1,
Portland, Oregon.
[FR Doc. 95–26444 Filed 10–24–95; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4310–55–P

Availability of an Environmental
Assessment and Receipt of an
Application for an Incidental Take
Permit for the Vintage Petroleum Inc.’s
Two Exploratory Well Site Locations,
Kern County, CA

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife, Interior.
ACTION: Notice of availability.

SUMMARY: This notice advises the public
that Vintage Petroleum Inc. has applied
to the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service
(Service) for an incidental take permit
pursuant to section 10(a)(1)(B) of the
Endangered Species Act of 1973, as
amended (Act). The application has
been assigned permit number PRT–
807633. The proposed permit would
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