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these responses for the purposes of
calculating the reopening burden under
Rule 10a–1. Each of these approximately
1,500 registered broker-dealers effects
sell orders for securities registered on,
or admitted to unlisted trading
privileges, on a national securities
exchange. In addition, each respondent
makes an estimated 60,933 annual
responses, for an aggregate total of
91,400,000 responses per year. Each
response takes approximately .000139
hours (.5 seconds) to complete. Thus,
the total compliance burden per year is
12,705 burden hours.

An agency may not conduct or
sponsor, and a person is not required to
respond to, a collection of information
unless it displays a currently valid
control number.

Written comments regarding the
above information should be directed to
the following persons: (i) Deck Officer
for the Securities and Exchange
Commission, Office of Information and
Regulatory Affairs, Office of
Management and Budget, Room 10102,
New Executive Office Building,
Washington, D.C. 20503; and (ii)
Michael E. Bartell, Associate Executive
Director, Office of Information
Technology, Securities and Exchange
Commission, 450 Fifth Street, N.W.,
Washington, D.C. 20549. Comments
must be submitted to OMB within 30
days of this notice.

Dated: September 8, 1999.
Margaret H. McFarland,
Deputy Secretary.
[FR Doc. 99–23990 Filed 9–14–99; 8:45 am]
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September 9, 1999.
Local Financial Corporation

(‘‘Company’’) has filed an application
with the Securities and Exchange
Commission (‘‘Commission’’), pursuant
to Section 12(d) of the Securities
Exchange Act of 1934 (‘‘Act’’) and Rule
12d2–2(d) promulgated thereunder, to
withdraw the security specified above
(‘‘Security’’) from listing and
registration on the American Stock
Exchange LLC (‘‘Amex’’ or ‘‘Exchange’’).

The reasons cited in the application
for withdrawing the Security from
listing and registration on the Amex
include the following:

The Security of the Company has
been listed on the Amex since April 22,
1998. The Company now believes that it
might realize a more diverse ownership
of its Security through the variety of
market makers available on the
NASDAQ National Market (‘‘Nasdaq’’)
than through the auction system of the
Exchange. On January 27, 1999, the
company’s Board of Directors voted to
authorize the filing of applications to
withdraw the Security from listing and
registration on the Exchange and to have
the Security quoted on the Nasdaq.
Shares of the Security subsequently
began trading on the Nasdaq on July 15,
1999.

The Company has complied with the
rules of the Amex by filing with the
Exchange a certified copy of the
resolutions adopted by the Company’s
Board of Directors authorizing the
withdrawal of its Security from listing
on the Amex and by setting forth in
detail to the Exchange the reasons for
the proposed withdrawal, and the facts
in support thereof. In making the
decision to withdraw its Security from
listing on the Amex, the Company
wished to avoid the duplicative costs
associated with registering its Security
for trading in two different markets. The
Amex has informed the Company that it
has no objection to the withdrawal of
the Company’s Security from listing and
registration on the Exchange.

The Company’s application relates
solely to the withdrawal of the Security
from listing and registration on the
Amex and shall have no effect upon the
continued listing on the Amex of the
Company’s 11.0% Senior Notes due
September 8, 2004. By reason of
Sections 12(b) and (g) of the Act and the
rules and regulations of the Commission
thereunder, the Company shall continue
to be obligated to file reports under
Section 13 of the Act with the
Commission.

Any interested person may, on or
before September 30, 1999, submit by
letter to the Secretary of the Securities
and Exchange Commission, 450 Fifth
Street, NW, Washington, DC 20549–
0609, facts bearing upon whether the
application has been made in
accordance with the rules of the
Exchange and what terms, if any, should
be imposed by the Commission for the
protection of investors. The
Commission, based on the information
submitted to it, will issue an order
granting the application after the date
mentioned above, unless the
Commission determines to order a
hearing on the matter.

For the Commission, by the Division of
Market Regulation, pursuant to delegated
authority.
Jonathan G. Katz,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 99–24035 Filed 9–14–99; 8:45 am]
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Transamerica Occidental Life
Insurance Company, et al.

AGENCY: Securities and Exchange
Commission (the ‘‘Commission’’ or
‘‘SEC’’).
ACTION: Notice of application for an
order pursuant to Section 26(b) of the
Investment Company Act of 1940 (the
‘‘1940 Act’’) approving certain
substitutions of securities.

SUMMARY OF APPLICATION: Applicants
request an order to permit a registered
unit investment trust to substitute
securities issued by two portfolios of
Transamerica Variable Insurance Fund,
Inc., a registered open-end investment
company, and two portfolios of EQ
Advisors Trust, a registered open-end
investment company, for securities
issued by four portfolios of The Hudson
River Trust, a registered open-end
investment company, currently held by
the unit investment trust.
APPLICANTS: Transamerica Occidental
Life Insurance Company and Separate
Account VL of Transamerica Occidental
Life Insurance Company (collectively,
the ‘‘Applicants’’).
FILING DATE: The application was filed
on July 29, 1999, and amended and
restated on September 7, 1999.
HEARING OR NOTIFICATION OF HEARING: An
order granting the application will be
issued unless the Commission orders a
hearing. Interested persons may request
a hearing by writing to the Secretary of
the Commission and serving Applicants
with a copy of the request, personally or
by mail. Hearing requests should be
received by the Commission by 5:30
p.m. on September 29, 1999, and should
be accompanied by proof of service on
Applicants in the form of an affidavit or,
for lawyers, a certificate of service.
Hearing requests should state the nature
of the writer’s interest, the reason for the
request, and the issues contested.
Persons who wish to be notified of a
hearing may request notification by
writing to the Secretary of the
Commission.
ADDRESSES: Secretary, Securities and
Exchange Commission, 450 Fifth Street,
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