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DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

National Park Service

Availability of Plan of Operations and
Environmental Assessment;
Continuing Operation of Four Gas
Wells, Saltwater Disposal Well and
Production Facility; Vector Energy
Corporation Padre Island National
Seashore, Kleberg County, TX

Notice is hereby given in accordance
with Section 9.52(b) of Title 36 of the
Code of Federal Regulations that the
National Park Service has received from
Vector Energy Corporation a Plan of
Operations for the continuing operation
of four gas wells, a saltwater disposal
well, and production facility located
within Padre Island National Seashore,
in Kleberg County, Texas.

The Plan of Operations and
Environmental Assessment are available
for public review and comment for a
period of 30 days from the publication
date of this notice in the Office of the
Superintendent, Padre Island National
Seashore, 20301 Park Road 22, Corpus
Christi, Texas. Copies are available from
the Superintendent, Padre Island
National Seashore, Post Office Box
181300, Corpus Christi, Texas 78480–
1300, and will be sent upon request.

If you wish to comment, you may
submit your comments by mailing them
to the post office address provided
above, or, you may hand-deliver
comments to the park at the street
address provided above. Our practice is
to make comments, including names
and home addresses of respondents,
available for public review during
regular business hours. Individual
respondents may request that we
withhold their home address from the
decisionmaking record, which we will
honor to the extent allowable by law.
There also may be circumstances in
which we would withhold from the
decisionmaking record a respondent’s
identity, as allowable by law. If you
wish us to withhold your name and/or
address, you must state this
prominently at the beginning of your
comment. However, we will not
consider anonymous comments. We
will make all submissions from
organizations or businesses, and from
individuals identifying themselves as
representatives or officials of
organizations or businesses, available
for public inspection in their entirety.

Dated: October 8, 1999.
Jock F. Whitworth,
Superintendent, Padre Island National
Seashore.
[FR Doc. 99–27120 Filed 10–15–99; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4310–70–P

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Drug Enforcement Administration

Manufacturer of Controlled
Substances; Notice of Application

Pursuant to § 1301.33(a) of Title 21 of
the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR),
this is notice that on September 1, 1999,
Cambridge Isotope Lab, 50 Frontage
Road, Andover, Massachusetts 01810,
made application by renewal to the
Drug Enforcement Administration
(DEA) for registration as a bulk
manufacturer of the basic classes of
controlled substances listed below:

Drug Schedule

Methaqualone (2565) ................... I
Dimethyltryptamine (7435) ........... I
Amphetamine (1100) .................... II
Methamphetamine (1105) ............ II
Pentobarbital (2270) ..................... II
Secobarbital (2315) ...................... II
Phencyclidine (7471) .................... II
Phenylacetone (8501) .................. II
Cocaine (9041) ............................. II
Codeine (9050) ............................. II
Oxycodone (9143) ........................ II
Hydromorphone (9150) ................ II
Benzoylecgonine (9180) ............... II
Methadone (9250) ........................ II
Dextropropoxyphene, bulk (non-

dosage forms) (9273).
II

Morphine (9300) ........................... II
Fentanyl (9801) ............................ II

The firm plans to manufacture small
quantities of the listed controlled
substances to produce isotope labeled
standards for drug analysis.

Any other such applicant and any
person who is presently registered with
DEA to manufacture such substances
may file comments or objections to the
issuance of the proposed registration.

Any such comments or objections
may be addressed, in quintuplicate, to
the Deputy Assistant Administrator,
Office of Diversion Control, Drug
Enforcement Administration, United
States Department of Justice,
Washington, DC 20537, Attention: DEA
Federal Register Representative (CCR),
and must be filed no later than
December 17, 1999.

Dated: October 8, 1999.

John H. King,
Deputy Assistant Administrator, Office of
Diversion Control, Drug Enforcement
Administration.
[FR Doc. 99–27098 Filed 10–15–99; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 4410–09–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Drug Enforcement Administration

Manufacturer of Controlled
Substances; Notice of Application

Pursuant to § 1301.33(a) of Title 21 of
the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR),
this is notice that on August 12, 1999,
Cedarburg Laboratories, Inc., 870
Bandger Circle, Grafton, Wisconsin
53024, made application by letter to the
Drug Enforcement Administration
(DEA) for registration as a bulk
manufacturer of propiram (9649), a
basic class of controlled substance listed
in Schedule I.

the firm plans will manufacture
propiram in the process of
manufacturing other targeted test
compounds for another firm.

Any other such applicant and any
person who is presently registered with
DEA to manufacture such substance
may file comments or objections to the
issuance of the proposed registration.

Any such comments or objections
may be addressed, in quintuplicate, to
the Deputy Assistant Administrator,
Office of Diversion Control, Drug
Enforcement Administration, United
States Department of Justice,
Washington, DC 20537, Attention: DEA
Federal Register Representative (CCR),
and must be filed no later than
December 17, 1999.

Dated: October 8, 1999.
John H. King,
Deputy Assistant Administrator, Office of
Diversion Control, Drug Enforcement
Administration.
[FR Doc. 99–27099 Filed 10–15–99; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4410–09–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Drug Enforcement Administration

Importer of Controlled Substances;
Notice of Registration

By Notice dated July 6, 1999, and
published in the Federal Register on
August 2, 1999, (64 FR 41969),
Chiragene, Inc., 7 Powder Horn Drive,
Warren, New Jersey 07059, made
application by renewal to the Drug
Enforcement Administration (DEA) to
be registered as an importer of
phenylacetone (8501), a basic class of
controlled substance listed in Schedule
II.

The firm plans to import the
phenylacetone to manufacture
amphetamine.

No comments or objections have been
received. DEA has considered the
factors in Title 21, United States Code,
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