AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

117TH CONGRESS
L H,R. 5285

To amend the CARES Act to extend certain unemployment compensation

provisions, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

SEPTEMBER 17, 2021

Ms. Ocasto-CorTEZ (for herself, Ms. Busi, Mr. BowMAN, Ms. PRESSLEY,

Mr. GARrcia of Illinois, Ms. JACKSON LEE, Ms. LEE of California, Ms.
JAcoBs of California, Ms. Traig, Ms. NORTON, Mr. BLUMENAUER, Ms.
OMAR, Mr. JONES, Mr. EspaiLrAT, Ms. Bass, Mr. SAN NicoLnas, Mr.
CARSON, Mr. NADLER, Ms. MENG, Ms. ESCOBAR, Ms. JAvyAraL, Mr.
RasxiN, Mr. PayNE, Mrs. WaTsoN CoOLEMAN, Mr. Ruso, and Ms.
SCHAKOWSKY) introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Ways and Means, and in addition to the Committees on
Transportation and Infrastructure, and the Budget, for a period to be
subsequently determined by the Speaker, in each case for consideration
of such provisions as fall within the jurisdiction of the committee con-
cerned

A BILL

To amend the CARES Act to extend certain unemployment

2
3
4

compensation provisions, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Extend Unemployment

Assistance Act of 20217,



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

e e T e S S e e S e S = =
o N O »nm kA W NN = O

19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

2
SEC. 2. EXTENSION OF PANDEMIC UNEMPLOYMENT ASSIST-

ANCE.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2102(¢) of the CARES
Act (15 U.S.C. 9021(¢)) 1s amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)(A)(ii), by striking “Sep-
tember 6, 2021”7 and inserting “February 1, 20227,
and

(2) by redesignating paragraphs (5) and (6) as
paragraphs (4) and (5), respectively.
(b) INCREASE IN NUMBER OF WEEKS.—Section

2102(¢)(2) of such Act (15 U.S.C. 9021(¢)(2)) 1s amend-

ed—
(1) by striking “79 weeks” and inserting “100
weeks”’; and
(2) by striking “79-week period” and inserting
“100-week period”.
(¢) HoLD HARMLESS FOR PROPER ADMINISTRA-
TION.—In the case of an individual who is eligible to re-

ceive pandemic unemployment assistance under section
2102 of the CARES Act (15 U.S.C. 9021) as of the most
recent week ending on or before September 6 and on the
date of enactment of this Act becomes eligible for pan-
demic emergency unemployment compensation under sec-
tion 2107 of the CARES Act (15 U.S.C. 9025) by reason
of the amendments made by this Act, any payment of pan-
demic unemployment assistance under such section 2102

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

Q
(3}

made after the date of enactment of this Act to such indi-
vidual during an appropriate period of time, as determined
by the Secretary of Labor, that should have been made
under such section 2107 shall not be considered to be an
overpayment of assistance under such section 2102, except
that an individual may not receive payment for assistance
under section 2102 and a payment for assistance under
section 2107 for the same week of unemployment.
SEC. 3. EXTENSION OF EMERGENCY UNEMPLOYMENT RE-
LIEF FOR GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES AND
NONPROFIT ORGANIZATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 903(1)(1)(D) of the Social
Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1103(i)(1)(D)) is amended by
striking “‘September 6, 2021 and inserting “February 1,
20227,

(b) INCREASE IN REIMBURSEMENT RATE.—Section
903(1)(1)(B) of such Act (42 U.S.C. 110331)(1)(B)) is
amended by striking ‘“September 6, 2021”7 and inserting
“Kebruary 1, 20227,

SEC. 4. EXTENSION OF FEDERAL PANDEMIC UNEMPLOY-

MENT COMPENSATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2104(e)(2) of the CARES
Act (15 U.S.C. 9023(e)(2)) 1s amended by striking ““Sep-

tember 6, 2021”7 and inserting “February 1, 2022,

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B e T e e T e T e e
b A W D= OO NN N N R, WD = O

4

(b) AMOUNT.—Section 2104(b)(3)(A)(i1) of such Act
(15 U.S.C. 9023(b)(3)(A)(1i1)) is amended by striking
“September 6, 2021”7 and inserting “February 1, 20227,
SEC. 5. EXTENSION OF FULL FEDERAL FUNDING OF THE

FIRST WEEK OF COMPENSABLE REGULAR
UNEMPLOYMENT FOR STATES WITH NO WAIT-
ING WEEK.

Section 2105(e)(2) of the CARES Act (15 U.S.C.
9024(e)(2)) is amended by striking “September 6, 2021”
and inserting “‘February 1, 20227,

SEC. 6. EXTENSION OF EMERGENCY STATE STAFFING
FLEXIBILITY.

Section 9015 of the American Rescue Plan Act of
2021 is amended by striking “September 6, 2021”7 and
inserting “‘February 1, 2022,

SEC. 7. EXTENSION OF PANDEMIC EMERGENCY UNEMPLOY-
MENT COMPENSATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2107(g)(2) of the CARES
Act (15 U.S.C. 9025(2)(2)) is amended by striking “Sep-
tember 6, 2021 and inserting “February 1, 20227,

(b) INCREASE IN NUMBER OF WEEKS.—Section

2107(b)(2) of such Act (15 U.S.C. 9025(b)(2)) is amend-
ed by striking “53”" and inserting “74”.
(¢) COORDINATION OF PANDEMIC EMERGENCY UN-

EMPLOYMENT COMPENSATION WITH KEXTENDED COM-

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
o= OO 0 9N AW = O

5
PENSATION.—Section 2107(a)(5)(B) of such Act (15
U.S.C. 9025(a)(5)(B)) is amended by inserting “or for the
week that includes the date of enactment of the Extend
Unemployment Assistance Act of 2021 (without regard to
the amendments made by subsections (a) and (b) of sec-
tion 7 of such Act)” after “‘such Act)”.

(d) SPECIAL RULE FOR EXTENDED COMPENSA-
TION.—Section 2107(a)(8) of such Act (15 U.S.C.
9025(a)(8)) is amended by striking “September 6, 2021”
and inserting “‘February 1, 20227,

SEC. 8. EXTENSION OF TEMPORARY FINANCING OF SHORT-
TIME COMPENSATION PAYMENTS IN STATES
WITH PROGRAMS IN LAW.

Section 2108(b)(2) of the CARES Act (15 U.S.C.
9026(b)(2)) is amended by striking “September 6, 2021”
and inserting “‘February 1, 20227,

SEC. 9. EXTENSION OF TEMPORARY FINANCING OF SHORT-
TIME COMPENSATION AGREEMENTS FOR
STATES WITHOUT PROGRAMS IN LAW.

Section 2109(d)(2) of the CARES Act (15 U.S.C.

9027(d)(2)) is amended by striking “September 6, 2021”

and inserting “‘February 1, 20227,

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ T NG T N T NG I NG R N B e e T e e T e e e T
LN A W D= O O NN N N Bl W DY = O

6
SEC. 10. EXTENSION OF TEMPORARY ASSISTANCE FOR

STATES WITH ADVANCES.

Section 1202(b)(10)(A) of the Social Security Aect
(42 U.S.C. 1322(b)(10)(A)) 1s amended by striking ““Sep-
tember 6, 2021”7 and inserting “February 1, 2022,

SEC. 11. EXTENSION OF FULL FEDERAL FUNDING OF EX-
TENDED UNEMPLOYMENT COMPENSATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 4105 of the Families
First Coronavirus Response Act (26 U.S.C. 3304 note)
is amended by striking “September 6, 2021”" and inserting
“KFebruary 1, 20227,

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
subsection (a) shall apply as if included in the enactment
of the Families First Coronavirus Response Act (Public
Law 116-127).

SEC. 12. ADDITIONAL ENHANCED BENEFITS UNDER THE
RAILROAD UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE ACT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2(a)(5)(A) of the Railroad
Unemployment Insurance Act (45 U.S.C. 352(a)(5)(A)) is
amended—

(1) in the first sentence, by striking ‘“Sep-

tember 6, 2021”7 and inserting “‘February 1, 2022,

and

(2) in the fourth sentence, by striking “Sep-

tember 6, 2021” and inserting “‘February 1, 2022”.

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
N A W D = O O NN NN R, WD = O

7

(b) CLARIFICATION ON AvuTHority To Usk

FUNDS.

Funds appropriated under subparagraph (B) of
section 2(a)(5) of the Railroad Unemployment Insurance
Act (45 U.S.C. 352(a)(b)) shall be available to cover the
cost of recovery benefits provided under such section
2(a)(5) by reason of the amendments made by subsection
(a) as well as to cover the cost of such benefits provided
under such section 2(a)(5) as in effect on the day before
the date of enactment of this Act.
SEC. 13. EXTENDED UNEMPLOYMENT BENEFITS UNDER
THE RAILROAD UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE
ACT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2(¢)(2)(D) of the Rail-
road Unemployment Insurance Act (45 U.S.C.
352(¢)(2)(D)) 1s amended—

(1) in clause (1)—
(A) in subclause (I), by striking “330
days” and inserting “435 days’’; and
(B) in subclause (II)—

(1) by striking “33 consecutive 14-day
periods” and inserting ‘44 consecutive 14-
day periods”; and

(i1) by striking “20 consecutive 14-day
periods” and inserting “31 consecutive 14-

day periods’’;

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[ w—
e

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

8
(2) in clause (11)—

(A) by striking “265 days of unemploy-
ment” and inserting “370 days of unemploy-
ment’’;

(B) by striking “27 consecutive 14-day pe-
riods” and inserting “37 consecutive 14-day pe-
riods”; and

(C) by striking “20 consecutive 14-day pe-
riods” and inserting “31 consecutive 14-day pe-
riods”; and
(3) in clause (i), by striking “September 6,

20217 and inserting “‘February 1, 20227,
(b) CLARIFICATION ON AvuTHority To Usk

FUNDSs.

Funds appropriated under the first, second, or
third sentence of clause (v) of section 2(¢)(2)(D) of the
Railroad Unemployment Insurance Act shall be available
to cover the cost of additional extended unemployment
benefits provided under such section 2(¢)(2)(D) by reason
of the amendments made by subsection (a) as well as to
cover the cost of such benefits provided under such section
2(¢)(2)(D) as in effect on the day before the date of enact-

ment of this Act.

*HR 5285 IH



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR N© T N T NG T NG I NG R NS R S e T e T e T e T e T W
A N A WD = O 0O 0NN B W NN~ O

9
SEC. 14. EXTENSION OF WAIVER OF THE 7-DAY WAITING PE-

RIOD FOR BENEFITS UNDER THE RAILROAD
UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE ACT.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2112(a) of the CARES
Act (15 U.S.C. 9030(a)) is amended by striking “Sep-
tember 6, 2021”7 and inserting “‘February 1, 2022,
(b) CLARIFICATION ON AvuTHORITY To USE

FuNDs.

Funds appropriated under section 2112(¢) of
the CARES Act (15 U.S.C. 9030(c¢)) shall be available to
cover the cost of additional benefits payable due to section
2112(a) of such Act by reason of the amendments made
by subsection (a) as well as to cover the cost of such bene-
fits payable due to such section 2112(a) as in effect on
the day before the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 15. RAILROAD RETIREMENT BOARD FUNDING.

In addition to amounts otherwise made available,
there are appropriated for fiscal year 2021, out of any
money 1in the Treasury not otherwise appropriated,
$2,000,000, to remain available until expended, for the
Railroad Retirement Board, for additional hiring and
overtime bonuses as needed to administer the Railroad
Unemployment Insurance Act.

SEC. 16. BUDGETARY EFFECTS.

Each Federal payment made to a State as a result
of the amendments made by this Act, and any additional
benefits paid as a result of such amendments, shall be ex-

*HR 5285 IH



[E—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10

empt from any sequestration order issued under the Bal-
anced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.
SEC. 17. EFFECTIVE DATE.

Except where otherwise provided, the amendments
made by this Act shall apply as if included in the enact-
ment of the CARES Act (Public Law 116-136), except
that no amount shall be payable by virtue of such amend-
ments with respect to any week of unemployment ending

on or before September 6, 2021.
O

*HR 5285 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-12-29T14:27:10-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




