AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

117TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 3 1 4

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to provide tax rate parity
among all tobacco products, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

APRIL 22, 2021
Mr. DurBIN (for himself, Mr. WYDEN, Mrs. MURRAY, Mr. Browx, Mr.
REED, Mr. MERKLEY, Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mr. MARKEY, and Ms.
HiroNO) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to provide
tax rate parity among all tobacco products, and for other
purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Tobacco Tax Equity

b kW N

Act of 20217,



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T NS T NG I NG R N S N e e T e e T e e T e
LN A W D= O O NN NNl WNDY = O

2
SEC. 2. INCREASING EXCISE TAXES ON CIGARETTES AND

ESTABLISHING EXCISE TAX EQUITY AMONG
ALL TOBACCO PRODUCT TAX RATES.

(a) TAX PARITY FOR ROLL-YOUR-OWN TOBACCO.—
Section 5701(g) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended by striking “$24.78” and inserting “$49.56".

(b) TaAX ParIty ror PIiPE ToOBACCO.—Section
5701(f) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended
by striking “$2.8311 cents” and inserting “$49.56".

(¢) TAX PARITY FOR SMOKELESS TOBACCO.—

(1) Section 5701(e) of the Internal Revenue

Code of 1986 is amended—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking “$1.51”
and inserting “$26.84"";

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “50.33
cents” and inserting “$10.74”’; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:
“(3) SMOKELESS TOBACCO SOLD IN DISCRETE

SINGLE-USE UNITS.

On discrete single-use units,
$100.66 per thousand.”.
(2) Section 5702(m) of such Code is amend-
ed—
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking “‘or chew-

4

ing tobacco” and inserting ‘‘, chewing tobacco,

or discrete single-use unit’’;

*S 1314 IS



O© 00 3 O WD B W N e

N N T e T
whnm A W D = O

16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

3
(B) in paragraphs (2) and (3), by inserting
“that is not a discrete single-use unit” before
the period in each such paragraph; and
(C) by adding at the end the following:
“(4) DISCRETE SINGLE-USE UNIT.—The term
‘discrete single-use unit’ means any product con-
taining, made from, or derived from tobacco or nico-
tine that—
“(A) 1s not intended to be smoked; and
“(B) is in the form of a lozenge, tablet,
pill, pouch, dissolvable strip, or other discrete
single-use or single-dose unit.”.
(d) TAX PARITY FOR SMALL CIGARS.—Paragraph
(1) of section 5701(a) of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986 is amended by striking “$50.33” and inserting

“$100.66".

(e) TAX PARITY FOR LARGE CIGARS.

(1) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (2) of section
5701(a) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended by striking “52.75 percent” and all that
follows through the period and inserting the fol-
lowing: “$49.56 per pound and a proportionate tax
at the like rate on all fractional parts of a pound but

not less than 10.066 cents per cigar.”.

*S 1314 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG TN N TR NG I NG R NG R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N N N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO I e

4

(2) GUIDANCE.—The Secretary of the Treas-
ury, or the Secretary’s delegate, may issue guidance
regarding the appropriate method for determining
the weight of large cigars for purposes of calculating
the applicable tax under section 5701(a)(2) of the

Internal Revenue Code of 1986.
(f) TAxX PARITY FOR ROLL-YOUR-OWN TOBACCO
AND CERTAIN PROCESSED TOBACCO.—Subsection (0) of
section 5702 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is

amended by inserting

, and includes processed tobacco
that is removed for delivery or delivered to a person other
than a person with a permit provided under section 5713,
but does not include removals of processed tobacco for ex-
portation’ after ‘“‘wrappers thereot”.
() CLARIFYING TAX RATE FOR OTHER TOBACCO
ProbpucTs.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 5701 of the Internal

Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding at the

end the following new subsection:

“(1) OTaHeERr ToBAacCcO PRODUCTS.—Any product not
otherwise described under this section that has been deter-
mined to be a tobacco product by the Food and Drug Ad-
ministration through its authorities under the Family

Smoking Prevention and Tobacco Control Act shall be

taxed at a level of tax equivalent to the tax rate for ciga-

*S 1314 IS



5
rettes on an estimated per use basis as determined by the

Secretary.”.

(2) ESTABLISHING PER USE BASIS.

For pur-
poses of section 5701(1) of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986, not later than 12 months after the
later of the date of the enactment of this Act or the
date that a product has been determined to be a to-
bacco product by the Food and Drug Administra-
tion, the Secretary of the Treasury (or the Secretary
of the Treasury’s delegate) shall issue final regula-
tions establishing the level of tax for such product
that 1s equivalent to the tax rate for cigarettes on
an estimated per use basis.

(h) CLARIFYING DEFINITION OF ToBACCO PROD-

UCTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (¢) of section
5702 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended to read as follows:

“(¢) ToBacco PropUCTS.—The term ‘tobacco prod-

ucts’ means—

“(1) cigars, cigarettes, smokeless tobacco, pipe
tobacco, and roll-your-own tobacco, and
“(2) any other product subject to tax pursuant

to section H701(1).”.

*S 1314 IS



6

1 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Subsection
2 (d) of section 5702 of such Code is amended by
3 striking ““cigars, cigarettes, smokeless tobacco, pipe
4 tobacco, or roll-your-own tobacco’ each place it ap-
5 pears and inserting ‘“‘tobacco products’.

6 (1) INCREASING TAX ON CIGARETTES.—

7 (1) SMALL CIGARETTES.—Section 5701(b)(1)
8 of such Code is amended by striking “$50.33” and
9 inserting “$100.66"".

10 (2) LARGE CIGARETTES.—Section 5701(b)(2)
11 of such Code is amended by striking “$105.69” and
12 inserting “$211.38"",

13 (j) TAX RATES ADJUSTED FOR INFLATION.—Section
14 5701 of such Code, as amended by subsection (g), is

15 amended by adding at the end the following new sub-

16 section:

17 “(J) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—

18 “(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any calendar
19 year beginning after 2021, the dollar amounts pro-
20 vided under this chapter shall each be increased by
21 an amount equal to—

22 “(A) such dollar amount, multiplied by

23 “(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
24 mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar
25 yvear, determined by substituting ‘calendar year

*S 1314 IS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS R N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

7

2020’ for ‘calendar year 2016’ in subparagraph

(A)(11) thereof.

“(2) ROUNDING.—If any amount as adjusted
under paragraph (1) is not a multiple of $0.01, such
amount shall be rounded to the next highest multiple
of $0.01.”.

(k) FLOOR STOCKS TAXES.—

(1) IMPOSITION OF TAX.—On tobacco products
manufactured in or imported into the United States
which are removed before any tax increase date and
held on such date for sale by any person, there is
hereby imposed a tax in an amount equal to the ex-
cess of—

(A) the tax which would be imposed under
section 5701 of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986 on the article if the article had been re-
moved on such date, over

(B) the prior tax (if any) imposed under
section 5701 of such Code on such article.

(2) CREDIT AGAINST TAX.—Each person shall
be allowed as a credit against the taxes imposed by
paragraph (1) an amount equal to $500. Such credit
shall not exceed the amount of taxes imposed by
paragraph (1) on such date for which such person

1s hable.

*S 1314 IS



8

(3) LIABILITY FOR TAX AND METHOD OF PAY-

MENT.—

(A) LIABILITY FOR TAX.—A person hold-
ing tobacco products on any tax increase date
to which any tax imposed by paragraph (1) ap-
plies shall be liable for such tax.

(B) METHHOD OF PAYMENT.—The tax im-
posed by paragraph (1) shall be paid in such
manner as the Secretary shall prescribe by reg-
ulations.

(C) TIME FOR PAYMENT.—The tax im-
posed by paragraph (1) shall be paid on or be-
fore the date that is 120 days after the effective

date of the tax rate increase.

(4) ARTICLES IN FOREIGN TRADE ZONES.

Notwithstanding the Act of June 18, 1934 (com-
monly known as the Foreign Trade Zone Act, 48
Stat. 998, 19 U.S.C. 81a et seq.), or any other pro-
vision of law, any article which is located in a for-
eign trade zone on any tax increase date shall be

subject to the tax imposed by paragraph (1) if—

(A) internal revenue taxes have been deter-
mined, or customs duties liquidated, with re-

spect to such article before such date pursuant

*S 1314 IS



O o0 N N kA W =

| \O I \© R O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

9

to a request made under the first proviso of
section 3(a) of such Act, or

(B) such article is held on such date under
the supervision of an officer of the United
States Customs and Border Protection of the
Department of Homeland Security pursuant to
the second proviso of such section 3(a).

(5) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this sub-

section—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Any term used in this
subsection which is also used in section 5702 of
such Code shall have the same meaning as such
term has in such section.

(B) TAX INCREASE DATE.—The term ‘‘tax
increase date” means the effective date of any
increase in any tobacco product excise tax rate
pursuant to the amendments made by this sec-
tion (other than subsection (j) thereof).

(C) SECRETARY.—The term “‘Secretary’
means the Secretary of the Treasury or the
Secretary’s delegate.

(6) CONTROLLED GROUPS.—Rules similar to

the rules of section 5061(e)(3) of such Code shall

apply for purposes of this subsection.

*S 1314 IS



O o0 N N kA W =

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O TR NO I e

10

(7) OTHER LAWS APPLICABLE.—AIl provisions
of law, including penalties, applicable with respect to
the taxes imposed by section 5701 of such Code
shall, insofar as applicable and not inconsistent with
the provisions of this subsection, apply to the floor
stocks taxes imposed by paragraph (1), to the same
extent as if such taxes were imposed by such section
5701. The Secretary may treat any person who bore
the ultimate burden of the tax imposed by para-
oraph (1) as the person to whom a credit or refund
under such provisions may be allowed or made.

(I) EFFECTIVE DATES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in para-

oraphs (2) through (4), the amendments made by
this section shall apply to articles removed (as de-
fined i section 5702(j) of the Internal Revenue
Jode of 1986) after the last day of the month which
includes the date of the enactment of this Act.

(2) DISCRETE SINGLE-USE UNITS AND PROC-
ESSED TOBACCO.—The amendments made by sub-
sections (¢)(1)(C), (e¢)(2), and (f) shall apply to arti-
cles removed (as defined in section 5702(j) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986) after the date that
1s 6 months after the date of the enactment of this

Act.

*S 1314 IS



O© o0 2 O WD A W N e

[a—
S

11

(3) LARGE CIGARS.—The amendments made by
subsection (e) shall apply to articles removed after
December 31, 2021.

(4) OTHER TOBACCO PRODUCTS.—The amend-
ments made by subsection (g)(1) shall apply to prod-
ucts removed after the last day of the month which
includes the date that the Secretary of the Treasury
(or the Secretary of the Treasury’s delegate) issues
final regulations establishing the level of tax for

such product.

*S 1314 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-12-30T07:45:58-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




