AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

117TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 977

To amend title XIX of the Social Security Act to provide Medicaid coverage
for all pregnant and postpartum women, to provide coverage under the
Medicaid program for services provided by doulas, midwives, and lacta-
tion consultants, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JUNE 8, 2021
Mr. CASEY introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend title XIX of the Social Security Act to provide
Medicaid coverage for all pregnant and postpartum
women, to provide coverage under the Medicaid program
for services provided by doulas, midwives, and lactation
consultants, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Improving Coverage

(O Y N )

and Care for Mothers Act”.



2

1 SEC. 2. EXTENDING MEDICAID ELIGIBILITY TO ALL PREG-

NolNe R e Y, B~ L OV R \O)

[\ TR \© R N R \O T (O B e e e e e e T e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

NANT WOMEN.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1905(n)(1) of the Social

Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1396d(n)(1)) is amended to read

as follows:

“(1) a woman who is pregnant and through the

end of the month in which the 365-day period (be-

einning on the last day of her pregnancy) ends;

and’’.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.

Title XIX of the

Social Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1396 et seq.) is amended—

*S 1977 IS

(1) in section 1902—

(A) in subsection (a)(10)(C)—
(1) in clause (ii), by striking “must

2

make available medical assistance—"" and

all that follows through “‘individual de-

)

seribed in subparagraph (A);” and insert-
ing “‘must make available medical assist-
ance to individuals under the age of 18
who (but for income and resources) would
be eligible for medical assistance as an in-
dividual ~ deseribed  in  subparagraph

(A)(1);”; and

(i1) in clause (iii)—



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e T T W
A W N = O VWV o0 N O B BN~ WD = ©

3
(I) by striking “must include (I)
with respect to”’ and inserting “must
include, with respect to”’; and
(IT) by striking *, and (II)” and
all that follows through “‘delivery serv-
ices’’;
(B) in subsection (e), by striking para-

oraph (6);

(C) in subsection (1)(1)(A), by inserting

“before January 1, 2022, before ‘“women dur-

ing pregnancy’’; and

(D) in subsection (i1)(1)(A), by inserting

“that was in effect as of January 1, 20227

after “‘pregnant women’’;

(2) in section 1920(b)(1)(A), by striking “‘that
the family income” and all that follows through “‘in-
come level of eligibility” and inserting ‘“‘that the
woman 1is eligible for medical assistance’’; and

(3) In section 1937(a)(2)(B), by amending
clause (1) to read as follows:

“(1) QUALIFIED PREGNANT WOMEN.—
The individual is a qualified pregnant
woman (as defined n section

1905(n)(1)).”.

*S 1977 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N T NG I NG I N B e e T e e T e e e
LN A W D= O O NN N N Bl WD = O

4
SEC. 3. EXTENDING CONTINUOUS MEDICAID AND CHIP

COVERAGE FOR PREGNANT AND POSTPAR-
TUM WOMEN.
(a) EXTENDING CONTINUOUS MEDICAID AND CHIP
COVERAGE FOR PREGNANT AND POSTPARTUM WOMEN.—
(1) MeDICAID.—Title XIX of the Social Secu-
rity Act (42 U.S.C. 1396 et seq.) is amended—
(A) in section 1902(e)—

(i) in paragraph (5), by striking “60-
day period” and inserting “365-day pe-
riod”’; and

(i1) in paragraph (16), by striking “At
the option of the State” and inserting ‘‘Be-
fore January 1, 2022, at the option of the
State’’;

(B) in section 1902(1)(1)(A), by striking
“60-day period” and inserting “365-day pe-
riod”’;

(C) in section 1903(v)(4)(A)(1), by striking
“60-day period” and inserting “365-day pe-
riod”’; and

(D) in section 1905(a), in the 4th sentence
in the matter following paragraph (30)—

(1) by striking “60-day period” and

inserting “365-day period”’; and

*S 1977 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

e T = O =
W NN = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

5}

(i1) by striking ‘“‘subdivision (B) fol-
lowing paragraph (30)” and inserting
“subdivision  (B) following paragraph
(32)”.

(2) CHIP.—Section 2112 of the Social Security
Act (42 U.S.C. 139711) is amended by striking ““60-
day period” each place it appears and inserting
“365-day period”.

(3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
1938(b)(2)(C) of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C.
1396u—-8(b)(2)(C)) is amended by striking ‘“‘previous
60 days” and inserting “previous 365 days’.

(b) REQUIRING FULL BENEFITS FOR PREGNANT
AND POSTPARTUM WOMEN.—

(1) MEDICAID.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (5) of sec-

tion 1902(e) of the Social Security Act (24

U.S.C. 1396a(e)) 1s amended to read as follows:

“(5) Any woman who is eligible for medical as-
sistance under the State plan or a waiver of such
plan and who is, or who while so eligible becomes,
pregnant, shall continue to be eligible under the plan
or waiver for medical assistance through the end of
the month in which the 365-day period (beginning

on the last day of her pregnancy) ends, regardless

*S 1977 IS



6

| of the basis for the woman’s eligibility for medical
2 assistance, including if the woman’s eligibility for
3 medical assistance 1s on the basis of being preg-
4 nant.”.

5 (B) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
6 1902(a)(10) of the Social Security Act (42
7 U.S.C. 1396a(a)(10)) is amended in the matter
8 following subparagraph (G) by striking “(VII)
9 the medical assistance” and all that follows
10 through ‘“‘complicate pregnancy,”.

11 (2) CHIP.—Section 2107(e)(1)(J) of the Social
12 Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1397ge(e)(1)(J)) is amend-
13 ed

14 (A) by inserting *, before January 1,
15 2022, before “(16) of section 1902(e)”’; and
16 (B) by striking “(relating to” and all that
17 follows through the period and inserting ““(re-
18 lating to the provision of medical assistance to
19 pregnant women during pregnancy and the
20 365-day postpartum period under title XIX).”
21 SEC. 4. MEDICAID COVERAGE OF SERVICES PROVIDED BY
22 DOULAS, MIDWIVES, AND LACTATION CON-
23 SULTANTS.

24 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1905 of the Social Secu-

25 rity Act (42 U.S.C. 1396d) is amended—

*S 1977 IS



7

1 (1) 1 subsection (a)—

2 (A) in paragraph (30), by striking “and”

3 at the end;

4 (B) by redesignating paragraph (31) as

5 paragraph (32); and

6 (C) by inserting after paragraph (30) the

7 following new paragraph:

8 “(31) services, including—

9 “(A) prenatal, delivery, postpartum, and
10 lactation consulting services, provided by
11 doulas, midwives, and lactation consultants (as
12 those terms are defined in subsection (jj)) to
13 the extent authorized under State law; and
14 “(B) services included in the components
15 of postpartum care identified by the American
16 College of Obstetricians and Gynecologists in
17 Committee Opinion Number 736 published in
18 May of 2018 (or any successor opinion or publi-
19 cation); and”; and
20 (2) by adding at the end the following new sub-
21 section:

22 “(33) Douras AND MIDWIVES DEFINED.—For pur-

23 poses of subsection (a)(31):

24 “(1) Douras DEFINED.—The term ‘doula’
25 means an idividual who—

*S 1977 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N T NG R NG R NS R N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO I e

8

“(A) is certified by an organization, which
has been established for not less than 5 years
and which requires the completion of continuing
education to maintain such certification, to pro-
vide non-medical advice, information, emotional
support, and physical comfort to an individual
during such individual’s pregnancy, childbirth,
and postpartum period; and

“(B) maintains such certification by com-
pleting such required continuing education.

“(2) MIDWIVES DEFINED.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘midwife’
means a certified midwife, certified professional
midwife, and Tribal-recognized midwife.

“(B) CERTIFIED MIDWIFE.—For purposes
of subparagraph (A), the term ‘certified mid-
wife’ means an individual who is certified by the
American Midwifery Certification Board to
practice midwifery.

“(C) CERTIFIED PROFESSIONAL  MID-
WIFE.—For purposes of subparagraph (A), the
term ‘certified professional midwife’ means an
individual who—

“(1) is certified by the North Amer-

ican Registry of Midwives to practice mid-

*S 1977 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

24
25

9

wifery for normal, low-risk pregnancies and

childbirths;

“(11) completes—

“(I) a midwifery education pro-
oram accredited by the Midwifery
Education and Accreditation Council
or any other entity recognized by the
Department of Education; or

“(II) the requirements to obtain
a Midwifery Bridge Certificate from
the North American Registry of Mid-
wives; and
“(111) maintains the certification de-

scribed in clause (1) by completing any re-

quired continuing education for such cer-
tification.

“(D) TRIBAL-RECOGNIZED MIDWIFE.—For
purposes of subparagraph (A), the term ‘Tribal-
recognized midwife’ means an individual who is
recognized by an Indian tribe (as defined in
section 4 of the Indian IHealth Care Improve-
ment Act) to practice midwifery for such tribe.
“(3) LACTATION CONSULTANT DEFINED.—The

term ‘lactation consultant’” means an individual who

1s a specialist who—

*S 1977 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ 2N \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

10

“(A) 1s trained to—

“(1) focus on the needs and concerns
of a breastfeeding mother and baby; and

“(i1) prevent, recognize, and solve
breastfeeding difficulties;

“(B) is certified by an organization, which
has been established for not less than 5 years
and which requires the completion of continuing
education to maintain such certification, to pro-
vide lactation consulting services; and

“(C) maintains such certification by com-
pleting such required continuing education.”.

(b) REQUIRING MANDATORY COVERAGE UNDER
STATE PLAN.—Section 1902(a)(10)(A) of the Social Se-
curity Act (42 U.S.C. 1396a(a)(10)(A)) is amended, in the
matter preceding clause (i), by striking “and (30)” and
inserting “(30), and (31)".

SEC. 5. INCREASED FMAP FOR ADDITIONAL EXPENDI-
TURES.

Section 1905 of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C.

1396d), as amended by section 4, is further amended—
(1) in subsection (b), by striking “and (ii)”” and
inserting ““(ii), and (kk)”’; and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

*S 1977 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\© TN O T N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N U N N = = N Re < BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO R e

11

“(kk) INCREASED FMAP FOR ADDITIONAL EXPEND-
ITURES FOR MEDICAL ASSISTANCE TO PREGNANT AND
PosTPARTUM WOMEN.—For calendar quarters beginning
on or after January 1, 2022, notwithstanding subsection
(b), the Federal medical assistance percentage for a State,
with respect to the additional amounts expended by such
State for medical assistance under the State plan under
this title or a waiver of such plan that are attributable
to requirements imposed by the amendments made by the
Improving Coverage and Care for Mothers Act (as deter-
mined by the Secretary), shall be equal to 100 percent.”.
SEC. 6. EFFECTIVE DATE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subject to subsection (b), the
amendments made by this Act shall apply with respect to
medical assistance furnished on or after January 1, 2022.

(b) EXCEPTION FOR STATE LEGISLATION.—In the
case of a State plan under title XIX of the Social Security
Act (42 U.S.C. 1396 et seq.) that the Secretary of Health
and Human Services determines requires State legislation
in order for the respective plan to meet any requirement
imposed by amendments made by this section, the respec-
tive plan shall not be regarded as failing to comply with
the requirements of such title solely on the basis of its
failure to meet such an additional requirement before the

first day of the first calendar quarter beginning after the

*S 1977 IS



AN W B~ W

12

close of the first regular session of the State legislature
that begins after the date of the enactment of this Act.
For purposes of the previous sentence, in the case of a
State that has a 2-year legislative session, each year of
the session shall be considered to be a separate regular
session of the State legislature.

O

*S 1977 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-12-29T20:38:06-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




