AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

117TH CONGRESS
L S, 3535

To amend the Low-Income Home Energy Assistance Act of 1981 to increase
the availability of heating and cooling assistance, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 31, 2022
Mr. MArRkEY (for himself, Mrs. GILLIBRAND, Ms. WARREN, Mr.
BLUMENTHAL, Mr. BOOKER, and Mr. SANDERS) introduced the following
bill; which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Health, Edu-
cation, Liabor, and Pensions

A BILL

To amend the Low-Income Home Energy Assistance Act
of 1981 to increase the availability of heating and cooling

assistance, and for other purposes.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Heating and Cooling
Relief Act”.

SEC. 2. FINDINGS.

Congress finds that:

(1) Energy remains unaffordable for low-income

O o0 9 N N B W

households. Nationally, low-income households spend



S O 0 N N B W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D = O 0O 0NN N R WNY e

2

a larger portion of their income on home energy
costs than other households. The average low-income
household’s energy burden is 3 times that of other
households. The report for the Household Pulse Sur-
vey of the Bureau of the Census, issued on Decem-
ber 22, 2021, noted that, for families with incomes
of less than $35,000 a year, about 51 percent said
that they reduced or went without basic household
necessities, such as medicine or food, in order to pay
an energy bill, for at least one month in the last
year.

(2) The Low-Income Housing Energy Assist-
ance Program was authorized by Congress to reduce
home energy burdens with heating and cooling as-
sistance. In 2019, only 16 percent of income-eligible
households received a subsidy under the program.

(3) Climate change is fueling increasingly in-
tense winter storms and extreme temperatures.

(4) Heat waves are increasingly common as cli-
mate change accelerates, and now occur more often
in major cities across the United States. The aver-
age heat wave season across 50 cities is approxi-
mately 47 days longer now than it was in the 1960s.
As a result, the Federal Government should provide

further cooling assistance for communities in need.

*S 3535 IS



S O 0 N N B W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D = O 0O 0NN N R WNY e

3

(5) The loss of home energy service due to high
energy burdens is one of the primary reasons for
homelessness, especially for families with children.
In some housing contexts, loss of home energy serv-
ice 1s a grounds for eviction.

(6) The Federal Government should expand and
update the Low-Income Home Energy Assistance
Program, as part of a robust Federal social safety
net, to—

(A) protect families against unaffordable
home energy bills and home energy shutoffs, by
providing sufficient funding and imposing regu-
lations where necessary;

(B) ensure all low- and moderate-income
families have access to affordable home cooling
powered by renewable energy, which will enable
households to adapt to rising temperatures due
to climate change and promote climate resil-
1ency;

(C) enhance outreach—

(i) by including nontraditional part-
ners, including home energy suppliers,
local educational agencies, and entities car-
rying out other programs for low-income

people, to assist with signups; and

*S 3535 IS



4
(i1) by adding stronger provisions for
presumed eligibility and waiving docu-
mentation requirements for eligibility; and

(D) further Federal efforts to weatherize
housing for low- and moderate-income house-
holds, to help families struggling to pay their
home energy bills and to meet national clean
energy goals.

SEC. 3. FUNDING.
Section 2602 of the Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8621) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b)—

(A) by striking “section 2607A)” and in-
serting  “‘section 2604(f), 2607A, 26078, or
2607C)"; and

(B) by striking “$2,000,000,000” and all
that follows and inserting “$400,000,000,000
for the period of fiscal years 2022 through
2031.7;

(2) in subsection (e), by inserting ‘, or arising,
for purposes of section 2604(e)(2), from a major
disaster or emergency, as defined 1In section
2604(e)(2)(A)” before the period at the end; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R S R N e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = ©

5}

“(f) There is authorized to be appropriated to carry
out section 2604(f), $1,000,000,000 for each of fiscal
yvears 2022 through 2031.

“(g) There is authorized to be appropriated to carry
out section 2607C, including making grants under that
section, $1,000,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2022
through 2031.”.

SEC. 4. DEFINITIONS.

Section 2603 of the Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8622) is amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (4) through

(6), (7) through (10), and (11), as paragraphs (5)

through (7), (9) through (12), and (14), respec-

tively;
(2) by inserting after paragraph (3) the fol-
lowing:
“(4) The term ‘HEAP coordinator’ means an
employee—
“(A) who administers a program funded
under section 2602(b); and
“(B) whose salary is paid, partly or wholly,
with funds made available under that section.”;
(3) by inserting after paragraph (7), as so re-

designated, the following:

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N e = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~S O T NO S e

SEC.

6

“(8) The term ‘local coordinating agency’
means any local organization or local office that re-
ceives funds under section 2602(b) to perform cus-
tomer intake, or approval of benefits, on behalf of
the State agency.”; and

(4) by inserting after paragraph (12), as so re-
designated, the following:

“(13) The term ‘State agency’ means any State
agency that administers the program funded under
section 2602(b).”.

5. EMERGENCIES.

Section 2604(e) of the Liow-Income Home Energy

Assistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8623(e)) 1s amended—

1) by striking “(e)” and inserting “(e)(1)”;
o - - )
and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(2)(A) In this paragraph:

“(1) The term ‘covered household” means an eli-
eible household in an area where the President, or
the Secretary, as the case may be, has declared a

) o )
major disaster or emergency.

“(ii) The term ‘major disaster or emergency’
means—

“(I) a major disaster or emergency de-

clared under section 401 or 501, respectively, of

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N N R WD = O

7
the Robert T. Stafford Disaster Relief and

Emergency Assistance Act (42 U.S.C. 5170,
5191); or

“(IT) a public health emergency declared
under section 319 of the Public Health Service
Act (42 U.S.C. 247d).

“(B) Upon a declaration described in subparagraph
(A) for an area, the Secretary and the Administrator of
the Federal Emergency Management Agency shall, to the
extent practicable, provide heating or cooling assistance
to covered households in that area.

“(C) In particular, in the event of a major disaster
or other emergency due to a period of extreme heat (as
described in section 2604(f)(1)) or cold in an area, the
Secretary and the Administrator shall, to the extent prac-
ticable, provide cooling or heating assistance to covered
households in that area.”.

SEC. 6. ADDITIONAL COOLING ASSISTANCE FOR HEAT
WAVES.

Section 2604 of the Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8623) is amended by add-
ing at the end the following:

“(f)(1) In this subsection:

*S 3535 IS



S O 0 N N B W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D = O 0O 0NN N R WNY e

8

“(A) The term ‘additional cooling assistance’
means cooling assistance provided under this sub-
section.

“(B) The term ‘extreme heat’” means heat that
exceeds local climatological norms in terms of any 1
or more of the following:

‘(1) Duration.

“(11) Intensity.

“(111) Season length.
“(iv) Frequency.

“(C) The term ‘heat’ means any 1 or more of
the parameters associated with increasing human
temperature, such as air temperature, humidity,
solar exposure, and low wind speed.

“(D) The term ‘heat event’ means an occeur-
rence of extreme heat that may have heat-health im-
plications.

“(E) The term ‘heat-health’ means health ef-
fects to humans from heat, during or outside of heat
events, including from vulnerability and exposure, or
the risk of such effects.

“(2) From funds made availlable under section

2602(f), the Secretary may provide grants to eligible enti-
ties, which shall be States, territories, or Indian Tribes,

for additional cooling assistance for heat events.

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I N0 B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG N N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) TR~ O B NO I e

9

“(3) The Secretary shall determine an allocation plan
for providing eligible entities with funding through the
orants to help eligible households respond to heat events.

“(4) To receive assistance under this subsection, an
eligible entity shall provide assurances to the Secretary
that—

“(A) the eligible entity will not preclude a
household that receives heating assistance under this
title during a calendar year, on the basis of obtain-
ing that assistance, from receiving cooling assistance
under this title during that year; and

“(B) the eligible entity will not require a house-
hold to indicate that a household member has a
medical need for cooling assistance under this title,
to be eligible for that assistance.

“(5) A eligible entity that receives additional cooling
assistance may use the assistance for purposes for which
cooling assistance 1s available under the program funded
under section 2602(b), including for providing energy-effi-
cient air conditioners, and other equipment needed for
home cooling, to eligible households.”.

SEC. 7. ELIGIBLE HOUSEHOLDS.

Section 2605 of the Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8624) is amended—

(1) 1 subsection (b)(2)—

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

*S 3535 IS

10

(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph

44

(A), by inserting *, subject to subsection
(e)(1)(A),” after “only”;

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“(B)” and all that follows through clause (ii)
and inserting the following:

“(B) households with—

“(1) incomes which do not exceed the
oreater of—

“(I) an amount equal to 250 per-
cent of the poverty line that is defined
and revised as described in section
673 of the Community Services Block
Grant Act (42 U.S.C. 9902); or

“(II) an amount equal to 80 per-
cent of the State median income; or
“(i1) a monthly energy burden of 3

percent or more, as averaged across the

calendar year preceding the determination
under this paragraph,”; and

(C) in the matter following subparagraph
(B), by inserting before the semicolon the fol-
lowing: *‘, and the State may not exclude a

household from eligibility on the basis of citi-



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

11

zenship of 1 or more of the household mem-

bers’’;

(2) in subsection (¢)(1)(A), by striking “‘assist-
ance to be provided under this title, including eri-
teria” and 1inserting ‘‘assistance to be provided
under this title, including—

“(1) certifying that the State and local
coordinating agencies in the State—

“(I) will allow applicants for the
assistance, to the greatest extent pos-
sible, to self-attest that the applicants
meet the criteria in this title for an el-
igible household; and

“(IT) will not require the appli-
cants to submit proof of income, citi-
zenship, or need, to establish status as
an eligible household; and
“(i1) deseribing criteria’’;

(3) 1n subsection (f), by adding at the end the
following:

“(3) For purposes of section 401(¢), and the remain-

der of title IV, of the Personal Responsibility and Work
Opportunity Reconciliation of 1996 (8 U.S.C. 1611(a),
1601 et seq.) assistance under this title should not be con-

sidered to be a Federal public benefit.”’; and

*S 3535 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

12
(4) in subsection (j), by striking “‘the State may
apply” and inserting ‘“‘the State may, subject to sub-
section (¢)(1)(A)(@1), apply”.
SEC. 8. CONDITIONS FOR FUNDING.
Section 2605 of the Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8624) is amended—
(1) 1 subsection (b)—
(A) in paragraph (1)(C), by inserting be-

4

fore the semicolon the following: “, using toxin-
free materials that do not contain asthmagens
or respiratory sensitizers, giving priority in the
use of those funds, to the greatest extent prac-
ticable, to supporting emergency home repairs
that foster enerey efficiency, decarbonization,
and climate resilience, including through bene-
ficial electrification of heating and cooling’’;
(B) in paragraph (7)—
(i) in subparagraph (C), by striking
“and” at the end; and
(i1) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:
“(E) ensure that—
“(i) the home energy supplier will not
charge late fees for any payment, by a

household receiving assistance through the

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

13

program funded under section 2602(b),
during the period beginning 6 months be-
fore and ending 6 months after a date on
which the supplier receives funds through
the program for the household; and

“(1) if the supplier receives funds
through the program for such a household
and charged such late fees during that pe-
riod, the supplier shall refund the fees to
the household not later than 7 days after
the date the supplier receives the funds;

“(F) ensure that the home energy supplier

will not shut off home energy from a household

that received assistance through the program

funded under section 2602(b), within the 1-year

period beginning on the date the household re-

ceived the assistance;

“(G) ensure that the home energy supplier,

in return for receiving assistance through the

program funded under section 2602 (b)—

*S 3535 IS

“(1) will provide to the State data on
households that have not paid their home
energy bills, to enable the State and the
supplier to carry out coordinated outreach

concerning assistance available through the



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

14

program funded under section 2602(b);
and
“(i1) will, when sending a notice of
late payments to such households, include
information on such assistance, on how to
access such assistance through the HEAP
program, and on eligibility criteria for the
program; and
“(H) ensure that the home energy supplier
will, not later than 2 years after the date of en-
actment of the Heating and Cooling Relief Act,
in return for receiving assistance under the pro-
oram funded wunder section 2602(b) and
through a partnership with the State, offer per-
centage of income payment plans;”’; and
(C) in paragraph (9)—
(1) in subparagraph (A)—
(I) by striking “10 percent” and
inserting “15 percent’’; and
(IT) by striking “and” at the end;
and
(1) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:
“(C) in planning and administering that

program, the State shall use the portion of the

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

15

amount described in subparagraph (A), that ex-
ceeds 10 percent of the funds described in sub-
paragraph (A), to expand the State program
funded under section 2602(b) so that the State
operates the program on a year-round basis;
and

“(D) in planning and administering that
program, the State—

“(1) shall make technological changes
to allow, not later than 5 years after the
date of enactment of the IHeating and
Cooling Relief Act, for online submission of
applications for assistance through that
program; and

“(i1) shall, to the extent practicable—

“(I) conduct outreach activities,
including activities to increase enroll-

ment as described in subsection (m);

“(II) ensure that all HEAP coor-
dinators in the State receive wages,
for administration funded under sec-
tion 2602(b), at not less than the
oreater of $15 per hour or the appli-
cable Federal, State, or local min-

Imum wage rate;

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

*S 3535 IS

16

“(IT) conduct training;

“(IV) as mneeded, conduct out-
reach relating to the program funded
under section 2602(b) to rural electrie
cooperatives, home energy suppliers
owned by a political subdivision of a
State, such as a municipally owned
electrie utility, and home energy sup-
pliers owned by any agency, authority,
corporation, or instrumentality of a
political subdivision of a State; and

“(V) explore opportunities for
auto-enrollment of eligible households
into the program funded under section
2602(b), and in the process document
any potential barriers to auto-enroll-
ment that need to be clarified or oth-
erwise addressed at the Federal

level;”’;

(2) in subsection (¢)(1)—

in subparagraph (G), by striking

“and” at the end;
(B) by redesignating subparagraph (II) as

subparagraph (I); and



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

17

(C) by inserting after subparagraph (G)
the following:

“(H) describes how the State will expand
the State program funded wunder section
2602(b) so that the State operates the program
on a year-round basis in accordance with sub-
section (b)(9)(C) and the measures the State
has taken so far to carry out this expansion;
and”; and
(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(m) The Secretary shall allow, to the greatest extent
possible, the self-attestation, and shall not require the
proof, described in subsection (¢)(1)(A)(1).

“(n) The Secretary shall, by grant or contract, pro-
vide for a study that examines the rates of home energy
shutoffs and assessments of late fees among eligible house-
holds, relative to those rates for households that are not
eligible households, over a period of several years.

“(0) The Secretary shall provide technical assistance
to States to support partnerships desecribed in subsection
(b)(7)(IL).

“(p)(1) The Secretary, in consultation with the Sec-
retary of Education, shall issue guidance for use of funds
for administrative activities desceribed in subsection (b)(9)

to increase, through partnerships with elementary schools,

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00O N O B BN WD = O

18

secondary schools, and local educational agencies, enroll-
ment in the program carried out with funds made avail-
able under section 2602(b) among eligible households that
include children and that have high energy burdens.

“(2) The Secretary shall issue guidance for use by
States on outreach relating to assistance through the pro-
oram funded under section 2602(b) to high-risk individ-
uals, with relevant medical conditions, that benefit from
the use of medical equipment that requires electricity, in-
cluding a ventilator, an oxygen concentrator, or another
medical device.”.

SEC. 9. WEATHERIZATION.

Section 2605(k) of the Low-Income Home Energy

Assistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8624(k)) is amended—
(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “15 percent”
and inserting “25 percent’’; and

(2) in paragraph (2)—
(A) in subparagraph (A), in the matter

preceding clause (1)—
(i) by striking ‘“subparagraph (B)”

and inserting “subparagraph (C)”’; and

(i1) by striking “‘the greater of 25 per-
cent” and inserting “‘a portion equal to the

oreater of 35 percent’’;

*S 3535 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

*S 3535 IS

19
(B) by redesignating subparagraph (B) as
subparagraph (C); and
(C) by inserting after subparagraph (A)
the following:
“(B) The State—
“(1) shall, to the extent practicable—

“(I) use the portion described in sub-
paragraph (A) for energy-related home re-
pair that reduces dependence on fossil fuel
energy sources; and

“(II) use the portion to facilitate the
use of funds made available under section
2602(b) to increase the participation of eli-
oible households in community solar pro-
orams, or to otherwise increase access to
and ownership of distributed renewable en-
ergy infrastructure among eligible house-
holds; and
“(ii) shall if possible give the highest pri-

ority to using the portion for home repair that
replaces appliances that rely on fossil fuels with
appliances that use electric heating or cooling

technology, powered by renewable energy.”.



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N R NG I NG I N S e T e e e e T T
LN A W D= O O NN N N R W DY = o

20
SEC. 10. HOME ENERGY ARREARS.

Section 2605 of the Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 (42 U.S.C. 8624), as amended by
section 8, is further amended by adding at the end the
following:

“(q)(1) In providing assistance through the program
funded under section 2602(b), a State, or any other per-
son with which the State makes arrangements to carry
out the objectives of this title, shall provide assistance (in
addition to any other assistance available) for home energy
arrears for any eligible household.

“(2) Not later than 1 year after the date of enact-
ment of the Heating and Cooling Relief Act, the Secretary
shall, in consultation with the Secretary of Energy, issue
ouidance on best practices for States (including through
partnerships with home energy suppliers) to pay for home
energy arrears with assistance provided through the pro-
oram, including by paying for such arrears at the time
of dissemination of that assistance.

“(3) To the extent practicable, the Secretary and the

Secretary of Energy, shall jointly:
“(A) implement a data tracking system to col-

lect aggregate data regarding the number of eligible
households in arrears and their respective energy

burdens and develop recommendations to HEAP co-

*S 3535 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

21

ordinators on how to minimize energy burdens for

the households; and

“(B) issue guidance to home energy suppliers
with recommendations for working with State agen-
cies to address home energy arrears of eligible
households.”.

SEC. 11. PROGRAM NAME CHANGE.

(a) LIHEAP.—The Low-Income Home Energy As-
sistance Act of 1981 is amended—

(1) in section 2607A(b) (42 U.S.C. 8626a(b)),
by striking “low-income” the first place it appears;
and

(2) in section 2607B(e)(2)(B)(i) (42 U.S.C.
8626b(e)(2)(B)(1)), by striking “‘Low-Income”.

(b) OTHER LiAW.—A reference in any other Kederal
law (other than that Act), Executive order, rule, regula-
tion, or delegation of authority, or any document, of or
relating to the Low-Income Home Energy Assistance Pro-
oram, shall be deemed to refer to the Home Energy As-
sistance Program.

SEC. 12. JUST TRANSITION GRANTS.

The Low-Income Home Energy Assistance Act of
1981 is amended by inserting after section 26078 (42
U.S.C. 8626b) the following:

*S 3535 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ JEEN N© T N B NG T NG I NS R NS R S e e T e e e T e T
A N R~ WD = O 0O 0NN B W NN~ O

22
“SEC. 2607C. HEAP JUST TRANSITION GRANTS.

“(a) GRANT PROGRAM.—The Secretary and the Sec-
retary of Energy shall jointly carry out a grant program
under this section. In carrying out the program, the Secre-
taries shall make grants to States and local governments
to support the development and implementation of inter-
agency plans to reduce energy burdens for eligible house-
holds with high home energy use. The plans shall promote
the reduction of those burdens in a manner that supports
a just transition away from fossil fuel energy and protects
eligible households from the threats of climate change.
The Secretaries shall make the grants for a period of 3

years.

“(b) PREFERENCES.—In making the grants, the Sec-
retary shall give a preference to States, and local govern-
ments, who set up coordination systems—

“(1) to identify eligible households, that are re-
cipients of assistance through the program funded
under section 2602(b), with high home energy use;
and

“(2) prioritize those eligible households to re-
ceive emergency repair, weatherization, and retrofit
assistance that results in decarbonization and reduc-
tions in energy use.

“(¢) REPORT TO CONGRESS.—At the conclusion of

the 3-year grant period, the Secretaries shall—

*S 3535 IS



9 B S S B O]

23

“(1) conduct an evaluation of the program’s
outcomes; and

“(2) prepare and submit to Congress a report
containing the results of the evaluation and policy

recommendations.”.

*S 3535 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-12-29T05:52:37-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




