AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1181TH CONGRESS
LU H, R. 5980

To amend title 49, United States Code, to authorize state of good repair
grants to be used for public transportation resilience improvement, and
for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
OCTOBER 18, 2023
Mr. ESPAILLAT (for himself and Ms. NORTON) introduced the following bill
OCTOBER 25, 2023

Referred to the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure

A BILL

To amend title 49, United States Code, to authorize state
of good repair grants to be used for public transportation

resilience improvement, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “Resilient Transit Act
5 of 2023”7,

6 SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

7 Section 5302 of title 49, United States Code, is
8 amended—



O o0 N N D BB W =

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O IR NO R e

2

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (17) through
(25) as paragraphs (18) through (26), respectively;
and

(2) by inserting after paragraph (16) the fol-
lowing:

“(17) RESILIENCE IMPROVEMENT.—The term
‘resilience improvement’ has the meaning given the
term 1n section 176(a) of title 23.”.

SEC. 3. STATE OF GOOD REPAIR GRANTS FOR PUBLIC
TRANSPORTATION RESILIENCE IMPROVE-
MENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 5337 of title 49, United
States Code, is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(¢) PuBLIC TRANSPORTATION RESILIENCE IM-
PROVEMENT GRANTS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary may make
erants under this subsection to assist State and local
covernment authorities in financing 1 or more eligi-

ble activities described in paragraph (2).

“(2) ELIGIBLE ACTIVITIES.

“(A) IN GENERAL.—A recipient of a grant
under this subsection may use grant amounts
for public transportation resilience improve-

ments that increase the resilience of public

*HR 5980 IH



O© o0 3 O WD b W N e

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0O NN O B BN~ WD == O

3

transportation systems from the impacts of cli-

mate change, such as sea level rise, flooding,

wildfires, extreme weather events, and other

natural disasters.

“(B) INCLUSIONS.

Activities eligible to be

carried out using grant amounts under this

subsection include—

*HR 5980 IH

“(1) the installation of mitigation
measures that prevent the intrusion of
floodwaters;

“(i1) the installation of equipment to
detect the occurrence of a flood event;

“(i11) the replacement of equipment or
facilities that are currently prone to flood
events or will be in the future;

“(iv) the purchase of new equipment
to support regular maintenance of drain-
age and pumping infrastructure;

“(v) the replacement of equipment
stressed  during extreme temperature
events;

“(vi) the installation of equipment to
regulate temperatures and sensors to mon-

itor extreme temperatures;



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N TR NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N S = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O I NO R e

4

“(vii) the development of backup sys-
tems to provide redundancy during the
outage of a primary power source;

“(viii) the assessment of system
vulnerabilities to current and future weath-
er events, natural disasters, and climate
change, including sea level rise;

“(ix) the planning of system improve-
ments and emergency response strategies
to address identified vulnerabilities; and

“(x) any other activity for resilience
improvement, as determined by the Sec-
retary.

“(3) TYPES OF PROJECTS.—Grants under this

subsection may be used to finance—
“(A) standalone projects; and
“(B) components of projects carried out

under subsection (b)(1).

“(4) PUBLIC TRANSPORTATION RESILIENCE IM-
PROVEMENT FORMULA.—Of the amounts made
available under section 5338(a)(2)(Ii) to carry out
this subsection—

“(A) 97.15 percent shall be apportioned to
recipients in accordance with subsection (c¢);

and

*HR 5980 IH



O o0 N N n BB W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e Y
W = O O 0N N N R, WD = O

5}

“(B) 2.85 percent shall be apportioned to
recipients in accordance with subsection (d).
“(5) ANNUAL REPORTS.—Not later than 1 year

after the enactment of this subsection, and annually
thereafter, the Secretary shall submit to the Com-
mittee on Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs of
the Senate and the Committee on Transportation
and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives
and publish on the website of the Department of
Transportation, a report that describes the imple-
mentation of this subsection during the preceding
calendar year, including—

“(A) a detailed description of the activities
carried out with grants provided under this sub-
section;

“(B) a summary of each project financed
in whole or in part by a grant provided under
this subsection that benefits or is located In—

“(i) a neighborhood with poverty and
unemployment rates that exceed the aver-
age in the United States;

“(11) an underserved community or a

medically underserved community;

*HR 5980 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
LN R W NN = DO VO XN R WD~ O

6

“(111) a location where the EJ Index is
above the national average, as determined
by EJSCREEN;

“(iv) an environmental justice commu-
nity, as documented by federally recog-
nized environmental justice mapping and
equity screening tools; and

“(v) a neighborhood where 30 percent
or more of households receive benefits
under—

“(I) the supplemental nutrition
assistance program under the Food
and Nutrition Act of 2008 (7 U.S.C.
2011 et seq.); or

“(IT) a mandatory spending pro-
oram of the Federal Government for
which, as determined by the Sec-
retary, eligibility for the benefits of
the program, or the amount of such
benefits, is determined on the basis of
immcome or resources of the individual
or family seeking the benefit; and

“(C) recommendations to improve the ad-

ministration of this subsection.

“(6) DEFINITIONS.—In this subsection:

*HR 5980 IH



O o0 N N B W=

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N O N N = = N Re < BN B o) W ) B ~S O T NO S e

7

“(A) ENVIRONMENTAL JUSTICE COMMU-
NITY.—The term ‘environmental justice com-
munity’ means a community with significant
representation of communities of color, low-in-
come communities, or Tribal and indigenous
communities, that experiences, or i1s at risk of
experiencing higher or more adverse human
health or environmental effects.

“(B) EJ INDEX.—The term ‘EJ Index’
means the environmental justice indexes in
EJSCREEN.

“(0O) EJSCREEN.—The term
‘EJSCREEN’ means the environmental justice
mapping and screening tool created by the KEn-
vironmental Protection Agency.

“(D) MEDICALLY UNDERSERVED COMMU-
NITY.—The term ‘medically underserved com-
munity’ has the meaning given such term in
section T99B of the Public Health Service Act
(42 U.S.C. 295p).

“(E) UNDERSERVED COMMUNITY.—The
term ‘underserved community’ means—

“(1) a community located within a

ZIP Code or census tract that is identified

by the Secretary as—

*HR 5980 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O N S e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

8

“(I) a low-income community;

“(IT) a community of color; or

“(IIT) a Tribal community; or
“(i1) any other community that the
Secretary determines is disproportionately
vulnerable to, or bares a disproportionate
burden of, any combination of economic,
social, environmental, or climate

stressors.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 5337 of
title 49, United States Code, is amended by striking “‘sec-
tion 5338(a)(2)(K)” each place it appears and inserting
“section H338(a)(2)(1)”.

SEC. 4. AUTHORIZATIONS.

Section 5338(a) of title 49, United States Code, is
amended—
(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“$13,634,000,000” and inserting
“$13,934,000,0007;

(B) in subparagraph (C), by striking
“$13,990,000,000” and inserting
“$14,290,000,0007;

*HR 5980 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

e T S S e e S T - T = S~ G =)
O o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

9

(C) in subparagraph (D), by striking
“$14,279,000,000” and inserting
“$14,579,000,000”; and

(D) in subparagraph (E), by striking
“$14,642,000,000” and inserting
“$14,942,000,000”; and
(2) in paragraph (2)(1.)—

(A) by striking “$3,587,778,037” and in-
serting ““$3,887,778,037";

(B) by striking “$3,680,934,484” and in-
serting ‘$3,980,934,484";

(C) by striking “$3,755,675,417” and in-
serting ““$4,055,675,417";

(D) by striking “$3,850,496,668” and in-
serting ““$4,150,496,668”"; and

(E) by inserting “and $300,000,000 for
each of fiscal years 2024 through 2027 shall be
available to carry out section 5337(g)” after
“section H337(f)”.

O

*HR 5980 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-11-06T07:55:20-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




