AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1181TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 5 1 56

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to enhance the low-income
housing tax eredit, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

SEPTEMBER 24, 2024

Mr. WinTEHoUSE (for himself and Mr. REED) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to enhance

the low-income housing tax credit, and for other purposes.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Affordable Housing
Construction Act”.

SEC. 2. INCREASE IN STATE HOUSING CREDIT CEILING.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 42(h)(3)(C)(11) of the In-

ternal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended—

O o0 9 N B~ W

(1) by striking “$1.75” in subclause (I) and in-

[Em—
)

serting “$9.79”, and



2

1 (2) by striking “$2,000,000” in subclause (II)
2 and inserting “$11,340,000”.

3 (b) INFLATION ADJUSTMENTS.—Section 42(h)(3)(H)
4 is amended—

5 (1) by striking “In the case of a calendar year
6 after 2002, the $2,000,000 and $1.75 amounts in
7 subparagraph (C)” in clause (i) and inserting “In
8 the case of a calendar year after 2025, the
9 $16,542,968 and $9.79 amounts in subparagraph
10 )7,
11 (2) by striking “calendar year 2001 in clause
12 (1)(IT) and inserting “calendar year 2024,
13 (3) by striking “$2,000,000” in clause (ii)(I)
14 and inserting “$11,340,000”, and
15 (4) by striking “$1.75” in clause (i1)(II) and in-
16 serting ““$9.79”.
17 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
18 this section shall apply to calendar years beginning after

19 December 31, 2024.

20 SEC. 3. INCREASED CREDIT AMOUNTS AND CREDIT ALLO-

21 CATION SET-ASIDES FOR CERTAIN BUILD-
22 INGS.
23 (a) INCREASED CREDIT AMOUNTS.

*S 5156 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

(1) IN GENERAL.

3

Section 42(d)(5) of the In-

ternal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding

at the end the following new subparagraphs:

*S 5156 IS

AILING WAGE BUILDINGS.

“(C) INCREASE IN CREDIT FOR PRE-

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
building which pays applicable laborers at
rates not less than the prevailing rates for
construction, alteration, or repair of a
similar character in the locality in which
such facility is located as most recently de-
termined by the Secretary of Liabor, in ac-
cordance with subchapter IV of chapter 31
of title 40, United States Code, and which
18 designated by the housing credit agency
as requiring the increase in credit under
this subparagraph in order for such pay-
ments to be financially feasible as part of
a qualified low-income housing project—

“(I) in the case of a new build-
ing, the eligible basis of such building
shall be increased by 50 percent of
such basis determined without regard

to this subparagraph and subpara-



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG N NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N e = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O B NO = e

4

oraphs (B), (D), (E), (F), and (G),
and

“(IT) in the case of an existing
building, the rehabilitation expendi-
tures taken into account under sub-
section (e) shall be increased by 50
percent of such expenditures deter-
mined without regard to this subpara-
oraph and subparagraphs (B), (D),
(E), (F), and (G).

“(11) APPLICABLE LABORERS.—For

purposes of this clause, the term ‘applica-
ble laborers’ means, with respect to any
building, any laborers employed by the tax-
payer, or any contractor or subcontractor,
in the construction, alteration, or repair of
the building.

“(D) INCREASE IN CREDIT FOR BUILDINGS

POWERED BY RENEWABLE ENERGY.—

*S 5156 IS

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
building which utilizes renewable energy
(as defined in section 203(b)(2) of the En-
ergy Policy Act of 2005), and which is des-
ignated by the housing credit agency as re-

quiring the increase in credit under this



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ JEE \© R NS B O N O R e T e e e T e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

*S 5156 IS

5

subparagraph in order for such renewable
energy use to be financially feasible as part

of a qualified low-income housing project—

“(I) in the case of a new build-
ing, the eligible basis of such building
shall be increased by the applicable
percentage of such basis determined
without regard to this subparagraph
and subparagraphs (B), (C), (E), (F),
and (G), and

“(IT) in the case of an existing
building, the rehabilitation expendi-
tures taken into account under sub-
section (e) shall be increased by the
applicable percentage of such expendi-
tures determined without regard to
this subparagraph and subparagraphs
(B), (O), (E), (F), and (G).

“(11) APPLICABLE PERCENTAGE.—For

purposes of this subparagraph, the applica-
ble percentage is 50 percent of the percent-
age of the energy utilized by such building
which is from renewable energy (as so de-

fined).



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\© TN NG I NG T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG O N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

6

“(E) INCREASE IN (CREDIT FOR BUILDINGS

NEAR PUBLIC TRANSPORTATION.—

*S 5156 IS

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any

building which is located in a public trans-
portation zone and which is designated by
the housing credit agency as requiring the
increase in credit under this subparagraph
in order for such building to be financially
feasible as part of a qualified low-income

housing project—

“(I) in the case of a new build-
ing, the eligible basis of such building
shall be increased by 25 percent of
such basis determined without regard
to this subparagraph and subpara-
eraphs (B), (C), (D), (F), and (G),
and

“(IT) in the case of an existing
building, the rehabilitation expendi-
tures taken into account under sub-
section (e) shall be increased by 25
percent of such expenditures deter-
mined without regard to this subpara-
oraph and subparagraphs (B), (C),
(D), (F), and (G).



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN O T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

“(11) PuBLIC TRANSPORTATION
ZONE.—For purposes of this subpara-
oraph, a building is located in a public
transportation zone if—

“(I) the building is within one-
half mile of an existing commuter rail,
light rail, or subway station,

“(IT) the building is within one-
quarter mile of one or more existing
public bus stops, or

“(ITT) the building is located in a

census tract

“(aa) designated by the Ad-
ministrator of the Environmental
Protection Agency as having
above average walkability, or

“(bb) which is adjacent to 2
or more such census tracts de-
scribed in 1item (aa).

“(F') INCREASE IN CREDIT FOR BUILDINGS
SERVING HOUSEHOLDS WITH PEOPLE WITH
DISABILITIES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
building which has low-income units that

meet the applicable design standards for

*S 5156 IS



[E—

8

occupancy by persons with mental, phys-
ical, sensory, or developmental disabilities,
and which 1s designated by the housing
credit agency as requiring the increase in
credit under this subparagraph in order for
such building to be financially feasible as
part of a qualified low-income housing

project—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

[\© TN NG N N T NG N NG I NS B S e T e e T e T e e
[ B NG U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O IR NO I e

“(I) in the case of a new build-
ing, the eligible basis of such building
shall be increased by the applicable
percentage of such basis determined
without regard to this subparagraph
and subparagraphs (B), (C), (D), (D),
and (G), and

“(IT) in the case of an existing
building, the rehabilitation expendi-
tures taken into account under sub-
section (e) shall be increased by the
applicable percentage of such expendi-
tures determined without regard to
this subparagraph and subparagraphs
(B), (C), (D), (E), and (G).

“(11) DESIGN STANDARDS.—For pur-

poses of clause (1), the term ‘applicable de-



O o0 N N B W=

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

LIES.

9

sign standards’ means the principles and
standards of adaptable design as detailed
in the Uniform Federal Accessibility
Standards, or any successor standard des-
ignated by the Secretary.

“(i11) APPLICABLE PERCENTAGE.—
For purposes of this subparagraph, the
term ‘applicable percentage’ means the
number of percentage points (not to exceed
50 percentage points) by which—

“(I) the ratio (expressed as a
percentage and rounded to the nearest
percent) of the number of low-income
units in the building that meet the ap-
plicable design standards for occu-
pancy by persons with mental, phys-
ical, sensory, or developmental disabil-
ities bears to the total number of
units in the building, exceeds

“(IT) 5 percentage points.

“(G) INCREASE IN (CREDIT FOR BUILDINGS

SERVING  EXTREMELY LOW-INCOME  FAMI-

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any

building in which 20 percent of the units



[E—

10

are occupied by extremely low-income fami-
lies and which is designated by the housing
credit agency as requiring the increase in
credit under this subparagraph in order for
such building to be financially feasible as
part of a qualified low-income housing

project—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

[\© TN NG N N T NG N NG R NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L A W NN = DO VO X NN D N R WD~ O

“(I) in the case of a new build-
ing, the eligible basis of such building
shall be increased by 50 percent of
such basis determined without regard
to this subparagraph and subpara-
araphs (B), (C), (D), (B), and (F),
and

“(IT) in the case of an existing
building, the rehabilitation expendi-
tures taken into account under sub-
section (e) shall be increased by 50
percent of such expenditures deter-
mined without regard to this subpara-
oraph and subparagraphs (B), (C),
(D), (E), and (F).

“(11) EXTREMELY LOW-INCOME FAMI-

LIES.— For purposes of this subpara-

eraph, the term ‘extremely low-income



O o0 N N W Bk W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R \O N O N N e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

11

families’ means families whose annual in-
comes do not exceed 30 percent of the area
median gross income, as determined 1in
consultation with the Secretary of IHealth
and Human Services.

“(H) LamrtaTioN.—Notwithstanding sub-

paragraphs (B), (C), (D), (E), (F), and (G)—

(2)

“(1) the eligible basis of any building
shall not exceed an amount equal to 250
percent of such basis determined without
regard to subparagraphs (B), (C), (D),
(E), (F), and (G), and

“(i1) the rehabilitation expenditures
taken into account under subsection (e)
shall not exceed 250 percent of such ex-
penditures determined without regard to
subparagraphs (B), (C), (D), (E), (F), and
(G).”.

CONFORMING  AMENDMENTS.—Section

42(d)(5)(B)(1) of such Code 1s amended—

*S 5156 IS

(A) by striking “shall be 130 percent of”

each place it appears in subclauses (I) and (II)

and inserting “‘shall be increased by 30 percent

of”’, and



O o0 N N D B W =

[\ TN O I N T NG I NG I NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N e R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

12

(B) by striking “this subparagraph” each
place it appears in subclauses (I) and (II) and
inserting ‘‘this subparagraph and subpara-

oraphs (B), (C), (D), (E), (F), and (G)”.
(3) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made
by this subsection shall apply to buildings placed in
service after the date of the enactment of this Act.

(b) SET-ASIDE FOR CERTAIN PROJECTS.

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 42(h) of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding at the
end the following new paragraph:

“(9) PORTION OF STATE CEILING SET-ASIDE
FOR CERTAIN PROJECTS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Not more than two-
thirds of the State housing credit ceiling for
any State for any calendar year shall be allo-
cated to projects other than qualified low-in-
come housing projects deseribed in subpara-
oraphs (C), (D), (E), (F), and (G) of sub-
section (d)(5).

“(B) STATE MAY NOT OVERRIDE SET-
ASIDE.—Nothing in subparagraph (F') of para-
oraph (3) shall be construed to permit a State
not to comply with subparagraph (A) of this

paragraph.”.

*S 5156 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

13

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made
by this subsection shall apply to calendar years be-
einning after the date of the enactment of this Act.

SEC. 4. TAX-EXEMPT BOND FINANCING REQUIREMENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 42(h)(4) of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking subpara-
eraph (B) and inserting the following:

“(B) SPECIAL RULE WIIERE MINIMUM

PERCENT OF BUILDINGS IS FINANCED WITH

TAX-EXEMPT BONDS SUBJECT TO VOLUME

cAP.—For purposes of subparagraph (A), para-

eraph (1) shall not apply to any portion of the
credit allowable under subsection (a) with re-
spect to a building if—

“(1) 50 percent or more of the aggre-
cate basis of such building and the land on
which the building is located is financed by
1 or more obligations described in subpara-
oeraph (A), or

“@1)(I) 15 percent or more of the ag-
oregate basis of such building and the land
on which the building is located is financed
by 1 or more qualified obligations, and

“(II) 1 or more of such qualified

obligations—

*S 5156 IS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG N N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ B N O N N e = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O T NO S e

14

“(aa) are part of an issue
the issue date of which is after
December 31, 2023, and

“(bb) provide the financing
for not less than 5 percent of the
ageregate basis of such building
and the land on which the build-
ing is located.

“(C) QUALIFIED OBLIGATION.—For pur-
poses of subparagraph (B)(i1), the term ‘quali-
fied obligation” means an obligation which is de-
seribed in subparagraph (A) and which is part
of an issue the issue date of which is before
January 1, 2026.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to buildings placed in service
in taxable years beginning after December 31, 2023,

(2) REHABILITATION EXPENDITURES TREATED
AS SEPARATE NEW BUILDING.—In the case of any
building with respect to which any expenditures are
treated as a separate new building under section
42(e) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, for
purposes of paragraph (1), both the existing building

and the separate new building shall be treated as

*S 5156 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[ w—
e

15

having been placed in service on the date such ex-

penditures are treated as placed in service under

section 42(e)(4) of such Code.
SEC. 5. MODIFICATION OF EXTENDED USE PERIOD.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 42(h)(6)(D)(@1)(II) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
“15 years” and inserting “35 years’.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to agreements entered into in tax-
able years beginning after the date of the enactment of

this Act.

*S 5156 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-10-09T19:25:27-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




