AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1181TH CONGRESS
LN S, 5439

To provide for water conservation, drought operations, and drought resilience

M.

To

0 N N B~ W

at water resources development projects, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

DECEMBER 5, 2024
KeLLy (for himself and Mr. PADILLA) introduced the following bill; which

was read twice and referred to the Committee on Environment and Public
‘Works

A BILL

provide for water conservation, drought operations, and
drought resilience at water resources development
projects, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Drought Resilient In-
frastructure Act of 20247,

SEC. 2. DEFINITION OF SECRETARY.
In this Act, the term “Secretary” means the Sec-

retary of the Army.



2
1 SEC. 3. DECLARATION OF POLICY.

2 (a) IN GENERAL.—It is the policy of the United
3 States for the Corps of Engineers, consistent with applica-
4 ble statutory authorities—

5 (1) to maximize opportunities for water supply,
6 water conservation measures, and drought resiliency
7 efforts at and in the operation of water resources de-
8 velopment projects;

9 (2) 1 accordance with section 301(a) of the
10 Water Supply Act of 1958 (43 U.S.C. 390b(a)), to
11 participate and cooperate with States and local in-
12 terests in developing water supplies for domestic,
13 municipal, industrial, and other authorized purposes
14 in connection with the construction, maintenance,
15 and operation of water resources development
16 projects; and

17 (3) in coordination with non-Federal interests,
18 to enable the adoption of water conservation meas-
19 ures and drought resiliency measures that are in
20 alignment with the authorized purposes of water re-
21 sources development projects.
22 (b) FuLL CONSIDERATION.—In support of subsection

23 (a), the Secretary shall give full consideration to requests
24 and proposals from non-Federal interests to utilize the au-
25 thorities of the Corps of Engineers in furtherance of water
26 supply features, water conservation wmeasures, and

oS 5439 IS



3

drought resiliency efforts that are in alignment the au-
thorized purposes of water resources development projects.
(¢) LIMITATION.—Nothing in this section—

(1) affects, modifies, or changes—

(A) the authority of a State to manage,
use, or allocate the water resources of that
State;

(B) any water right in existence on the
date of enactment of this Act;

(C) any existing water supply agreements
between the Secretary and a non-Federal inter-
est;

(D) the authorized purposes of a water re-
sources development project; or

(E) any existing Corps of Engineers au-
thorities;

(2) preempts or affects any State water law or
Interstate compact governing water;

(3) diminishes the other priorities and the pri-
mary or secondary missions of the Corps of KEngi-
neers; or

(4) shall be interpreted to supersede or modify
any written agreement between the Federal Govern-
ment and a non-Kederal interest that is in effect on

the date of enactment of this Act.

oS 5439 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR \© R N R \O T (O B e e e e e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

4
SEC. 4. FORECAST-INFORMED RESERVOIR OPERATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—In updating a water control man-
ual for any reservoir constructed, owned, or operated by
the Secretary, including a reservoir for which the Sec-
retary 1s authorized to presecribe regulations for the use
of storage allocated for flood control or navigation pursu-
ant to section 7 of the Act of December 22, 1944 (com-
monly known as the “Flood Control Act of 1944”) (58
Stat. 890, chapter 665; 33 U.S.C. 709), the Secretary
shall, to the maximum extent practicable, incorporate the
use of forecast-informed reservoir operations, subject to
the availability of appropriations.

(b) GUIDELINES.

The Secretary, in coordination
with relevant Federal and State agencies and non-Federal
interests, shall issue clear and concise guidelines for incor-
porating the use of forecast-informed reservoir operations
into water control manuals for reservoirs described in sub-
section (a).

(¢) ASSESSMENT.—

(1) REQUIREMENT.—The Secretary shall carry
out an assessment of geographically diverse res-
ervoirs described in subsection (a) to determine the
viability of using forecast-informed reservoir oper-

ations at such reservoirs.

oS 5439 IS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R O R \O N O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

5

(2) PRIORITY AREAS.

In carrying out the as-
sessment described in paragraph (1), the Secretary
shall include an assessment of—

(A) each reservoir located in the South Pa-
cific Division of the Corps of Engineers; and
(B) reservoirs located in each of the

Northwestern Division and the South Atlantice

Division of the Corps of Engineers.

(3) CONSULTATION.—In carrying out this sub-
section, the Secretary shall consult with relevant
Federal and State agencies and non-Federal inter-
ests.

(d) SAVINGS PRrROVISION.—Nothing in this section
preempts or affects any State water law or any interstate
compact governing water, or otherwise restricts, affects,
or amends any other law or the authority of any depart-
ment, instrumentality, or agency of the United States re-
lated to the operation of reservoirs described in subsection
(a).

SEC. 5. UPDATES TO CERTAIN WATER CONTROL MANUALS.
Section 8109 of the Water Resources Development

Act of 2022 (136 Stat. 3702) is amended by inserting “or

that incorporate the use of forecast-informed reservoir op-

erations into such manuals” before the period at the end.

oS 5439 IS



O o0 9 N U kA WD =

[\ TR NO T N RN NG T NG I NS R NS R e e T e e e T e T
A N A WD = O O 00NN B WD - O

6
SEC. 6. EMERGENCY DROUGHT OPERATIONS PILOT PRO-

GRAM.

(a) DEFINITION OF COVERED PROJECT.—In this sec-

tion, the term “‘covered project” means a project
(1) that is located in the State of California,
the State of Nevada, or the State of Arizona; and
(2)(A) of the Corps of Engineers for which
water supply is an authorized purpose; or
(B) for which the Secretary develops a water
control manual under section 7 of the Act of Decem-
ber 22, 1944 (commonly known as the “Flood Con-

trol Act of 1944”7) (58 Stat. 890, chapter 665; 33

U.S.C. 709).

(b) EMERGENCY OPERATION DURING DROUGHT.—
Consistent with other authorized project purposes and in
coordination with the non-Federal interest, in operating
a covered project during a drought emergency in the
project area, the Secretary may carry out a pilot program
to operate the covered project with water supply as the

primary project purpose.

(¢) UPDATES.—In carrying out this section, the Sec-
retary may update the water control manual for a covered
project to include drought operations and contingency

plans.

(d) REQUIREMENTS.

In carrying out subsection (b),
the Secretary shall ensure that—

oS 5439 IS



7

| (1) operations described in that subsection—

2 (A) are consistent with water management
3 deviations and drought contingency plans in the
4 water control manual for the covered project;

5 (B) impact only the flood pool managed by
6 the Secretary; and

7 (C) shall not be carried out in the event of
8 a forecast or anticipated flood or weather event
9 that would require flood risk management to
10 take precedence;
11 (2) to the maximum extent practicable, the Sec-
12 retary uses forecast-informed reservoir operations;
13 and
14 (3) the covered project returns to the operations
15 that were 1n place prior to the use of the authority
16 provided under that subsection at a time determined
17 by the Secretary, in coordination with the non-Fed-
18 eral interest.
19 (e) CONTRIBUTED FUNDS.—The Secretary may re-

20 ceive and expend funds contributed by a non-Federal in-

21 terest to carry out activities under this section.

22 (f) REPORT.—

23 (1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 2 years after
24 the date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary
25 shall submit to the Committee on Environment and

oS 5439 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W=

| \O N \© R \O B \O I O N N e e e e e T e e e
A LW O = O VOV o0 N O R WD = O

8

Public Works of the Senate and the Committee on
Transportation and Infrastructure of the IHouse of
Representatives a report on the pilot program car-

ried out under this section.

(2) IncLusioNs.—The Secretary shall include
in the report under paragraph (1) a description of
the activities of the Secretary that were carried out
for each covered project and any lessons learned
from carrying out those activities.

(g) LiMITATIONS.—Nothing in this section—

(1) affects, modifies, or changes the authorized
purposes of a covered project;

(2) affects existing Corps of Engineers authori-
ties, including authorities with respect to navigation,
hydropower, flood damage reduction, and environ-
mental protection and restoration;

(3) affects the ability of the Corps of Engineers
to provide for temporary deviations;

(4) affects the application of a cost-share re-
quirement under section 101, 102, or 103 of the
Water Resources Development Act of 1986 (33
U.S.C. 2211, 2212, 2213);

(5) supersedes or modifies any written agree-

ment between the Federal Government and a non-

oS 5439 IS



9

1 Federal interest that is in effect on the date of en-
2 actment of this Act;
3 (6) supersedes or modifies any amendment to
4 an existing multistate water control plan for the Col-
5 orado River Basin, if applicable;
6 (7) affects any water right in existence on the
7 date of enactment of this Act;
8 (8) preempts or affects any State water law or
9 Interstate compact governing water;
10 (9) affects existing water supply agreements be-
11 tween the Secretary and a non-Federal interest; or
12 (10) affects any obligation to comply with the
13 provisions of any Federal or State environmental
14 law, including—
15 (A) the National Environmental Policy Act
16 of 1969 (42 U.S.C. 4321 et seq.);
17 (B) the Federal Water Pollution Control
18 Act (33 U.S.C. 1251 et seq.); and
19 (C) the Endangered Species Act of 1973
20 (16 U.S.C. 1531 et seq.).

21 SEC. 7. LEVERAGING FEDERAL INFRASTRUCTURE FOR IN-
22 CREASED WATER SUPPLY.

23 Section 1118(1) of Water Resources Development Act
24 of 2016 (43 U.S.C. 390b-2(i)) is amended by striking

25 paragraph (2) and inserting the following:

oS 5439 IS



10

1 “(2) CONTRIBUTED FUNDS FOR OTHER FED-
2 ERAL RESERVOIR PROJECTS.

3 “(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary is au-
4 thorized to receive and expend funds from a
5 non-Federal interest or a Federal agency that
6 owns a Iederal reservoir project described in
7 subparagraph (B) to formulate, review, or re-
8 vise operational documents pursuant to a pro-
9 posal submitted in accordance with subsection
10 (a) for such a Federal reservoir project.

11 “(B) FEDERAL RESERVOIR PROJECTS DE-
12 SCRIBED.—A Federal reservoir project referred
13 to in subparagraph (A) is a reservoir for which
14 the Secretary is authorized to preseribe regula-
15 tions for the use of storage allocated for flood
16 control or navigation pursuant to section 7 of
17 the Act of December 22, 1944 (commonly
18 known as the ‘Flood Control Act of 1944°) (58
19 Stat. 890, chapter 665; 33 U.S.C. 709).”.

20 SEC. 8. STUDIES FOR MODIFICATION OF PROJECT PUR-

21 POSES IN THE COLORADO RIVER BASIN IN
22 ARIZONA.
23 (a) STUDY.—The Secretary shall carry out a study

24 of a project of the Corps of Engineers in the Colorado

25 River Basin in the State of Arizona to determine whether

oS 5439 IS



11
to include water supply as a project purpose of that
project if a request for such a study to modify the project

purpose is made to the Secretary by

(1) the non-Federal interest for the project; or
(2) in the case of a project for which there is
no non-KFederal interest, the Governor of the State
of Arizona.
(b) COORDINATION.—The Secretary, to the max-
imum extent practicable, shall coordinate with relevant
State and local authorities in carrying out this section.

(¢) RECOMMENDATIONS.

If, after carrying out a
study under subsection (a) with respect to a project de-
seribed in that subsection, the Secretary determines that
water supply should be included as a project purpose for
that project, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee
on Environment and Public Works of the Senate and the
Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the
House of Representatives a recommendation for the modi-
fication of the project purpose of that project.
SEC. 9. INVASIVE SPECIES THAT EXACERBATE DROUGHT.

Section 206 of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1996 (33 U.S.C. 2330) 1s amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by adding at the end the

following:

oS 5439 IS



O o0 N N BB W =

e T e S e e S e S e e
o N O W kA W NN = O

19

SEC.

12

“(4) DROUGHT RESILIENCE.—A project under
this section may include measures that enhance
drought resilience through the restoration of wet-
lands or the removal of invasive species.”;

(2) in subsection (b), by adding at the end the
following:

“(3)  ANADROMOUS  FISIL.—Notwithstanding
paragraph (1), for projects carried out under sub-
section (a)(3), the non-Federal interest shall provide
15 percent of the cost of construction, including pro-
vision of all lands, easements, rights-of-way, and
necessary relocations.”’;

(3) in subsection (d), by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$15,000,000”’; and

(4) in subsection (f), by striking “$62,500,000”
and inserting “$75,000,000”.

10. PROJECT MODIFICATIONS FOR IMPROVEMENT OF
ENVIRONMENT OR DROUGHT RESILIENCY.

Section 1135 of the Water Resources Development

20 Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2309a) 1s amended—

21
22
23

(1) in the section heading, by inserting “OR
DrovuGIiT RESILIENCY” after “ENVIRONMENT;

(2) in subsection (a)—

oS 5439 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

e T e N S S T = T
o N O W»n kA W NN = O

19

13
(A) by striking “for the purpose of improv-
ing”” and inserting the following: “for the pur-
pose of—
“(1) improving’’;
(B) in paragraph (1) (as so designated), by

(44

striking the period at the end and inserting *;
or”’; and
(C) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) providing drought resiliency.”’;

(3) in subsection (b), by striking “(2) will im-
prove” and inserting “(2) will provide for drought
resilience or will improve’’;

(4) in subsection (d), in the third sentence, by
striking “$10,000,000” and inserting
“$15,000,000;

(5) 1n subsection (h), by striking
“$50,000,000” and inserting “$62,000,000”’; and

(6) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) DroucHT RESILIENCE.—Drought resilience

20 measures carried out under this section may include—

21
22
23
24
25

“(1) water conservation measures to mitigate
and address drought conditions;

“(2) removal of sediment captured behind a
dam for the purpose of restoring or increasing the

authorized storage capacity of the project concerned;

oS 5439 IS



O o0 9 AN U Bk~ W

10
11

14
“(3) the planting of native plant species that
will reduce the risk of drought and the incidence of
nonnative species; and
“(4) other actions that increase drought resil-

ience, water conservation, or water availability.” .
SEC. 11. SILVER JACKETS PROGRAM.

The Secretary shall continue the Silver Jackets pro-
eram established by the Secretary pursuant to section 206
of the Flood Control Act of 1960 (33 U.S.C. 709a) and
section 204 of the Robert T. Stafford Disaster Relief and

Emergency Assistance Act (42 U.S.C. 5134).
O

oS 5439 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-01-08T21:48:35-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




