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CENTRAL NEW JERSEY

RECOGNIZES SUSAN N. WILSON

HON. RUSH D. HOLT
OF NEW JERSEY

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Friday, May 19, 2000
Mr. HOLT. Mr. Speaker, today I recognize

Susan Wilson of Princeton, who is being hon-
ored by Planned Parenthood of Central New
Jersey on Tuesday, May 23, 2000.

Ms. Wilson will receive Planned Parent-
hood’s Vivian Aaron Leadership Award. This
award, created by the children of Vivian
Aaron, recognizes individuals who have dem-
onstrated leadership within their community in
the areas of education and family communica-
tion.

Susan Wilson served on the New Jersey
State Board of Education from 1977 to 1982.
It was there that she championed the effort to
establish a statewide mandate for family edu-
cation in all New Jersey schools.

Since 1983, Ms. Wilson has served as the
executive coordinator for the Network for Fam-
ily Life Education at Rutgers University’s
School of Social Work. In her present capacity
she has become a leader in the fight for effec-
tive family life/sexuality education and preven-
tion of adolescent pregnancy.

In 1998, Susan Wilson received the Richard
J. Cross Award for Distinguished Contribution
to the Field of Human Sexuality from the Rob-
ert Wood Johnson Medical School. In past
years, she has also been the recipient of a
Children’s Defense Fund Leadership Award
and a New Jersey Woman of Achievement
Award from Douglas College.

Susan Wilson is a great asset to Central
New Jersey. I urge all my colleagues to join
me today in recognizing Susan Wilson’s dedi-
cation to her community.
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INTRODUCTION OF THE HIGHER
EDUCATION TECHNICAL AMEND-
MENTS OF 2000

HON. HOWARD P. ‘‘BUCK’’ McKEON
OF CALIFORNIA

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Friday, May 19, 2000
Mr. MCKEON. Mr. Speaker, today, my col-

league, Mr. GOODLING, and I are introducing
the Higher Education Technical Amendments
of 2000. Many of my colleagues will remember
that in the last Congress we enacted the High-
er Education Amendments of 1998 on a bipar-
tisan basis. The passage of that Act was one
of the most important pieces of legislation we
enacted for students and their parents. I want
to again thank Chairman GOODLING for his
leadership on that bill. Throughout that proc-
ess he kept members focused on our goal of
improving our student financial aid system.
Additionally, I want to acknowledge his leader-
ship in crafting this technical package, which
will improve the implementation of the 1998
Amendments. I also want to thank the Com-
mittee Ranking Member, Mr. CLAY, the former
Ranking Member of the Subcommittee, Mr.
KILDEE, and the current Ranking Member of
the Subcommittee, Mr. MARTINEZ. The 1998
amendments, which we crafted together, have
been a great success, and our continued ef-
forts on this legislation will only improve on
those results.

As Chairman GOODLING noted in his state-
ment, the legislation introduced today is tech-
nical in nature, but also makes policy adjust-
ments that we believe are necessary to en-
sure that the Act is implemented in the way
Congress intended. We worked with many or-
ganizations and individuals who put forth pro-
posals for our consideration. We included
those which are bipartisan in nature, benefit
students and their parents, and are paid for.
Our goal is to pass a bill that can be acted
upon by the other body and enacted into law
in the near future.

The legislation we are introducing today will
improve our national early outreach efforts by
making modifications to the TRIO and GEAR
UP programs. The bill allows participating or-
ganizations to provide grant aid to students
and, in the case of GEAR UP, to serve stu-
dents from seventh grade through high school
graduation.

It will improve the operation of our student
loan programs by making minor adjustments
to streamline some loan forbearances and to
conform the law to reflect current practices for
perfecting security interests. This bill will also
improve the Perkins Loan program by allowing
borrowers to rehabilitate loans by making a
single lump sum payment and by clarifying
that loans in deferment for a student that per-
forms service resulting in their cancellation are
reimbursed for interest as well.

Additionally, this legislation will improve the
regulatory process for schools and other pro-
gram participants. This is important, because
we continue to hear reports that the Depart-
ment does not give the public enough time to
comment on or to implement complex student
aid regulations. First, the bill will require the
Department of Education to allow a minimum
of 45 days for comment after the publication of
a Notice of Proposed Rule Making (NPRM).
Second, it prevents disclosure or reporting re-
quirements from becoming effective for at
least 180 days after the publication of final
regulations.

Finally, the bill we are introducing will clarify
and strengthen provisions in the Higher Edu-
cation Act regarding the return of federal funds
when students withdraw from school. Specifi-
cally, it will correct a Department interpretation
so that students will never be required to re-
turn more than 50 percent of the grant funds
they received. In addition, the bill will provide
students with a limited grace period for repay-
ment to help students who are unable to repay
immediately upon their withdrawal, and it will
set a minimum threshold for grant repayment
of $50. All of these steps will aid students who
postpone or withdraw for emergency or finan-
cial reasons.

Mr. Speaker, the legislation we are intro-
ducing is bipartisan. It has no cost, and it will
improve the implementation of the Higher Edu-
cation Amendments of 1998 which we worked
so hard to enact in the last Congress. I urge
every member of this body to support its pas-
sage.
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TRIBUTE TO SUSAN AND JOSEPH
PICHLER

HON. ROB PORTMAN
OF OHIO

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Friday, May 19, 2000
Mr. PORTMAN. Mr. Speaker, I pay tribute to

Joseph and Susan Pichler, good friends and

recipients of the Distinguished Service Citation
from the National Conference for Community
Justice (NCCJ) on May 25. They were se-
lected for this award for their personal and
professional qualities that have furthered the
cause of inter-group understanding in our
community.

Susan attended St. Mary’s College, where
she received a Bachelor of Arts in English. A
dedicated volunteer for many years, she has
done a great deal to improve inner-city edu-
cation. She is a strong supporter of the Junior
Great Books reading enrichment program, and
locally, she initiated this program at Wash-
ington Park School and St. Francis Seraph
School. While in Kansas, she worked with
Junior Great Books at St. John the Evangelist
Grade School; taught CCD (Confraternity of
Christian Doctrine) at Our Lady of Guadalupe;
initiated Junior Great Books at Avenue A
School; chaired the Hutchinson High School
Evaluation Committee for the School Board;
and served on the Parent Teacher Associa-
tion.

Currently, Susan is active with the National
Underground Railroad Freedom Center, serv-
ing as a member of the National Advisory
Board and the Board of Trustees. She also
serves on the Board of Trustees for St. Mary’s
College in Notre Dame, Indiana, and has
spent 10 years as a volunteer librarian at St.
Francis Seraph School.

Joe is Chairman of the Board and Chief Ex-
ecutive Officer at the Kroger Company, one of
America’s largest companies, and a company
that gives much to our community. He grad-
uated magna cum laude from Notre Dame
University, and went on to obtain his M.B.A.
and Ph.D. from the University of Chicago.

From 1968–1970, Joe served in the U.S.
Department of Labor. He also taught at the
University of Kansas School of Business for
15 years, and served as Dean from 1974–
1980.

Joe has been involved in a number of civic
and charitable activities. He is a former mem-
ber of the Board of Advisors with the Salvation
Army School for Officers Training. He is an
Honorary Lifetime Member of the University of
Kansas School of Fine Arts; a member of the
Catholic Commission on Intellectual and Cul-
tural Affairs; and a member of the Board of
Trustees of Tougaloo College in Mississippi.

Locally, Joe is Co-Chairman of the Greater
Cincinnati Scholarship Association; a member
of the Xavier University Board of Trustees; an
Advisory Member of the Cincinnati Opera; and
a member of the Advisory Board of the Cin-
cinnati Chapter of the Salvation Army.

Joe also is active as a member of the Board
of Directors of Federated Department Stores,
Inc., and Milacron, Inc. He is a member of the
Board at Catalyst; a member of the Business
Council; past Chairman of the National Alli-
ance of Business; and a member of the Cin-
cinnati Business Committee.

All of us in the Cincinnati area are grateful
to Susan and Joe for their numerous contribu-
tions to our community, and congratulate them
on receiving this prestigious NCCJ award.
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