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Benning, Georgia where he has served as the 
Equal Employment Manager ever since. Under 
his leadership, the office has been honored 
with numerous Department of the Army and 
Army Major Command awards, including three 
times Best EEO Program Management, Most 
Supportive EEO Officer, Best EEO Complaints 
Program Management, and four times Best 
EEO Program Activities. 

Mr. Dandy wears many hats, both in his line 
of work and out in the surrounding commu-
nities. He is a Certified Mediator, Race/Human 
Relations Trainer, and Small Group Facilitator. 
He is also an Ordained Baptist Deacon at his 
church, where he serves on the Trustee Board 
and sings in the Senior Gospel Choir. 

Mr. Dandy has served in various capacities 
including president and/or board member with 
the American Red Cross West Central Geor-
gia Chapter; Muscogee County Junior Mar-
shall’s Program; Greater Columbus Urban 
League and the League’s Guild Affiliate; An-
nual Black History Breakfast Committee; Na-
tional Association for the Advancement of Col-
ored People (NAACP); Columbus Consoli-
dated Government’s Personnel Review Board; 
Columbus Mayor’s Commission on Diversity; 
Columbus Times Newspaper Advisory Board; 
Lupus Foundation of America; Controller’s 
Civic and Social Club; and the American Can-
cer Society, Columbus Chapter’s Minority 
Task Force. 

On a personal note, I have been blessed 
over the years with Mr. Dandy’s longstanding 
friendship. He is one of the founding members 
of my Black History Observance Committee in 
Columbus, Georgia and I can personally attest 
to his strong commitment and enduring dedi-
cation to his country and his community. 

Mr. Dandy has certainly accomplished many 
things in his life but none of this would have 
been possible without the love and support of 
his wife Edith, their six children and twelve 
grandchildren. 

Mr. Speaker, today I ask my colleagues to 
join me, my wife, Vivian, and the more than 
700,000 people in Georgia’s 2nd Congres-
sional District in recognizing, commending and 
extending our sincerest appreciation to Mr. 
Ellis Dandy, a true jack of all trades, for his 
years of outstanding service to our nation and 
his dedication to serving his community. 
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HONORING THE 65TH ANNIVER-
SARY OF ARC OF ESSEX COUNTY 

HON. RODNEY P. FRELINGHUYSEN 
OF NEW JERSEY 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Mr. FRELINGHUYSEN. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to honor the ARC of Essex County, New 
Jersey as it celebrates its 65th Anniversary. 

When a group of dedicated parents, reli-
gious leaders and volunteers gathered in Sep-
tember of 1948 to create services for individ-
uals with developmental disabilities, they not 
only created a service that would benefit a 
community, but they formed a service that 
would change the lives of people development 
intellectual disabilities forever. With the efforts 
from these amazing individuals, came a place 
where people of all ages can grow comfortably 
and accomplish goals that would be very hard 
to attain otherwise. 

Today, the ARC of Essex County is a pri-
vate, non-profit agency serving people who 

live in and around the region and it is one of 
the pre-eminent organizations of its kind in the 
New York and New Jersey metropolitan area. 
The ARC provides resources to over 1,300 in-
dividuals and their families with both traditional 
and self-directed options. 

Offering a large number of programs, family 
resources and education outlets, the ARC is 
happy to individually tailor fit their programs to 
address the unique needs of each person and 
family. The group also allows for more tradi-
tional services such as Adult Day Care Serv-
ice and community service programs. Each of 
these programs has proven to be a valuable 
asset to everyone involved with the ARC. 

The dedication of the volunteers of the ARC 
is to be commended as well. Their work al-
lows the important programs and advocacy of 
the ARC to continue and be extraordinarily 
successful. These passionate volunteers are 
consistently providing services and assistance 
to individuals with intellectual and develop-
mental disabilities. 

Much of the success of the ARC of Essex 
County may be seen through its accomplish-
ments. Their educators, volunteers and staff 
have created opportunities for people with de-
velopmental disabled people that would have 
been unthinkable 65 years ago. 

Mr. Speaker, I rise today to honor the ARC 
of Essex County, New Jersey as it celebrates 
its 65th Anniversary. 
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RECOGNIZING SAN ANTONIO 
JOURNALIST MONICA NAVARRO 

HON. HENRY CUELLAR 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Mr. CUELLAR. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize San Antonio Journalist Monica 
Navarro, an award recipient of the San Anto-
nio Association of Hispanic Journalists—Henry 
Guerra Lifetime Achievement Award for Excel-
lence in Journalism. 

For 30 years, Monica has been a reporter 
and anchor for San Antonio’s Univision Chan-
nel 41, and her name has become synony-
mous with community news. Before joining 
Univision in 1983, she worked in Mexico City 
for seven years as a national sports reporter 
and anchor. A two-time Emmy Award winner, 
Monica was named the 2003 National Jour-
nalist of the Year by the Hispanic Media 
Awards. 

Over the years, she has reported on stories 
that have a direct impact into people’s lives, 
becoming a reliable source for Latino news. 
As a result of a California Endowment Health 
Journalism Fellowship at the University of 
Southern California, she produced an award 
winning four-part project titled, ‘‘El Peso de la 
Obesidad,’’ which focused on the impact of 
obesity and diabetes on the Latino community. 
She now has a crucial health segment in the 
newscast called ‘‘Reforma de Salud’’ to inform 
the Hispanic community about the recent 
health reform. 

I am honored and pleased to have had this 
time to recognize Monica Navarro on her ca-
reer and community involvement. She has 
contributed her time, knowledge, and efforts to 
journalism and to serving her community. 

A TRIBUTE TO MAYOR DANIEL 
EVANS 

HON. MIKE McINTYRE 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Mr. MCINTYRE. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
pay tribute to a truly outstanding North Caro-
linian, Mayor Daniel Evans, of Smithfield, 
North Carolina. Mayor Evans was elected to 
his post sixteen years ago and has since dedi-
cated himself wholly to bettering this great 
community. I ask you to join me in recognizing 
his long and honorable career. 

Mayor Evans’ hard work and leadership 
have been vital to the continual development 
of Smithfield. During Mayor Evans’ tenure, he 
has administered projects to fix water and 
sewer infrastructure in the East and South 
Smithfield and was instrumental in the expan-
sion of Neuse Charter School, an institution 
that has made a tremendous impact in the 
community since its opening in 2007. He has 
also been a great force for economic progress 
through his pivotal role in the development of 
innovative projects, such as the Smithfield 
Farmer’s Market, as well as securing lower 
energy prices for the citizens of Smithfield. All 
of these achievements have contributed to the 
growth of Smithfield. 

Mr. Speaker, even as Mayor Evans has 
dedicated many years of his life to solving the 
complex problems facing Smithfield, he has 
managed to remain openly accessible to its 
citizens. His enduring commitment to his com-
munity makes him an exemplary public serv-
ant, and his accomplishments will continue to 
benefit Eastern North Carolina for many years 
to come. As his time as Mayor of Smithfield 
comes to a close, let us honor Mayor Evans 
and pray that both he and his family may re-
ceive God’s richest blessings upon them. 
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AMERICORPS 20TH ANNIVERSARY 

HON. DAVID E. PRICE 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Mr. PRICE of North Carolina. Mr. Speaker, 
I rise today to recognize AmeriCorps on its 
20th anniversary. 

As a co-Chair of the National Service Cau-
cus, I am proud to recognize the hard work 
and dedication of the men and women who 
have served our nation through AmeriCorps. 

Since its inception in 1994, more than 
820,000 Americans have taken the 
AmeriCorps pledge, serving over one billion 
hours with more than 15,000 nonprofits, public 
agencies and faith-based organizations across 
America. In my home State of North Carolina, 
10,000 people will participate in one of hun-
dreds of AmeriCorps programs this year 
alone. 

Their common goal is to improve the lives of 
the American people, and they have done so 
immeasurably. Every day, these dedicated 
men and women work with community-based 
organizations to deliver services, address local 
needs, and deliver aid where it is needed 
most, and in innovative ways. They support 
and improve low-performing schools, build and 
renovate homes for low-income families, fight 
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poverty, expand access to health services, re-
build communities after disasters, and help 
veterans transition back to civilian life. 

Building on the service of individual 
AmeriCorps members, the AmeriCorps na-
tional program provides benefits far beyond 
the sum of its parts and multiplies a modest 
federal investment many times over. 

First, AmeriCorps members help tens of 
thousands of faith-based and community 
groups expand services, enhance their capac-
ity, raise funds, develop new partnerships, and 
create innovative, sustainable programs. In 
fact, AmeriCorps is the most effective multi-
plier of volunteers in service, with its members 
helping to recruit, train, and supervise more 
than 4 million volunteers in 2012. 

Along the way, AmeriCorps helps organiza-
tions leverage substantial private investment 
from businesses, foundations and other 
sources, thereby stretching our federal dollars 
and broadening the reach of the AmeriCorps 
mission. 

But our national service programs not only 
transform the lives of those who receive serv-
ices; they transform the lives of those who de-
liver them. Participants learn marketable skills 
and earn post-service education scholarships, 
which helps them jumpstart their careers and 
increase earning potential over the course of 
their professional careers. And AmeriCorps 
alums are also more involved in their commu-
nities and more likely than their peers to enter 
into a career of public service. 

This September is just the beginning of a 
year-long celebration of the extraordinary im-
pact AmeriCorps has had in its past twenty 
years. It is also a time to look ahead and to 
ensure AmeriCorps is poised for even greater 
impact in future years. 

To all of our remarkable AmeriCorps mem-
bers and alums, I want to personally thank 
you for your service and commend your efforts 
to help our local communities. And once 
again, I extend my congratulations to 
AmeriCorps on this twenty year anniversary 
and my excitement for what is to come. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. JANICE D. SCHAKOWSKY 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Ms. SCHAKOWSKY. Mr. Speaker, on roll-
call No. 462, had I been present, I would have 
voted ‘‘yes.’’ 
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CELEBRATING 100 YEARS OF 
SCOTT HIGH SCHOOL HISTORY 

HON. MARCY KAPTUR 
OF OHIO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Ms. KAPTUR. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize a milestone in the life of one of the 
oldest high schools in our district. Toledo’s 
Scott High School celebrates its 100th birth-
day this month. 

When young Toledoans in the first decade 
of the last century began to outgrow the 
former Central High School, construction on 
two new schools began: Morrison Waite High 

School on Toledo’s East Side and Jessup W. 
Scott High School on Toledo’s West Side. 
Scott High School was named for a mid-19th 
century Toledo Blade newspaper editor who 
was a well-known civic leader and philan-
thropist. Eight thousand people reportedly at-
tended Scott High School’s dedication cere-
mony and 1,193 students were enrolled on 
that first day of classes, September 8, 1913. 

From the start and through the decades, 
Scott High School was a sports powerhouse. 
Many of its alumni have gone on to profes-
sional careers and even the Olympics. Scott 
and Waite High Schools have been friendly ri-
vals from the start. Beginning in 1914 until 
1963, the two schools came together in an an-
nual Thanksgiving Day match up which gen-
erated interest far beyond the bounds of To-
ledo. Perhaps even more famous than its 
sports teams, Scott is also known for its inter-
nationally known marching band the ‘‘Fantastic 
Dancing Machines.’’ Truly one of the premier 
marching bands in the Midwest, the band has 
won many awards in band competitions 
throughout the United States and has per-
formed all over the country. With a fine music 
tradition, Scott High School boasts famed jazz 
pianist Art Tatum among its illustrious alumni. 

Scott High School’s alumni are proud of 
their roots, proud of their traditions, and proud 
of their school. Many graduates live in Toledo 
and have made their mark in our hometown. 
As they look back with fondness on school 
days gone by and reminisce at the passage of 
100 years, so too they look forward with hope 
to new accomplishments in the century to 
come. 
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IN HONOR OF DR. LAWRENCE J. 
SCHWEINHART FOR HIS EXCEP-
TIONAL DEDICATION TO EARLY 
CHILDHOOD EDUCATION 

HON. JOHN D. DINGELL 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Mr. DINGELL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor Dr. Lawrence J. Schweinhart, president 
of the HighScope Educational Research Foun-
dation, who retires next month after nearly 40 
years of exceptional service to the organiza-
tion and a career of commitment to early child-
hood education. 

Dr. Schweinhart has made the economic 
and social benefits of high quality preschool 
programs well known to educators, research-
ers, legislators, philanthropic organizations, 
parents, and the general public worldwide 
while demonstrating extraordinary leadership 
through his service on local, state, national, 
and international boards and policymaking 
committees 

He has provided an example of ethics and 
integrity the public seeks in those who serve 
as role models for young children and the 
people who care for them and has brought the 
highest standards of research and practice to 
the field of early childhood education. Dr. 
Schweinhart has simultaneously earned the 
esteem and affection of long-time colleagues 
and inspired a new generation of early child-
hood educators. 

After a professional lifetime of securing ac-
tive participatory learning for children through-
out the country and around the world, he is re-

tiring on October 31, 2013. I honor Lawrence 
for all he has done for the education commu-
nity and for children. Please join me in thank-
ing Lawrence for his unparalleled leadership. 
We wish him well in his retirement. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. ALLYSON Y. SCHWARTZ 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Ms. SCHWARTZ. Mr. Speaker, on rollcall 
No. 461, I was unable to be present for the 
vote on H.R. 2449. Had I been present, I 
would have voted ‘‘yes.’’ 

f 

HONORING DR. MARTY 
FENSTERSHEIB 

HON. MICHAEL M. HONDA 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Mr. HONDA. Mr. Speaker, I rise today with 
my colleagues from California, the Honorable 
ANNA G. ESHOO and the Honorable ZOE LOF-
GREN to express our most sincere congratula-
tions to Dr. Marty Fenstersheib, who is retiring 
after a 30-year career with the Santa Clara 
county government. 

Dr. Fenstersheib is a Board Certified Pedia-
trician who trained in Philadelphia, Pennsyl-
vania and at the Milwaukee Children’s Hos-
pital in Wisconsin, and was in private practice 
in Greensboro, North Carolina. He received 
his Masters in Public Health from the Univer-
sity of California, Berkeley and became Board 
Certified in Public Health and Preventative 
Medicine. 

Throughout his career in medicine and pub-
lic health, Dr. Fenstersheib has shown an ar-
dent commitment to underserved communities. 
He has worked with the Well Baby Clinics in 
San Francisco’s Mission District; La Clinica, a 
migrant workers’ clinic in Watsonville; and with 
Luchesa Migrant Workers Camp in Gilroy. 

Dr. Fenstersheib began his career with the 
Santa Clara County Public Health Department 
in 1984 as both the Medical Director of the im-
munization program and as a pediatric clini-
cian for the Department’s Refugee Health Pro-
gram. In 1994, he became the Health Officer 
for Santa Clara County and held that position 
until his retirement. 

Dr. Fenstersheib founded the first HIV Early 
Intervention Clinical Program in California in 
1987. This program became the model for the 
State of California and led to the establish-
ment and funding of more than two dozen 
similar clinics in California. Additionally, Dr. 
Fenstersheib was at the forefront of combating 
the AIDS epidemic and served as a clinician 
caring for HIV infected persons for more than 
27 years. Drs. Fenstersheib and Robert 
Frascino co-chaired the annual community 
education seminar on HIV in Santa Clara 
County for 11 years. Through these seminars, 
they provided healthcare professionals and 
patients with current information on HIV. 

Community involvement and engagement 
were hallmarks of Dr. Fenstersheib’s career, 
as evidenced by the numerous boards and 
leadership positions he served on in Santa 
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