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that died crossing the border because 
they want a better life for themselves. 
Those are the strangers. We are going 
to be judged on how we treat them. So 
we have an opportunity here. 

But also, stepping apart from that, 
people say, But it’s illegal, what 
they’ve done is illegal. You know, the 
law is interesting. I happen to be a law-
yer. There are two ways to look at the 
law. There’s the law that says it’s 
malum per se—it’s bad or evil in itself. 
Malum per se in itself. Murder is 
malum per se. It’s always evil, it’s al-
ways wrong to kill. 

On the other side you have malum 
prohibitum. What is malum 
prohibitum? Malum prohibitum means 
it’s bad or wrong or illegal because we 
prohibit it. For example, if you drive 56 
miles an hour in a 55-mile-an-hour 
zone, you’ve broken the law. Have you 
done anything illegal? Yes, you have. 
Have you done anything immoral? No. 
The road was built to go faster than 
that, your car was, the brakes are 
good. You violated the law. What do we 
often do? In fact we change the law and 
we say 55 miles an hour doesn’t make 
any sense. We change it to 60 or 65 or 
70. I’ve been through Texas; now it’s 75 
there. I’m from California. We only 
have 70. Why? Because the law doesn’t 
make any sense. 

Our immigration law doesn’t make 
any sense. So, yes, they’ve broken the 
law, but a law that doesn’t make any 
sense. Let’s change the law. Let’s open 
our hearts. Let’s take this Bible and 
let’s take a look and see what it says 
to us. What it will say is this: that how 
we treat the stranger is how we are 
going to be judged as a Nation. 
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UNTREATED MENTAL ILLNESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Pennsylvania (Mr. MURPHY) for 5 min-
utes. 

Mr. MURPHY of Pennsylvania. While 
the Senate argues about gun issues and 
talking about what is in the hands of 
those perpetrators who commit hei-
nous crimes, I want to talk about 
America’s shameful secret that people 
don’t want to be talking about, and 
that is our willful ignoring of dealing 
with mental illness. We have to start 
talking about not what is in people’s 
hands, but what is in their hearts and 
minds. 

Approximately 5 percent of individ-
uals with schizophrenia will die by sui-
cide during their lifetime, a rate 50-fold 
greater than the general population. 
Keep in mind now suicide has over-
taken all other areas of accidental 
deaths. It is now the leading cause of 
death by injury, about 38,000 per year. 

We understand that mental disorders 
are brain disorders with specific sys-
tems that are rooted in abnormal pat-
terns of brain activity. Many of those 
with psychosis show up between ages 14 
and 25 when there are changes occur-
ring in the branching and pruning of 
brain cells. Yet, there is a delay be-

tween the first episode of psychosis and 
the onset of treatment with an average 
of 110 weeks before someone gets care. 
There are 100,000 young Americans who 
will have a first episode of psychosis 
this year and will join over 2 million 
others with schizophrenia. 

Look at this: one-sixth of murderers 
in prison are mentally ill. Here are 
some other quick facts. The number of 
murders in the U.S. in 2011 committed 
with rifles: 323. In 2011, more murders 
were committed with knives: 1,694; 
hands, fist and feet: 728; and blunt 
weapons such as clubs and hammers: 
496, according to FBI data. 

A while ago I sent a letter to Sec-
retary Sebelius, the Secretary of HHS, 
seeking clarification of the laws of con-
fidentiality known as HIPAA, specifi-
cally asking why we have not loaded 
1.5 million more records into the Na-
tional Instant Criminal Background 
Check System so that these people can-
not purchase guns. I hope the Sec-
retary will respond soon. 

Recently, I also handed a note to the 
President of the United States and will 
continue to pursue questions with the 
Government Accountability Office, 
asking where are we spending our 
money and is it effective in going to 
help those with mental illness and se-
vere mental illness. We simply don’t 
know. 

In the United States, an estimated 
11.4 million Americans, or about 4.4 
percent of all adults, suffer from seri-
ous mental illness. What happens is 
that States in many cases do not sub-
mit those records to the National In-
stant Criminal Background Check Sys-
tem. There are many States that 
haven’t submitted any at all, and this 
is a problem because people who should 
not be purchasing weapons are. 

But underlying all of this, we had 
better take off our blinders and deal 
with the underlying root cause of mass 
violence: untreated mental illness. 
Look at yesterday in the news when a 
man went on a campus and attacked 
people with a knife. Look at the other 
shootings that have taken place by 
people with untreated or undertreated 
mental illness. Why aren’t we talking 
about our action on those? 

Our current system is especially fall-
ing short for those with a serious men-
tal disorder who deny they’re ill. Half 
of those persons with severe psychosis 
don’t even understand they have men-
tal illness. They refuse their medica-
tion or simply cannot function in a 
community setting. So what have we 
done historically in this country? 
We’ve burned them as witches, we im-
prison them as dangerous. We still 
have not dealt with the underlying 
needs. 

There were 500,000 psychiatric beds in 
1955. There are 40,000 now. We have a 
lack of long-term treatment options. 
There are gaps in the care for young 
adults. There are artificial limits and 
barriers to care under insurance. Four 
years ago plus we passed a mental 
health parity law, and we still do not 
have the regulations for that. 

Parents who are not informed and 
cannot get their children help or treat-
ment is another problem with HIPAA 
laws and the Family Educational 
Rights and Privacy Act, which creates 
barriers between parents knowing what 
is going on with their children in 
school when they have a severe mental 
illness. Of course, there is the stigma 
of acknowledging there is a problem or 
getting treatment. 

Politicians refer to those committing 
these murders as evil, as monsters. Tel-
evision shows where there’s tragedy or 
comedy mock them. This is not the 
way to deal with the underlying prob-
lem. We have a shortage of psycholo-
gists and psychiatrists throughout this 
country and in the military as well, 
where suicides have overtaken combat 
as the number one cause of death. 

I am asking for an audit from the 
Government Accountability Office of 
every single penny spent on mental ill-
ness diagnosis, research, and treatment 
throughout our government, through 
HHS, through the judiciary, through 
Labor, every branch. We need to know 
these answers. It is a shameful secret 
in this country that we still refuse to 
deal with mental illness. And if we do 
not, shame on us. 
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CONGRATULATIONS TO THE WIN-
NERS OF THE C–SPAN STUDENT 
DOCUMENTARY CONTEST 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 

Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Georgia (Mr. JOHNSON) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. JOHNSON of Georgia. Mr. Speak-
er, most Americans watching these 
proceedings today are watching them 
on C–SPAN. C–SPAN is a public service 
that was created by the cable industry 
in 1979 to carry our House proceedings 
and other public affairs programming. 
It’s carried in my district by DirecTV, 
Comcast, and the DISH Network. 

I won’t bore you with all of the con-
tent that appears on C–SPAN. Some is 
very interesting and some is not. Nev-
ertheless, every year C–SPAN holds a 
student documentary contest for mid-
dle school and high school students. 

Today, I am proud to announce that 
one of my constituents, a young man 
named Samuel Gladden, a 10th grade 
student at Miller Grove High School in 
Lithonia, received $250 for his honor-
able mention documentary: ‘‘Edu-
cation: The Greatest Common Factor,’’ 
about how education is related to the 
economy. 

I also want to congratulate Mr. Zach 
Cohen, a seventh grade student at the 
Alfred & Adele Davis Academy in 
Sandy Springs, Georgia, who received 
$1,500 for the second prize, a documen-
tary entitled: ‘‘Education: Take a 
Spin,’’ which is about education in the 
United States of America. He inter-
viewed me for this piece, and I want to 
thank him for doing that. 

I want to congratulate both Zach and 
Samuel for winning these prizes out of 
nearly 2,000 entries. 
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You can see these and other winning 

videos at studentcam.org. I would en-
courage everybody, once you finish 
watching C–SPAN, to go to 
studentcam.org. It will captivate you 
to see what these young students have 
done and to listen to their views on 
education and on how our future will 
be affected by either our investment in 
education or in our desire not to do 
that. 
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SECURITY IN ENERGY AND 
MANUFACTURING ACT 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentlewoman from 
Arizona (Ms. SINEMA) for 5 minutes. 

Ms. SINEMA. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to introduce the Security in En-
ergy and Manufacturing Act of 2013. 

This bill will extend the Advanced 
Energy Manufacturing Tax Credit pro-
gram. The program provides a 30 per-
cent tax credit, or a grant in lieu of a 
tax credit, to companies that are con-
structing, expanding, or retrofitting 
their facilities that manufacture re-
newable energy. 

We have seen our manufacturing base 
erode as a result of increased global 
competition. Not only will the SEAM 
Act help us rebuild our manufacturing 
industry; it will also provide an oppor-
tunity to do so while exploring respon-
sible energy production. Energy inno-
vation is quickly becoming one of the 
world’s largest industries; and coun-
tries all over the world are purchasing 
billions of dollars’ worth of wind tur-
bines, solar panels and other green 
technologies. I want to see these prod-
ucts made in the United States and for 
our country to remain competitive. 

We know this program works. The 
first allocation of funding was ex-
tremely successful in leveraging pri-
vate capital, and that led to the invest-
ment of over 180 energy manufacturing 
facilities across 43 States in our coun-
try. The number of wind turbines and 
their workable components made in 
the U.S. has more than doubled since 
then, and that is just one aspect of the 
renewable energy field. 

Expanding this program also means 
creating additional high-tech, high- 
wage manufacturing jobs in our own 
backyard. Companies like Tempe’s 
Monarch Power could expand and in-
crease the creation of innovative prod-
ucts, ranging from energy generation 
to energy storage, even a mobile re-
newable power system—all while re-
maining affordable. We must partner 
the power of American innovation with 
the potential of American production. 
My bill encourages just that. 

In my home State of Arizona, renew-
able energy enjoys broad bipartisan 
support. Democrats and Republicans, 
including Barry Goldwater, Jr. and our 
own Governor, Jan Brewer, have advo-
cated for solar and renewable energy 
because they know that the future of 
our State and the future of our country 
depend on it. I stand today with a 
broad coalition of leaders from my 

State who have a long history of sup-
porting energy innovation as a smart 
investment for America. 

We have the opportunity to restore 
U.S. manufacturing jobs, to help our 
country remain competitive in the 
manufacturing industry and to invest 
in a wide range of clean energy produc-
tion. I ask that the body join me in 
supporting the SEAM Act of 2013. 

f 

RECESS 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-

ant to clause 12(a) of rule I, the Chair 
declares the House in recess until noon 
today. 

Accordingly (at 10 o’clock and 56 
minutes a.m.), the House stood in re-
cess. 

f 
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AFTER RECESS 
The recess having expired, the House 

was called to order by the Speaker at 
noon. 

f 

PRAYER 
The Chaplain, the Reverend Patrick 

J. Conroy, offered the following prayer: 
Eternal God, we give You thanks for 

giving us another day. 
The Members of Congress are power-

ful people. Their words bear weight and 
their positions before the people de-
serve respect. Therefore, they need to 
be steeled from arrogance on one side 
and casual routine on the other. 

Lord, only the two-edged sword of 
Your Word and Your purity of Spirit 
can bring freshness to their spirits and 
confirming hope to their constituents. 
Strengthen their pledge to uphold the 
Constitution against blatant and sub-
tle attacks and to serve the people 
with all their hearts. 

Then may their speech, their deci-
sions, and their working together with-
in the pluralism of this democracy be 
for Your greater honor and glory. 

Amen. 
f 

THE JOURNAL 
The SPEAKER. The Chair has exam-

ined the Journal of the last day’s pro-
ceedings and announces to the House 
his approval thereof. 

Pursuant to clause 1, rule I, the Jour-
nal stands approved. 

f 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
The SPEAKER. Will the gentle-

woman from Hawaii (Ms. GABBARD) 
come forward and lead the House in the 
Pledge of Allegiance. 

Ms. GABBARD led the Pledge of Alle-
giance as follows: 

I pledge allegiance to the Flag of the 
United States of America, and to the Repub-
lic for which it stands, one nation under God, 
indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 

f 

MESSAGE FROM THE PRESIDENT 
A message in writing from the Presi-

dent of the United States was commu-

nicated to the House by Mr. Brian 
Pate, one of his secretaries. 

f 

ANNOUNCEMENT BY THE SPEAKER 

The SPEAKER. The Chair will enter-
tain up to 15 requests for 1-minute 
speeches on each side of the aisle. 

f 

GUN VIOLENCE 

(Mr. JOHNSON of Ohio asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute and to revise and 
extend his remarks.) 

Mr. JOHNSON of Ohio. Mr. Speaker, 
we all want to prevent gun violence, 
but anything we do must start by re-
specting the Second Amendment. 

Sadly, a Member of this House ig-
nored that constitutional right last 
week. She claimed that banning cer-
tain kinds of gun magazines would 
somehow stop killers from killing. She 
actually said that if Congress would 
ban gun magazines, they will simply 
disappear as they’re used up. Of course, 
that’s not true. You see, gun magazines 
are reloadable, much like a stapler. 

Mr. Speaker, I hope I can be an asset 
to my colleagues who may not know 
how guns work. As a gun owner and an 
Air Force veteran myself, I’ve actually 
exercised my Second Amendment 
rights. Perhaps those of us who under-
stand the subject matter should lead 
the effort to stop gun violence. 

My colleague’s poor understanding of 
guns will lead to poor policy. Here’s 
some reading material to help bring 
her up to speed. It’s called the Second 
Amendment. It says, ‘‘The right of the 
people to keep and bear arms shall not 
be infringed.’’ 

f 

THE PRESIDENT’S BUDGET 

(Ms. JACKSON LEE asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Ms. JACKSON LEE. Mr. Speaker, I 
too adhere to the Second Amendment, 
as all of us do. I can assure the gen-
tleman that anything we do with sen-
sible gun legislation that will protect 
the lives of babies whose lives were lost 
in Newtown and Aurora and Virginia 
Tech and Columbine will be fair and 
just. I hope my colleagues in the Sen-
ate will hear from those of us who are 
sending him a letter: no filibuster, but 
real gun-sensible legislation. 

Let me turn to the budget and indi-
cate that it is important that we rid 
ourselves of the sequester and ask the 
Speaker to put on the floor H.R. 900. I 
think it is good that the President has 
saved dollars out of the Iraq and Af-
ghan war of over $1 billion and pro-
vided security for embassies and $222 
million for gun legislation enforce-
ment, but we must not have to change 
CPI. 

Many people don’t realize that in this 
instance of Social Security seniors are 
paying more money for health care. 
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