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to work with the Town and Caroline County 
extensively, leading to a seamless transition 
into the Town Manager position. 

Stephen holds a Bachelor of Arts Degree in 
Sociology from Pennsylvania State University 
and a Degree of Master of City and Regional 
Planning from Rutgers University. He has also 
completed extensive graduate work in the 
Master of Public Administration program at 
Virginia Commonwealth University. 

Mr. Manster’s commitment to public service 
demonstrates a rare sense of dedication to 
duty, and I am pleased to recognize this spe-
cial occasion. Mr. Speaker, I ask you to join 
me in celebrating the career of Mr. Stephen 
Manster. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF CAMERON D. 
CLARKE, 2017 RHODES SCHOLAR 

HON. ROBERT C. ‘‘BOBBY’’ SCOTT 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mr. SCOTT of Virginia. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today with great pride to recognize Cameron 
D. Clarke, a Howard University senior major-
ing in biology and community health, who was 
awarded a prestigious Rhodes Scholarship for 
2017. Mr. Clarke lives in Richmond, Virginia 
and is the fourth student from Howard Univer-
sity to have received this honor. 

While attending Howard University, Mr. 
Clarke engaged in research at the University’s 
W. Montague Cobb Research Laboratory, 
which maintains a national repository for Afri-
can-American skeletal remains. Mr. Clarke 
also participated in research at Bahir Dar Uni-
versity in Ethiopia through a Howard Univer-
sity-National Science Foundation grant. As an 
Amgen Scholar, he conducted research at the 
National Institutes of Health’s Center for Can-
cer Research. Mr. Clarke is a certified emer-
gency medical technician (EMT) and is the 
lead author on five out of six publications. He 
is co-president of Howard University’s chapter 
of the Peer Health Exchange and a news edi-
tor of The Hilltop, the Howard University stu-
dent newspaper. Currently, Mr. Clarke is 
among our own here on Capitol Hill as he is 
an intern for the U.S. House Committee on 
Science, Space, and Technology. 

Mr. Clarke is one of 32 men and women se-
lected from U.S. postsecondary institutions 
who competed with over 800 applicants to re-
ceive this award to study at the University of 
Oxford in England. With his Rhodes scholar-
ship, Mr. Clarke intends to further his studies 
by pursuing a Master of Science degree with 
an emphasis in primary health care. Ulti-
mately, Mr. Clarke wants to attend medical 
school and work in public health policy and 
clinical research. 

‘‘We are extremely proud of Mr. Clarke’s ac-
complishments,’’ said Dr. Wayne Frederick, 
President of Howard University. ‘‘Mr. Clarke’s 
academic pursuits will lead to solutions in the 
broader society that are needed ever more so 
today. Cameron is the epitome of Howard Uni-
versity’s gift of solutions to the world.’’ His 
achievements demonstrate what a person 
committed to excellence in truth and service 
can obtain when provided the opportunity. He 
exemplifies the best of Howard University and 
the Commonwealth of Virginia. 

I ask my colleagues in the U.S. House of 
Representatives to join me in congratulating 

Mr. Cameron D. Clarke for his impressive aca-
demic achievements and being selected as 
one of America’s Rhodes Scholarship winners. 
It is with honor that I call attention to this out-
standing young man’s achievements. May he 
continue to obtain the success for which he 
works hard and may he always find purpose 
and fulfillment in his efforts. 
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HONORING ESTHER LOUISE HILL 
ON THE OCCASION OF HER 100TH 
BIRTHDAY 

HON. BLAINE LUETKEMEYER 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mr. LUETKEMEYER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to honor Esther Louise Hill. She cele-
brated her 100th birthday on Sunday, Decem-
ber 4th, 2016. 

Esther Louise Hill was born in Montgomery 
City, Missouri on December 4, 1916 to Roy 
and Emma Patterson. She has lived in 
Jonesburg, Missouri most of her life. Esther 
married Richard Hill, who is now deceased. 
She graduated from a three-year program in 
1938 from Missouri Baptist Hospital School of 
Nursing as a registered nurse. 

Her work experiences were in various divi-
sions of healthcare: hospitals, industry, and 
public health. Esther started her career as a 
private duty nurse and after a year decided to 
join the Barnes Hospital Nursing Staff. Before 
World War II started, Esther moved to Dallas, 
Texas. She utilized her nursing degree by 
working at a substation with North American 
Aviation during the war. After the end of the 
war, Esther moved back to Missouri and 
joined the staff at a local nursing home, Katy 
Jane, located in Warrenton, Missouri. Unfortu-
nately, during her time at Katy Jane, there 
was a devastating fire which had a profound 
effect on Esther. Esther started working as a 
public health nurse through the state of Mis-
souri, first in Warren County and then moving 
to Montgomery County. She was moved by 
the loss of life at Katy Jane and realized com-
monsense steps could have prevented that 
tragedy. 

Eventually, Esther obtained the position of 
Institutional Advisory Nurse, covering fifteen 
counties along the Missouri River. In this posi-
tion, Esther taught nursing home caregivers 
the details of Missouri state law and proce-
dures that should be part of nursing home 
care. The Institutional Advisory Nurse position 
led to a role with the Missouri Department of 
Health Licensure Program for Nursing Homes. 
With this position, she taught, investigated and 
inspected nursing home facilities, and en-
forced licensure laws. Esther worked for the 
Visiting Nurse Association for a few years but 
eventually returned to the Missouri Depart-
ment of Health. She ended her nursing career 
with the Missouri Department of Health. Esther 
appreciates the opportunity she was given to 
have a career that came full circle; from her 
days at the Katy Jane Nursing Home where 
lack of structure allowed for a tragedy, to 
being involved with the adoption of solutions 
to protect the most vulnerable. In addition to 
her successful career in nursing, Esther also 
taught at Tulane University in New Orleans, 
Louisiana. Esther has been a lifelong member 
of the Jonesburg United Methodist Church and 

during her time there has enjoyed participating 
in the Methodist Women organization. In her 
spare time, she enjoys reading, collecting an-
tiques, cooking, and canning produce from her 
garden. She also has a passion for hybridized 
lilies and has even won prizes for them. Es-
ther enjoys a good card game and has been 
a member of the Canasta Card Club for 50 
years. 

Please join me in recognizing Esther Louise 
Hill on the occasion of her 100th birthday. 
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IN HONOR OF BULLOCK COUNTY, 
ALABAMA UPON THE 150TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF ITS FOUNDING 

HON. MARTHA ROBY 
OF ALABAMA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mrs. ROBY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor Bullock County, Alabama which today is 
celebrating 150 years as a county. 

What is now Bullock County was first inhab-
ited by Creek Indians who moved westward 
from Georgia and began cultivating the rich, 
spring-filled land. After the bitter Creek War, 
American settlers brought schools, churches, 
and mercantile life to complement the thriving 
agriculture, and the town of Union Springs 
was born. 

After the Civil War, portions of Macon, 
Montgomery, Barbour and Pike Counties were 
brought together to form Bullock County, after 
Confederate Colonel E.C. Bullock. The late 
1800s and early 1900s were prosperous for 
Bullock County, as railroad connections and 
industrialization made the county seat of 
Union Springs an important hub for Alabama 
and the South. 

That history can still be seen in Bullock 
County today. The National Register of His-
toric Places, lists 47 homes and businesses 
that have been preserved as standing monu-
ments to the past. 

One hundred and fifty years after its found-
ing, Bullock County is home to fine, hard-
working people that I am proud to represent in 
Congress. 

Mr. Speaker, it is my privilege to acknowl-
edge Bullock County’s sesquicentennial anni-
versary and celebrate this special date with all 
those who call Bullock County home. 

f 

HONORING SUPERINTENDENT JAY 
SPECK 

HON. MIKE THOMPSON 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mr. THOMPSON of California. Mr. Speaker, 
I rise, along with Congressman JOHN 
GARAMENDI, today to recognize and honor Jay 
Speck who is retiring after forty years of serv-
ice to our community as an educator and ad-
ministrator with the Solano County Office of 
Education. 

Mr. Speck began his career in education as 
a special education teacher at the elementary 
and secondary levels and has since worked 
with Solano County as a program manager, 
principal, director of special education, and as-
sistant superintendent of human resources. 
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Mr. Speck has served as an outstanding edu-
cator and leader in our community and dem-
onstrates a unique and experienced under-
standing of our community’s needs. He was 
sworn in for his first term as County Super-
intendent on January 3, 2011 and was re- 
elected and sworn in for his second term on 
January 5, 2015. Mr. Speck is known for his 
fair-mindedness and his strong belief in the 
potential of each individual student to learn 
and develop academically. 

During his career, Mr. Speck pursued train-
ing in interest-based problem solving and col-
lective bargaining to enhance his skills as a 
trusted leader, highly skilled problem-solver, 
and ardent collaborator. Mr. Speck has a solid 
educational foundation with a Bachelor of Arts 
degree from the University of California, Davis 
and holds teaching credentials from both Cali-
fornia State University, Los Angeles and Cali-
fornia State University, Sacramento. Mr. 
Speck has represented Solano County public 
schools as a member of many organizations 
including the California County Superintend-
ents Educational Services Association, the As-
sociation of California School Administrators 
and the Workforce Investment Board. 

Mr. Speaker, Superintendent Jay Speck has 
served our community with admirable leader-
ship and dedication for forty years. It is fitting 
and proper that we honor him here today and 
extend our best wishes for an enjoyable retire-
ment. 

f 

HONORING JIM HARRIS OF 
WAUSAU, WI FOR HIS SERVICE 
TO OTHERS 

HON. SEAN P. DUFFY 
OF WISCONSIN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mr. DUFFY. Mr. Speaker, I am honored to 
stand before you today to recognize Mr. Jim 
Harris of Wausau, Wisconsin for his excep-
tional service to others. 

Mr. Harris worked for more than 30 years in 
education. First, as a teacher in the Wisconsin 
Indian Teacher Corps, where he taught chil-
dren of the Ho Chunk Tribe, and later as one 
of the first male kindergarten teachers in Wis-
consin. Along his journey in education, Mr. 
Harris also spent two decades as a school ad-
ministrator and an activist for public health. 

During his many years of service in edu-
cation, Mr. Harris got to know the children of 
Hmong Refugees who fled war in their home 
country to seek a better life in Wisconsin. Our 
state has a vibrant Hmong community that Mr. 
Harris has grown close to. He founded We 
Help War Victims, a nonprofit organization, 
with his wife, Marty, also a public school edu-
cator. Founded over 30 years ago, We Help 
War Victims has been working with refugee 
families in the Wausau, Wisconsin area, pro-
viding dozens of Lao schools with their first li-
braries, and helping families receive access to 
medical care. 

Since 2006, his organization has been work-
ing with villagers in Laos to destroy land 
mines, bombs, rockets, mortars, and other 
unexploded ordnance. Mr. Harris’ example di-
rectly inspired me to fight for this cause in 
Congress and his advice has directly affected 
the focus of my efforts. Countless farmers and 
families across Laos live in safer communities 

because of Mr. Harris’ work and my commu-
nity in Wisconsin has been strengthened by 
the work he and his wife do through We Help 
War Victims. 

Mr. Speaker, please join me today to con-
gratulate Mr. Harris on his accomplishments 
and work on behalf of others. His selfless de-
meanor in which he answers the call to serve 
in our district is truly valued. 

f 

IN HONOR OF SERGEANT 1ST 
CLASS JOHN MIMS 

HON. RICHARD HUDSON 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mr. HUDSON. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor the life and legacy of Sergeant 1st 
Class John Mims of the 82nd Airborne Divi-
sion, a World War II veteran and Bataan 
Death March survivor who passed away on 
Sunday, November 27, 2016. Sergeant Mims 
was a true American hero and our thoughts 
and prayers go out to his friends and family as 
they mourn the loss of this great man. 

When his country needed him the most, it 
was John Mims who answered the call to 
serve our great nation. After losing his father 
when he was young, Mims lied about his age 
in order to join the Army. At the age of 15, 
Mims served for nearly a year before the Army 
discovered his true age and discharged him. 
However, a few short years later Mims re-en-
listed in the Army and headed out to the Phil-
ippines to begin his training. 

After a year in the Philippines, Mims fought 
alongside his brothers in arms in the Battle of 
Bataan which culminated in the surrender of 
75,000 allied soldiers. The men were then 
forced to march 65 miles, without food or 
water, to a prisoner-of-war camp in the Tarlac 
Province in what became known as the Ba-
taan Death March. One of the greatest atroc-
ities of the entire war, the men suffered beat-
ings, endured torture, and witnessed unimagi-
nable horrors as he faced what can only be 
described as a living hell. In total more than 
10,000 men died during the trek. 

Following the war, Mims continued his serv-
ice in the Army, returning to Japan from 1952 
to 1954 as sergeant in charge of the Tokyo 
Quartermaster Depot. After he retired in 1963, 
he returned home where he worked in a rug 
factory and a curtain company. Living in Aber-
deen, North Carolina, he became an advocate 
for other veterans and was a constant pres-
ence at ceremonies remembering his fallen 
comrades. His work in the community made 
certain that the memories of those lost were 
not forgotten, and it is that legacy which we 
celebrate today. While we may have lost this 
great man, his legacy will live on and we will 
never forget the sacrifices made by Sergeant 
Mims or any of those who fought to protect 
our freedoms against unimaginable dangers. 

Mr. Speaker, please join me today in com-
memorating the life of Sergeant 1st Class 
John Mims for his service to God and country. 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. KEITH ELLISON 
OF MINNESOTA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Monday, December 5, 2016 

Mr. ELLISON. Mr. Speaker, due to other 
commitments, I missed the following roll call 
votes; had I been present, I would have voted 
as follows: 

Roll call no. 594. I would have voted no. 
Roll call no. 595. I would have voted no. 
Roll call no. 596. I would have voted no. 
Roll call no. 597. I would have vote no. 
Roll call no. 598. I would have voted yes. 
Roll call no. 599. I would have voted no. 
Roll call no. 600. I would have voted no. 

f 

HONORING MR. JOHN SUTTER 

HON. BARBARA LEE 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Monday, December 5, 2016 

Ms. LEE. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to cele-
brate the remarkable life and career of Mr. 
John Sutter, and to congratulate him on his re-
tirement from the Board of Directors of the 
East Bay Regional Park District. 

As an outdoor enthusiast and lifelong resi-
dent of Oakland, California, John’s life has 
been dedicated to preserving and protecting 
the environment of California’s Bay Area. 
Throughout his sixty years in public service, 
he has been involved in the conservation of 
over 35,000 acres of land. 

John’s career in public service began in 
1954 when he became an Alameda County 
deputy district attorney. He stayed in this posi-
tion until 1965, when he was appointed to the 
Bay Conservation and Development Commis-
sion (BCDC) by Governor Pat Brown. 

John also served as a member of Oakland’s 
City Council for over a decade from 1971– 
1982, twice holding the position of vice mayor. 

In 1982, John was appointed by Governor 
Jerry Brown to serve as a judge on the Ala-
meda County Superior Court. He remained a 
judge for 14 years until his election in 1996 to 
the East Bay Regional Park District Board of 
Directors. 

Over John’s illustrious career, he has been 
directly involved in a variety of community 
projects and organizations with special em-
phasis on preserving the natural environment 
of the Bay Area. 

In the 1950s he was prominently involved in 
the protection of the San Pablo Reservoir and 
the foundation of the Martin Luther King, Jr. 
Regional Shoreline. In 1961, John was the 
leader in the campaign that preserved Oak-
land’s Snow Park. 

In addition to his elected and appointed po-
sitions, John was a founding board member of 
the Greenbelt Alliance; and he has served as 
a board member for the Alameda County Solid 
Waste Management Authority, Oakland Char-
ter Revision Committee, Oakland Cultural Af-
fairs Commission, Chabot Space and Science 
Center, Save the Bay, Alameda County Bar 
Association, California Democratic Council, 
Oakland Citizens Committee for Urban Re-
newal, and the Metropolitan YMCA. 

On behalf of the residents of California’s 
13th Congressional District, I wish to congratu-
late Mr. John Sutter on a well-deserved retire-
ment, and thank him for his many years of 
service to our community. 
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