
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — Extensions of Remarks E239 February 26, 2016 
The Lorussos have been active members of 

the Falmouth, Massachusetts community, giv-
ing back to the education system in the com-
munity since 1980. Mrs. Lorusso discovered 
her passion for supporting our schools and 
teachers when she began volunteering at 
Teaticket Elementary School. She eventually 
went on to serve on the Falmouth School 
Committee for one term and as the president 
of the Teaticket Parent Teacher Organization 
for many years. The Lorussos were also inte-
gral to the creation of a walking track at 
Teaticket Elementary as well as a greenhouse 
at Falmouth High School. 

But the Lorussos’ dedication of time and re-
sources does not just stop with our educators. 
Mrs. Lorusso serves as a Falmouth Town Hall 
member—sitting on the board of the Falmouth 
Service Center, as well as the Falmouth 
Chamber of Commerce. And, three years ago, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lorusso cofounded the Falmouth 
Veterans Day Breakfast to honor the service 
of local veterans through a complimentary re-
ception. 

Mr. Speaker, I am pleased to honor Mr. and 
Mrs. Lorusso for their many years of extraor-
dinary service to their fellow citizens and for 
the sterling example they have set for their 
friends and family. I ask that my colleagues 
join me in congratulating them for being recog-
nized by the Falmouth Education Foundation. 

f 

HONORING THE MILFORD CHAP-
TER OF THE LINKS INCOR-
PORATED AS THEY CELEBRATE 
THEIR 30TH ANNIVERSARY 

HON. ROSA L. DeLAURO 
OF CONNECTICUT 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Ms. DELAURO. Mr. Speaker, it is my great 
privilege to rise today to join all of those gath-
ered in honoring the life and legacy of Dr. 
Martin Luther King, Jr. Across Connecticut 
there will be a multitude of events paying trib-
ute to Dr. King, but in Milford, Connecticut a 
remarkable milestone for an outstanding orga-
nization will also be celebrated. With this 
year’s ‘‘Reflections XXX: A Tribute to Rev-
erend Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr.’’ the Milford 
Chapter of The Links Incorporated will mark 
the organization’s 30th Anniversary and it is 
with great pride that I stand today to extend 
my deepest thanks and appreciation to them 
for their invaluable contributions to the Milford 
community. 

The Milford Chapter is one of two hundred 
eighty two chapters of The Links Incorporated 
throughout the United States and in the Com-
monwealth of the Bahamas. Established in 
1946, this non-profit organization internation-
ally includes 14,000 professional women of 
color who are committed to enriching, sus-
taining and ensuring the culture and economic 
survival of African Americans and others of Af-
rican ancestry. 

For each of the last thirty years, the Milford 
Chapter has sponsored this remembrance 
event. In this traditional time of re-evaluation 
and reflection, this annual event reminds us all 
to consider how we, whether as an individual 
or in a larger group, can make more of a dif-
ference in the lives of others and strengthen 
the bonds of friendship and sense of harmony 
within our communities. Yet this is only one of 

many ways the Milford Chapter supports and 
enriches our community. 

The five guiding ‘‘facets’’ for The Links In-
corporated include Service to Youth, Health 
and Human Services, National Trends and 
Services, International Trends and Services, 
and The Arts. Throughout the year Milford 
Links members sponsor and participate in a 
variety of events and projects that promote 
these five pillars. From supporting projects to 
help recovery efforts in Haiti and bring irriga-
tion systems to farmers in Africa to raising 
awareness on breast cancer and sponsoring 
scholarships and promoting literacy, Milford 
Links members are not only making a dif-
ference in the lives of others but also inspiring 
a new generation to give back to their commu-
nity. 

Today, a monument stands—the first monu-
ment on the National Mall not dedicated to a 
white man, a war, or a president—a great 
granite sculpture of Dr. Martin Luther King Jr. 
And in the line of sight just beyond that statue, 
you can make out the columns of the Lincoln 
Memorial. In his iconic speech on the steps of 
that memorial, Dr. King spoke of ‘‘the fierce 
urgency of now.’’ He did not just mean a mo-
ment in 1963. Over the course of its thirty year 
history, the Milford Chapter of The Links Incor-
porated has worked with ‘‘the fierce urgency of 
now’’ to make our community a better place to 
live, learn, and grow. 

I am honored to rise today and extend my 
sincere thanks and appreciation to the Milford 
Chapter of The Links Incorporated for all of 
their good work on behalf of our community. 
Theirs is a legacy of service and generosity 
that serves as an inspiration to us all. My 
heartfelt congratulations on their 30th Anniver-
sary and very best wishes for continued suc-
cess. 

f 

BOKO HARAM 

HON. TED POE 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Mr. POE of Texas. Mr. Speaker, in 2010, 
we saw a similar dip in Boko Haram’s capa-
bility. Its founder was killed and many of its 
fighters wiped out. Boko Haram went into hid-
ing and all was quiet, but that quiet did not 
last. Boko Haram regrouped, appointed a new 
leader even more radical than its founder, and 
came back deadlier than ever. We can’t let 
that happen again. Boko Haram is still capable 
of launching deadly asymmetric attacks 
throughout the Lake Chad Basin. My staff has 
been tracking their attacks. There is hardly a 
day that goes by when there is not some sort 
of Boko Haram attack that kills innocents. 

Over the past few years, relations between 
Nigeria and the U.S. have been strained. Joint 
military trainings were cancelled and the U.S. 
hesitated to supply weapons to Nigeria’s mili-
tary citing concerns about human rights 
abuses. 

It took the United States 11 years to des-
ignate Boko Haram as a foreign terrorist orga-
nization. Finally on November 12, 2013, the 
night before this Subcommittee and the Africa 
Subcommittee held a joint hearing on why 
Boko Haram was not on the FTO list, State 
Department called to say it was designating 
the group. That was an important step but 

there are questions about the implementation 
of the designation. It does not seem that all 
the tools that a designation carries are being 
brought to bear on the group, especially when 
it comes to stopping its financing. 

The U.S. has started to do more to help Ni-
geria combat Boko Haram since the election 
of Nigerian President Buhari in late May of 
2015. Infantry training has been restarted and 
we are seeing an increased level of coopera-
tion between AFRICOM and the Nigerian mili-
tary. In October, the Administration announced 
that it was sending troops and drones to Cam-
eroon as well as surveillance aircraft to Niger. 
But like the FTO designation these are steps 
that should have been taken years ago, before 
Boko Haram was allowed to become more le-
thal than ISIS. Now we must do more to sup-
port our African partners to stamp out this 
Islamist menace once and for all. 

The fight against Boko Haram is essential to 
U.S. national security interests. In ISIS, we 
have already seen what happens when we un-
derestimate a terrorist group. While Boko 
Haram may not have the capability to attack 
the United States today, neither did al Qaeda 
in the years prior to 9/11. We cannot wait for 
an attack to happen on American soil before 
getting serious about destroying those who 
want to destroy us. Now is the time, when it 
costs far less blood and treasure, to stamp out 
Boko Haram. 

And that’s just the way it is. 
f 

RECOGNIZING ENGINEERS WEEK 
2016 

HON. LOU BARLETTA 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Mr. BARLETTA. Mr. Speaker, it is my privi-
lege to draw your attention to a special event, 
Engineers Week, taking place from February 
21st through the 27th. This honorary week is 
a time to recognize the hard work of all engi-
neers and the innumerable contributions they 
have made, especially within my district and 
state. 

The scientific skills and specialized knowl-
edge of the engineers in my district have ful-
filled my constituents’ daily needs and re-
solved some of the major technological chal-
lenges of our time. Often referred to as the 
stealth profession, engineers have influenced 
nearly everything around us—even when we 
may not recognize it. Whether designing effi-
cient urban environments, protecting towns 
from natural disasters, or making simple tasks 
more accessible, engineers provide the life-
blood that drives our modern societies. 

Engineers Week is a formal coalition of 
more than 70 engineering, education, and cul-
tural societies, with more than 50 corporations 
and government agencies focused on raising 
public awareness of engineers’ positive con-
tributions to our communities. This week also 
prompts parents, teachers, and students to 
consider the importance of a technical edu-
cation and a high level of math, science and 
technology literacy, and motivates youth to 
pursue engineering careers in order to provide 
a diverse and vigorous engineering workforce. 

Mr. Speaker, it has been an honor to rep-
resent the engineers of my district and their 
families. I am grateful for their contributions to 
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society and benefit daily from their tireless 
work. I invite everyone to take this week to 
thank our nation’s engineers for their dedica-
tion, to recognize the countless ways they 
have made our world safer and more efficient, 
and to encourage the next generation of great 
engineers in their future endeavors. 

f 

INTRODUCING THE ENVIRON-
MENTAL JUSTICE ACT OF 2016 

HON. JOHN LEWIS 
OF GEORGIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Mr. LEWIS. Mr. Speaker, I am proud to rise 
today and introduce the Environmental Justice 
Act of 2016. 

Twenty-four years ago, I first introduced the 
Environmental Justice Act of 1992, with my 
good friend and former colleague Senator Al 
Gore. After introducing our bill, we worked tire-
lessly to advance many of the policies pro-
posed in our legislation. On February 11, 
1994, President Clinton signed Executive 
Order 12898, ‘‘Federal Actions to Address En-
vironmental Justice in Minority Populations 
and Low-Income Populations’’. This historic 
Executive Order established the federal infra-
structure to identify and address environ-
mental risks—especially in minority and low-in-
come communities that were often overlooked 
and underserved. 

At that time, Senator Gore and I believed 
that every person has the right to safe water 
and clean air. We believed children and par-
ents in every community deserve access to 
green public spaces. Since then many of the 
ideas that we proposed in our 1992 bill have 
been adopted by the EPA. For example, re-
sources like EJSCREEN, help anyone in the 
country find a report on the quality of their 
neighborhood’s water and air. 

Mr. Speaker, there is still much work to be 
done. The threats and needs are changing, 
but the urgency of and my commitment to this 
important and evolving challenge remain the 
same. In Georgia’s 5th Congressional District 
and across the country, many people find that 
even when a serious environmental problem is 
discovered, it is difficult for them to take ac-
tion. This bill responds to this grave reality and 
makes progress in the fight for every person 
to have equal access to a healthy environ-
ment. 

The Environmental Justice Act of 2016 will 
create a tax incentive for 501(c)(3) organiza-
tions, like colleges and universities, to devote 
staff and resources to the hard work of envi-
ronmental justice. This bill is intended to en-
courage scientists, activists, and organizers to 
invest their talents into ensuring that existing 
environmental protections are improved and 
enforced in every community. People must 
know their rights and the tools that are avail-
able to them. This bill will not only advance 
the conversation but also invest in the effort. 

Mr. Speaker, I know that we can come to-
gether to address this important national 
issue. We cannot ignore the public health and 
safety of our communities. We cannot cut cor-
ners at the expense of our friends and neigh-
bors. We must fully respect the life and dignity 
of each and every person, and uphold their 
right to live, learn, and work in a clean and 
safe environment. 

We must cherish this Earth; for it is the only 
home we will likely ever know. I hope that all 
of my colleagues will join me in supporting this 
common-sense legislation. 

f 

HONORING THE SERVICE OF MR. 
VEVESI LEMAFA 

HON. AUMUA AMATA COLEMAN 
RADEWAGEN 

OF AMERICAN SAMOA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Mrs. RADEWAGEN. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to salute the lifelong service and career 
of Mr. Vevesi Lemafa, a son of American 
Samoa. 

Vevesi, was born in Pago Pago American 
Samoa, and attended high school at Faga’itua 
High School, graduating in 1976. 

Following his academic career; longing to 
see other parts of the world, Vevesi joined 
United States Army in March of 1977, and at-
tended Basic Training at Fort Knox, Kentucky. 
During Vevesi’s time in the military, which 
spanned 15 years, he served several over-
seas tours in Germany, and Korea before sep-
arating at the rank of Sergeant in 1991. 

Vevesi, and his lovely wife Matautu E. 
Lemafa, who also served in the U.S. Army are 
the parents to three wonderful children; two 
sons, Evile and Vesi, and their daughter 
Meleane, as well as their grandson Vevesi 
TeToa Fiapa’i Lemafa. 

Following his military career, Vevesi and his 
wife Matautu continued their service to our na-
tion, and were both employed with the Depart-
ment of the Army as civilian employees. 

In his civilian role, Mr. Lemafa has served 
as the Administrative Officer and Human Re-
sources Specialist for Schofield Barracks in 
Hawaii for 22 years, which combined with his 
military service, gives him a total of 37 years 
of federal service to our nation. 

As a member of the Mission Support Ele-
ment (MSE)—Hawaii, under the Senior Com-
mander of the U.S. Army Pacific Command, 
Vevesi has served as the Administrative Offi-
cer/Civilian Human Resources Specialist with 
the utmost honor, professionalism, dedication 
and loyalty. 

Vevesi has assisted managers of the Mis-
sion Support Element—Hawaii through his ef-
fective programming, and vast knowledge of 
the many facets of the civilian human re-
sources program. 

Known to always go the extra mile when 
performing his duties, Vevesi’s people-oriented 
style earned himself the reputation of ‘‘the-go- 
to-man’’ for his exceptional, customer-first- 
based service, and accurate analysis with a 
positive and ‘‘can do’’ attitude. 

Though Vevesi is retiring, those Mission 
Support Element employees who have worked 
with him have truly benefited through his self-
less devotion to duty, and he has earned the 
respect and admiration of his command. 

Due to his truly remarkable and commend-
able service to our grateful nation, I want to 
also state my support for his nomination for 
the Meritorious Civilian Service Award, and 
wish him the very best on his retirement. 

God bless the United States and American 
Samoa. 

CONGRATULATING ZANE CLARK 
ON RECEIVING THE CITIZEN 
SCHOLAR AWARD FROM MIS-
SOURI STATE UNIVERSITY 

HON. BILLY LONG 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Mr. LONG. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize and congratulate Zane Clark, an out-
standing student at Missouri State University, 
on his selection to receive the Citizen Scholar 
Award. 

Each year, this prestigious award is given 
by Missouri State University’s Board of Gov-
ernors to students who have contributed to the 
university, furthered the university’s public af-
fairs mission, and have been significantly en-
gaged in extra-curricular accomplishments or 
in important service activities in the commu-
nity. Since the award was created in 2007, 
only forty-seven students have been recog-
nized for their stellar achievements. 

Zane, from Cameron, Missouri, was one of 
a handful of exceptional students to receive 
the award this year. He is presently a senior 
organizational communication major with mi-
nors in general business and economics. Zane 
has been recognized for his social awareness 
and compassion, along with his undying deter-
mination to significantly improve the world 
around him. 

Mr. Speaker, Zane Clark’s accomplishments 
have set a great example of what a Citizen 
Scholar should be. This award represents a 
great deal of his hard work and dedication. I 
am proud to represent students like him and 
I urge my colleagues to join me in congratu-
lating him on this well-deserved achievement. 

f 

HONORING MR. MADISON MARYE 

HON. H. MORGAN GRIFFITH 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, February 26, 2016 

Mr. GRIFFITH. Mr. Speaker, I submit these 
remarks in honor of Mr. Madison Marye, who 
passed away on February 23 at the age of 90. 
Madison was a longtime state senator from 
Montgomery County, and I had the honor of 
serving in the Virginia General Assembly with 
him. Though we disagreed from time to time, 
he was always a gentleman and a person I 
liked very much. 

Madison loved the communities of 
Shawsville and Elliston where he grew up. 
Madison joined the United States Army, and 
served in World War II, the Korean War, and 
the Vietnam War before he retired as a major, 
which he said is further than he ever expected 
to have advanced in the military. 

He returned to Elliston to farm, and he 
opened a gas station as well. In 1973, Madi-
son ran for and was elected to the Virginia 
Senate. While in Richmond, he served on var-
ious committees but was most proud of his 
seat on the Senate Finance Committee as 
well as his service on the Senate Agriculture 
Committee. Without a doubt, Madison, for dec-
ades, was a feisty legislator and fierce advo-
cate for his rural constituency. 

Madison is survived by his wife Charlotte; 
his daughter, Charlotte Hawes and husband 
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