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will be vigilant to see that justice is 
done. Or, as he also calls it, leading 
from behind. 

b 1045 

Two other glaring issues we face are 
the Syrian refugee program and our 
southern border. 

There is currently no way to vet Syr-
ian refugees, and I think this President 
is delusional if he thinks there is. I 
have introduced H.R. 4218 to suspend 
refugee admissions until Congress 
passes a joint resolution approving the 
President’s plan. 

Meanwhile, our southern border is 
overrun again. Through the first 6 
months of fiscal year 2016, which ended 
on March 31, border officials appre-
hended 27,754 unaccompanied children. 
That is just shy of the 28,579 number 
apprehended for all of 2014. Think 
about that comparison. 

Mr. Speaker, we must provide eco-
nomic, retirement, and national secu-
rity for all Americans. We must rise to 
the occasion and make certain our Na-
tion is secure. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Mem-
bers are reminded not to engage in per-
sonalities toward the President. 

f 

CALIFORNIA WATER LEGISLATION 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
California (Mr. COSTA) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. COSTA. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to urge my colleagues to work together 
on behalf of the people of California to 
get water legislation passed that will 
help fix California’s broken water sys-
tem. 

Yes, Californians have been divided 
historically for decades for a number of 
reasons on how to fix our broken water 
system, but that must change because 
we are living on borrowed time, and 
nothing has explained that more clear-
ly than the last 4 years of drought con-
ditions. 

Yesterday, the U.S. Senate Com-
mittee on Energy and Natural Re-
sources held a hearing on Senator 
DIANNE FEINSTEIN’s water legislation, 
the California Long-Term Provisions 
for Water Supply and Short-Term Pro-
visions for Emergency Drought Relief 
Act. This week, Congressman JOHN 
GARAMENDI introduced the House com-
panion bill, legislation that I support 
as well. 

The California Long-Term Provisions 
for Water Supply and Short-Term Pro-
visions for Emergency Drought Relief 
Act would provide $1.3 billion in fund-
ing and support for desalinization, re-
cycling efforts, and water storage 
projects like Temperance Flat and the 
expansion of San Luis Reservoir. 

The bill would also direct State and 
Federal agencies to maximize water 
supplies during the short term, while 
not violating existing environmental 
laws that protect threatened and en-
dangered species. 

Additionally, the legislation includes 
language that would generate and pro-

vide for scientifically managed res-
ervoir operations which would allow us 
to, for example, raise the spillway 
gates at New Exchequer Dam in Merced 
County, providing an additional 50,000 
acre-feet of water storage for the 
Merced Irrigation District. 

Finally, the bill would complement 
the ongoing efforts made by the recent 
passage of a State water bond that I 
supported—$2.7 billion for additional 
water storage in California. 

In order to get California’s water bill 
passed and signed into law, our Na-
tion’s Senators must understand that 
there is support for Senator DIANNE 
FEINSTEIN’s legislation among Cali-
fornia Representatives in the House. 
That is why I am a cosponsor of the 
House companion legislation, H.R. 5247. 

Now, there is room for modifications 
and changes in Senator FEINSTEIN’s 
legislation as well as the House bill, es-
pecially provisions that deal with 
short-term fixes that would provide 
more accountability on how Califor-
nia’s water system is operated year to 
year. But if Congress is going to be 
able to provide some relief to the peo-
ple of California, which is a template 
for Western States—and, I would say, 
the world—we must continue to move 
forward, and the passage of S. 2533 
would undoubtedly be an important 
step in the right direction. 

Once S. 2533 is passed out of the Sen-
ate, the House and the Senate will have 
the opportunity to go to conference to 
resolve the differences that exist in 
these water bills by each of the Cham-
bers. That is the normal process under 
which we usually conduct business. 

I have consistently fought to bring 
more water to our San Joaquin Valley, 
and that includes supporting the Cali-
fornia water bill that the House passed 
last year, but we need to use all the 
water tools in our water toolbox to fix 
the entire State’s water needs. 

It is my hope that my colleagues will 
put aside their political differences 
which, for too long, have been a part of 
the problem and join me in supporting 
the California Long-Term Provisions 
for Water Supply and Short-Term Pro-
visions for Emergency Drought Relief 
Act, because fixing California’s water 
system is dependent upon it. If we 
don’t pass this legislation and we don’t 
work with Governor Brown in Cali-
fornia, we cannot fix this broken water 
system. 

So, finally, what is this about? It is 
about investing in our infrastructure. 
We are living off the investments our 
parents and our grandparents made a 
generation ago. This is Infrastructure 
Week. We ought to be talking about in-
vesting in our infrastructure, not only 
in California, but around the country. 

What else is this about? It is about 
helping the environment because, not-
withstanding the opposition to this 
legislation, the status quo is only re-
sulting in further deterioration of the 
environment. 

Finally, what else is this about? It is 
about the reliability of our water sup-

ply to maintain our farms. Maintaining 
our farms, after all, is a part of Amer-
ica’s national security. We don’t think 
about it that way, but having reliable, 
cost-effective food on America’s dinner 
table every night is about our national 
security. So it is about the sustain-
ability, therefore, of our food supply 
and our way of life. 

If we are going to fix this, we have to 
come together. We have to work to-
gether. We have to get beyond our dif-
ferences and beyond our talking points. 

If Congress is going to get anything 
done, we, in California, on our water 
fixes, must come together. 

f 

BUILDING SAFETY MONTH 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 

Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Kentucky (Mr. BARR) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. BARR. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to mark Building Safety Month, to rec-
ognize the importance of building safe-
ty, and to congratulate the leadership 
of the International Code Council that 
develops and publishes the model build-
ing safety and energy efficiency model 
codes used in the Commonwealth of 
Kentucky and across the country. In-
creasingly, these codes, developed in 
the United States, are being adopted in 
other nations as a model of safe con-
struction. 

Every year, there are sobering re-
minders about the key role that build-
ing codes can have. Foreign nations 
still experience catastrophic losses of 
life and property due to natural events 
and poor construction practices. These 
losses have been greatly reduced in this 
country thanks to the adoption of 
sound building practices. 

Deadly fires, tornados, windstorms, 
floods, earthquakes, and other events 
remind us of the critical need for 
strong buildings. As Congress discusses 
the need for resilience and greater en-
ergy efficiency in our communities, we 
are reminded in May that key elements 
of resilience and energy efficiency are 
sound building and energy codes. 

I want to congratulate the leaders of 
the ICC, which has sponsored Building 
Safety Month in May every year for 
over 30 years. The theme of this year’s 
Building Safety Month, appropriately, 
is ‘‘Driving Growth Through Innova-
tion, Resilience, and Safety.’’ 

The leadership board of the ICC, in-
cluding my constituent, President Alex 
Olszowy, building inspection supervisor 
for the Lexington-Fayette Urban Coun-
ty Government in Kentucky, will join 
ICC’s chief executive officer, Dominic 
Sims, in Washington next week to dis-
cuss the critical need to support the 
adoption and enforcement of current 
building codes to make sure Americans 
are safe at home, at work, at school, 
and at play. 

On this occasion, I also want to high-
light the good work of the Code Admin-
istrators Association of Kentucky, in-
cluding president Jeff Camp and the 
other leaders of the Commonwealth’s 
ICC chapter, and to thank the thou-
sands of men and women who work 
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every day to make sure our buildings 
comply with building and fire codes. 
Their work, largely unseen and often 
unnoticed, is critical to keeping the 
American people safe. 

The model building codes adopted by 
ICC members from all 50 States allow 
every community to share the advan-
tage of adopting building codes that 
are adaptable to local conditions but, 
at the same time, incorporate the very 
latest research, materials, and building 
practices. 

This is achieved through a public-pri-
vate partnership, saving local jurisdic-
tions from bearing the large expense of 
code revision, updating, and coordina-
tion. These model codes are produced 
through the cooperation of thousands 
of local U.S. code officials working 
with the building industry to produce 
codes that represent the consensus on 
what the minimum safety require-
ments are and should be for various 
building types, all without a dime of 
Federal taxpayer money. 

I should mention that the Architect 
of the Capitol maintains the safety of 
this building and all House and Senate 
office buildings by following the re-
quirements in the current Inter-
national Building Code. 

So congratulations and a heartfelt 
thanks to the hardworking members 
and leadership of the International 
Code Council during this Building Safe-
ty Month. 

f 

HOUSTON, TEXAS, FLOODING 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 

Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Texas (Mr. AL GREEN) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. AL GREEN of Texas. Mr. Speak-
er, this is a continuation of my mission 
of mercy, a mission that I gladly ac-
cept because a great American city has 
been declared a disaster area: a great 
American city with 2-plus million peo-
ple, a great American city where we 
speak more than 100 different lan-
guages, a great American city where 
we appreciate diversity and we cele-
brate it. In fact, we have developed a 
symbiotic relationship, a symbiosis 
such that we can do together what we 
could never do apart. A great American 
city, Houston, Texas, within Harris 
County, has been declared a disaster 
area; and it has been declared a dis-
aster area, Mr. Speaker, because of the 
flooding that takes place in Houston, 
Texas. 

I asked that my staff prepare some 
intelligence for me to share so as to 
paint a picture of what this flooding is 
like in Houston, Texas. 

In Houston, Texas, on the tax day 
flood—so-called because it was the last 
day to file for taxes this year—we had 
this tax day flood, and it has caused 
damages that will approximate $2 bil-
lion. The good news is that that is re-
vised down because the estimate ini-
tially was that it would be more. 

In Houston, Texas, over 100 neighbor-
hoods experienced some flooding. 

In Houston, Texas, a great American 
city, we had 240 billion—billion with a 

B—240 billion gallons of water. A bil-
lion is still 1,000 million. So we have 
had 2,000-million-plus gallons of water 
in Houston, Texas. And that was on one 
day. This is enough water to fill the 
Astrodome 750 times over. 

In Houston, Texas, we had more than 
1,200 high water rescues, people strand-
ed, lives at risk in Houston, Texas, a 
major American city, a great American 
city declared a disaster area. 

In Houston, Texas, there was 8.85 
inches of rainfall—that broke the pre-
vious record from 1976—and, I might 
add, in some areas, 17 inches of water. 
That was all a part of the tax day 
floods. There were 121,000 people with-
out power. 

Mr. Speaker, this is significant, but 
it is also significant to note that this is 
not the first time. Within the last year, 
12 months, we had the Memorial Day 
flood, with similar circumstances and 
$2 billion in damages. 

Mr. Speaker, over the last 20 years, 
we have had at least one day of flood-
ing in Houston, Texas, that has been 
called to the attention of the people in 
Washington, D.C., and I’m doing so 
now. 
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Mr. Speaker, as bad as these things 
are, all of these damages that I have 
called to our attention, there is some-
thing more significant, something 
more meaningful that is happening in 
Houston, Texas, and that is lives are 
being lost. In the tax day flood, we lost 
nine lives, Mr. Speaker—nine lives— 
people who left home going to work, 
assuming that they would drive their 
cars and return home. 

Mr. Speaker, we have, in Houston, 
what are called flash floods. Even peo-
ple who are judicious and prudent can 
sometimes find themselves in cir-
cumstances from which they cannot 
extricate themselves because of the 
way the water comes in so quickly— 
flash floods, nine lives lost, a great 
American city declared a disaster area. 

Houston needs a lifeline. When you 
are drowning in water, you need a life-
line. Well, there is a lifeline. The life-
line is H.R. 5025, the 2016 Tax Day 
Floods Supplemental Funding Act. 
This is a supplemental funding bill, 
which means it is not an earmark. It is 
the kind of thing we do when we have 
emergencies to contend with. We have 
done this before when we have had the 
storms on the East Coast. We have 
done this before, when we had New Or-
leans, Louisiana, and Katrina. We have 
done it when we have had fires. We 
have done it when we have had the 
tornadic activities. This is reasonable. 
It is prudent. It is judicious. It is some-
thing we ought to do to rescue, to 
throw a lifeline to a great American 
city that has been declared a disaster 
area. 

Well, the good news is, Mr. Speaker, 
we are recovering; but I hate to say, 
and I regret to say, I am reluctant to 
say, we are not out of the woods yet. 
We are not out of the woods yet, Mr. 

Speaker, because today there is an 80 
percent chance of precipitation. To-
morrow, there is an 80 percent chance. 

I beg that we support H.R. 5025 and 
extend a lifeline to Houston, Texas, a 
great American city. 

f 

RECESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 12(a) of rule I, the Chair 
declares the House in recess until noon 
today. 

Accordingly (at 11 o’clock and 2 min-
utes a.m.), the House stood in recess. 

f 
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AFTER RECESS 

The recess having expired, the House 
was called to order by the Speaker pro 
tempore (Mr. DONOVAN) at noon. 

f 

PRAYER 

Reverend Dr. Patricia Venegas, With-
out Spot or Wrinkle Ministries Inter-
national, La Verne, California, offered 
the following prayer: 

Heavenly Father, we come before 
Your throne room of grace today by 
unmerited favor. We thank You for this 
great Nation. 

Our forefathers faced many trials and 
tribulations in their days. They relied 
on You as they sought Your guidance 
for America, knowing they could not 
do it without You. 

Today, in this room, we humble our-
selves before You and pause, asking 
You once again for Your guidance and 
perfect will for our Nation, as we pray 
Your kingdom come and Your will be 
done in America. 

I also pray for every Representative 
in this room today, who shoulders the 
immense responsibility to make deci-
sions for the people they represent, 
give each one wisdom, knowledge, un-
derstanding, and discernment on every 
decision they make. I pray You will 
bless them and their families for the 
sacrifice they make for the American 
people. 

In Your holy name. 
Amen. 

f 

THE JOURNAL 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair has examined the Journal of the 
last day’s proceedings and announces 
to the House his approval thereof. 

Pursuant to clause 1, rule I, the Jour-
nal stands approved. 

f 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Will the 
gentleman from California (Mr. BERA) 
come forward and lead the House in the 
Pledge of Allegiance. 

Mr. BERA led the Pledge of Alle-
giance as follows: 

I pledge allegiance to the Flag of the 
United States of America, and to the Repub-
lic for which it stands, one nation under God, 
indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 
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