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House for 1 minute and to revise and 
extend her remarks.) 

Ms. FRANKEL of Florida. Mr. Speak-
er, 90 people a day are killed by a fire-
arm in the United States of America. 
That is more than 33,000 families dev-
astated by gun violence last year. 
Those are statistics. I want to tell you 
and read the names of real people in 
my hometown whose families got that 
dreaded, unimaginable knock on the 
door: 

Jacob Walsh, age 25; 
Greg Bryant, Jr., age 21; 
Zedward Jackson, age 52; 
Gary Martin, age 52; 
Ledarius Fitzgerald, age 18; 
Herman Denis, age 18; 
Jack Bellino, age 28; 
Courtney McGriff, age 29; 
James Cartigiano, age 16; 
Anne Nau, age 21. 
And the list goes on. Who will get the 

next knock on the door? 
f 

ISIS IS A REAL THREAT 

(Mr. SAM JOHNSON of Texas asked 
and was given permission to address 
the House for 1 minute and to revise 
and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. SAM JOHNSON of Texas. Mr. 
Speaker, less than a month ago, an 
American of Afghan descent shot and 
killed 49 people in Orlando. He did so 
while pledging allegiance to ISIS. In 
the words of the actual gunman, this 
was a terrorist attack. 

What is worse is that many of my 
colleagues across the aisle have at-
tempted to hijack facts and muddy the 
conversation. Why? Because this at-
tack further disproves the President’s 
narrative that ISIS is contained. 

Don’t even get me started on the fact 
that the President won’t say the words 
‘‘radical Islamic terrorist.’’ The admin-
istration even attempted to remove 
mention of ISIS in the 9/11 tran-
scription. 

Folks, ISIS has declared war against 
our American way of life, and we need 
to work together to protect all Ameri-
cans from future attacks, and our Com-
mander in Chief finally needs to come 
up with a strategy to defeat ISIS. 

f 

THE TIME FOR BOLD ACTION IS 
NOW 

(Mr. CROWLEY asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. CROWLEY. Mr. Speaker, I under-
stand the Republican majority has 
pulled a bill from the floor agenda that 
would have created a new loophole al-
lowing terror suspects to get a gun. 
That is good news. The bill they pulled 
was the Cornyn-NRA gun lobby bill, 
and we are pleased that they pulled 
that bill. It is a terrible proposal that 
will only make matters worse in our 
country. 

But now it is time to bring up the 
meaningful bipartisan bill, the no fly, 
no buy legislation, and the meaningful 

background check legislation. And 
know this: until you do so, Mr. Speak-
er, we are not going away. We are not 
going anywhere because this issue is 
not going away. 

Putting aside Orlando for a mo-
ment—the last gentleman’s com-
ments—since the House gaveled back 
in on Tuesday, nearly 200 people have 
been killed or injured due to gun vio-
lence. I don’t know how many more 
people must fall victim to gun violence 
before this body, before House Repub-
licans will get the message. 

The time for bold action is now. I do 
know my Democratic colleagues and I 
are prepared to keep up this fight for 
as long as we have to to get meaningful 
gun legislation passed. 

f 

THE THREAT OF RADICAL 
ISLAMIC TERRORISM 

(Mrs. WALORSKI asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Mrs. WALORSKI. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to express grave concern over 
the threat of radical Islamic terrorism. 

What we need is a comprehensive 
strategy to destroy terrorist organiza-
tions like ISIS. Instead, the adminis-
tration is ramping up the release of 
Guantanamo Bay detainees. 

Make no mistake, these detainees are 
the worst of the worst. One former de-
tainee has become a leader of al 
Qaeda’s affiliate in Yemen. Another, 
released last month, was Osama bin 
Laden’s bodyguard. Just weeks before 
the Olympics, here we are again. Au-
thorities in Brazil are on the hunt for 
a former detainee who went missing. 

With another two dozen detainees 
cleared for this summer, I worked to 
include key safeguards in next year’s 
National Defense Authorization Act, 
like requiring written agreements with 
foreign nations that accept these 
GTMO transfers. I introduced legisla-
tion with Senator STEVE DAINES to 
block all GTMO transfers until these 
safeguards are signed into law or until 
the end of the year. 

The President wants to empty GTMO 
and bring the remaining terrorists to 
U.S. soil. Mr. Speaker, we cannot allow 
these terrorist detainees to put Amer-
ican lives at risk. 

f 

CLOSE THE CHARLESTON 
LOOPHOLE 

(Mr. CLYBURN asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. CLYBURN. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
once again call upon Members of Con-
gress to enact some commonsense gun 
reform because I really believe that we 
are misusing the word ‘‘reform’’ every 
time we talk about this issue. Reform 
means a change for the better. It 
doesn’t mean just to go through a proc-
ess. It means a change for the better. 

Mr. Speaker, we have seen that our 
gun laws need to change. I am very 

emotional for nine souls in my congres-
sional district who lost their lives be-
cause of an inadequate, nonsensical 
background check law that says that 
no matter what the situation might be, 
if you wait for 3 days, you can go get 
the gun. Irrespective of your mental 
condition, irrespective of your back-
ground, irrespective of your intentions, 
you can still buy the gun. 

We need to close this Charleston 
loophole, and we need to enact a law 
that says, if you are not qualified to 
buy a plane ticket, you are not quali-
fied to buy a gun. 

f 

A FAILURE OF OUR JUSTICE 
SYSTEM 

(Mr. WILLIAMS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. WILLIAMS. Mr. Speaker, the 
revelations of the last few days have 
been, at best, an injustice and, at 
worst, government corruption of the 
highest degree. 

Earlier this week, FBI Director 
James Comey acknowledged that 
former Secretary of State Hillary Clin-
ton sent or received 110 emails that 
contained classified information 
through her unsecured server. He went 
as far as to say that Secretary Clin-
ton’s actions were ‘‘extremely care-
less.’’ Despite the FBI Director’s harsh 
criticism of Secretary Clinton’s ability 
or inability to protect highly sensitive 
material, it appears she will walk away 
without punishment. 

In an era where cybersecurity has be-
come one of the most important pillars 
of U.S. national security, this careless-
ness is totally unacceptable. What is 
even more unacceptable is that the Na-
tion’s top prosecutor met with Sec-
retary Clinton’s husband, former Presi-
dent Bill Clinton, in private 1 week be-
fore the Justice Department decided 
not to press charges. 

Mr. Speaker, it is possible Secretary 
Clinton threatened the security of this 
great country. There are those who 
have committed far lesser crimes who 
have faced far harsher consequences. 
The Attorney General’s decision not to 
prosecute Secretary Clinton is a failure 
of our justice system. 

In God we trust. 
f 

NOW IS THE TIME TO ACT 

(Mrs. TORRES asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mrs. TORRES. Mr. Speaker, last 
week on this floor, I told a story of a 
911 call that I took where an 11-year- 
old girl was murdered at the hands of 
her uncle. Her name was Yajaira. 
Today I want to tell you about Ethan 
Esparza. 

In 2006, when I was mayor of Pomona, 
Ethan was shot and killed while he was 
playing in his front yard during his 
birthday party. He would have turned 4 
years old the next day. 
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The murders of Yajaira and Ethan 

were completely senseless, but they are 
not rare. Every day, 91 people are 
killed because of gun violence. In the 
United States, you are more than 10 
times likely to die because of a firearm 
than in any other developed country. 

We have a problem, a problem that 
isn’t going to be solved by simply put-
ting our heads in the sand. It is time to 
stop this silence. We aren’t going to 
solve this. Now is the time to act. Now 
is the time to have a discussion about 
it. 

f 

REMEMBERING PENN STATE 
STUDENT MADISON HILL 

(Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise today in honor of 
19-year-old Madison ‘‘Maddie’’ Hill, a 
student at Penn State University, who, 
sadly, passed away after a long battle 
with cancer last week. 

Madison was not originally from 
Pennsylvania’s Fifth Congressional 
District. In fact, she was a native of 
York County, but she was no stranger 
to Penn State University even before 
she started classes there as a student. 

Following her cancer diagnosis, 
Madison benefited from the Penn State 
IFC/Panhellenic Dance Marathon, or 
THON, the largest student-run philan-
thropy in the world, which raises funds 
and awareness for the fight against pe-
diatric cancer. 

Upon enrolling in Penn State, Madi-
son worked to provide that same sup-
port for other cancer patients as a vol-
unteer and family relations co-chair 
with THON. She was also a member of 
the university’s Blue & White Society. 

I join the entire Penn State commu-
nity in mourning the loss of Madison 
and offer my thoughts and prayers to 
her family and friends. 

f 

b 1215 

FOUR-YEAR-OLD BOY SHOT IN 
ALTADENA 

(Ms. JUDY CHU of California asked 
and was given permission to address 
the House for 1 minute.) 

Ms. JUDY CHU of California. Mr. 
Speaker, yesterday morning, I woke up 
to the news that, overnight, a 4-year- 
old boy in my district, in Altadena, 
California, became one of the latest 
victims of gun violence. 

Salvador Esparza III was sitting on 
his front porch with a family friend 
when a car drove up, fired at least 13 
rounds, and drove off, leaving two bod-
ies. Hours later, we finally heard the 
tragic news. Little Salvador was dead. 
I was heartbroken. 

Now, I know the doctors did every-
thing they could to save his life. But 
what are we doing in Congress? Noth-
ing. Another life cut short, another 
family torn apart, another day of si-
lence from Congress. 

The NRA tells us the solution is 
more guns. Well, we already have more 
guns than any other country in the 
world, and it is not working. Having 
more guns would not have helped 4- 
year-old Salvador. But we could have. 

Enough is enough. We must pass no 
fly, no buy and we must pass universal 
background checks. 

f 

AQUATIC INVASIVE SPECIES 
AWARENESS WEEK 

(Mr. BENISHEK asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. BENISHEK. Mr. Speaker, this 
week marks Aquatic Invasive Species 
Awareness Week. 

This is a good time to consider the 
threat that invasive species pose to all 
of our districts. Northern Michigan’s 
economy depends on the Great Lakes 
and our beautiful outdoors. Invasive 
species represent a direct threat to our 
way of life. 

Even before I came to Congress, I was 
working on invasive species issues. I 
live on an inland lake, and we had a 
really difficult invasive weed get out of 
control. I have been working for years 
with my neighbors to control it, so I 
know just how difficult, and important, 
it is to get local buy-in for this fight. 

Volunteers throughout northern 
Michigan are working right now to at-
tack invasive species on the ground. 
State officials are working to educate 
the public on how we can lessen the 
chance of spreading these invasive spe-
cies. 

These efforts are in addition to the 
great work in my district by profes-
sionals at institutions like Northern 
Michigan University and the Hammond 
Bay Biological Station. 

I hope this week we will bring further 
attention to this fight and help Con-
gress to focus more resources on this 
issue. 

f 

ADDRESSING THE URGENT NEED 
TO PASS NO FLY, NO BUY AND 
BACKGROUND CHECKS 

(Ms. KUSTER asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. KUSTER. Mr. Speaker, today, I 
rise to stress the urgent need to pass 
legislation to keep our communities 
safe from those with evil intent and 
who wish to harm innocent Americans. 

I am a strong supporter of the Second 
Amendment, and I believe we must up-
hold the tradition of my home State of 
New Hampshire for responsible, law- 
abiding gun ownership. But as we saw 
in Orlando, it is far too easy for indi-
viduals with evil intent to get ahold of 
firearms and target innocent American 
lives. 

That is why I strongly urge my col-
leagues to pass legislation to ban those 
on the terrorist watch list from pur-
chasing guns. What is more, we must 

increase background checks to prevent 
tragedies like the one in my home 
State of New Hampshire in 1997, when 
an incredibly disturbed man fatally 
shot Judge Vickie Bunnell, two State 
troopers, and a newspaper editor. Indi-
viduals like this should not be given 
access to lethal weapons. Rather, we 
should give access to mental health 
treatment. 

Let’s put aside party politics and do 
what is right to keep our communities 
safe. 

f 

NETWORKS’ COVERAGE OF 
ORLANDO ATTACK BIASED 

(Mr. SMITH of Texas asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. SMITH of Texas. Mr. Speaker, 
the Media Research Center recently 
issued a report highlighting the three 
major news networks’ slanted coverage 
of the Orlando terrorist attack. 

The Center found that ABC’s, NBC’s, 
and CBS’ broadcast network programs 
‘‘flooded their shows with statements 
favoring gun control over gun rights by 
a ratio of 8 to 1.’’ 

The Orlando attacker was a radical 
Islamic extremist who pledged his alle-
giance to ISIS before committing the 
worst terrorist attack on U.S. soil 
since September 11, 2001. Instead of fo-
cusing on gun control, the liberal na-
tional media should tell the American 
people the full story about the Orlando 
attacker’s radical Islamic views as the 
cause of these killings. Not a single 
gun control measure in Congress would 
have prevented his actions. 

f 

GUN LOBBY 
(Mr. LOWENTHAL asked and was 

given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. LOWENTHAL. Mr. Speaker, gun 
violence permeates every aspect of our 
lives, from the streets of Chicago to 
law enforcement officers to Congress. 
Everybody is affected by what is going 
on. But we can do something about it 
by passing two bills that we have been 
talking about: the no fly, no buy and 
universal background checks. Neither 
is a solution to the entire problem, but 
both are good steps. 

The reason we haven’t done anything 
is simple: the $15 million a year gun 
manufacturing industry. And by pre-
venting action here through their cam-
paign donations and Capitol Hill lobby-
ists, they are controlling the discus-
sion. 

When I can’t act, when you can’t act, 
this House is being controlled by the 
gun industry. We—all of us, on both 
sides of the aisle—are looking to blame 
each other when the real culprits are 
the gun manufacturers. 

f 

REPLACE OBAMACARE 
(Mr. LAMALFA asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
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