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BENEFICIAL OWNERSHIP BILL 

(Mrs. CAROLYN B. MALONEY of 
New York asked and was given permis-
sion to address the House for 1 minute.) 

Mrs. CAROLYN B. MALONEY of New 
York. Mr. Speaker, this Sunday ‘‘60 
Minutes’’ highlighted an explosive un-
dercover investigation by Global Wit-
ness, which showed just how easy it is 
for criminals and corrupt officials to 
use anonymous shell companies to 
bring dirty money into the United 
States. 

The reason it is so easy is because 
States don’t require the disclosure of 
the true beneficial ownership of shell 
companies. This is unacceptable, and it 
has to stop. As Global Witness stated, 
‘‘anonymous shell companies are like 
getaway cars for crooks.’’ 

That is why I am reintroducing a 
law, along with my good friend and col-
league, Representative PETER KING, 
which would require that the person 
creating the corporation say who the 
beneficial owner is and, also, to explain 
who really owns the company. 

If States do not require and get this 
information, then, as a backstop, the 
United States Treasury will have this 
information before an account can be 
opened. 

This is a commonsense, bipartisan 
attack on what is a major national se-
curity and law enforcement issue. 

I urge my colleagues to join us in 
passing this important legislation. 

f 

THE IMPORTANCE OF 
AGRICULTURE 

(Mrs. ROBY asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Mrs. ROBY. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
draw attention to the important role 
that agriculture plays in this country. 

I am honored to serve in a district in 
which agriculture represents the larg-
est employer and is responsible for $11 
billion in economic impact. 

It is why, during my time on the 
House Agriculture Committee, I was 
proud to help craft a new farm bill that 
delivers modern, more conservative 
policy for our farmers. 

That is why now, as a member of the 
Appropriations Committee, I have re-
mained diligent in making sure that 
the promises we made in the farm bill 
are kept. 

We faced a challenge last year in the 
crop insurance program when it was 
gutted in the budget. This is the sys-
tem that we promised our farmers to 
help transition away from direct pay-
ments. 

Cutting it was unfair. I was proud to 
help restore that program funding be-
fore the end of the year, but it dem-
onstrated something of a disconnect. 

Mr. Speaker, not everyone in Con-
gress represents a district with such a 
large agricultural footprint. What I try 
to explain to my colleagues is that, 
when you mess around with the crop 

insurance program, you aren’t just af-
fecting farmers who put seed in the 
ground. 

You are affecting the ones who sell 
the seed, who build the equipment to 
cultivate and harvest the crop, and 
those who help process the goods for 
their final products. 

That farming dollar turns over many 
times, and there is an entire agri-
culture supply chain that is affected by 
the farm policies we set in Congress. 

My farmers know I have their back 
and I always will as long as I am in 
Congress. 

f 

GO RED FOR WOMEN CAMPAIGN 
(Ms. GRAHAM asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Ms. GRAHAM. Mr. Speaker, today I 
rise in support of the American Heart 
Association’s Go Red for Women cam-
paign. 

Heart disease and stroke cause one in 
three deaths among women each year, 
killing approximately one woman 
every 80 seconds. The troubling num-
bers are more than a statistic. They 
are a fact of life that cause unneces-
sary pain and suffering to families 
across our country. 

I say unnecessary pain and suffering 
because we have the power to change 
it. We can save lives. As much as 80 
percent of heart disease and stroke-re-
lated deaths can be prevented with edu-
cation and action. 

That is why I am standing to raise 
awareness and encourage my fellow 
members and constituents across north 
Florida to Go Red by participating in 
National Wear Red Day on Friday. 

Wear something red, like this jacket, 
to show your support for women fight-
ing heart disease and strokes. To-
gether, we can save lives. 

f 

ZIKA RESPONSE AND SAFETY ACT 
(Mr. STEWART asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. STEWART. Mr. Speaker, yester-
day the World Health Organization de-
clared the Zika virus outbreak a global 
public health emergency. 

The virus is particularly dangerous 
to pregnant women as it has been 
linked to serious physical and neuro-
logical defects in their unborn chil-
dren. As the father of six children, I 
understand how frightening this could 
be. 

Experts fear the virus will spread 
more widely to the United States, espe-
cially with the Olympic Games in 
Brazil on the horizon. That is why I 
have introduced the Zika Response and 
Safety Act, to ensure that key agencies 
have the resources necessary to combat 
this growing threat. 

In 2014, Congress allocated more than 
$2 billion to fight Ebola. Much of that 
money is still unspent. I would like to 
make some of that funding available to 
be used to combat the Zika virus. 

This virus is a global health threat 
that requires our immediate attention. 
I urge my colleagues to support the 
Zika Response and Safety Act so that 
we can provide the necessary resources 
to understand and to prevent the harm-
ful effects from Zika. 

f 

b 1215 

WE NEED TO PROPERLY MANAGE 
WATER 

(Mr. COSTA asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. COSTA. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
bring attention to the failure of Cali-
fornia State agencies and Federal 
agencies to properly manage Califor-
nia’s water system as a result of the El 
Nino storms that we have been receiv-
ing. 

El Nino years, like this one, are Cali-
fornia’s hope of digging out of the his-
torical drought conditions that we are 
facing. There is very high likelihood 
that most of the State will experience 
flood conditions, while communities in 
the San Joaquin Valley that I rep-
resent will receive a zero water alloca-
tion. 

This year we have already missed an 
opportunity to move significant 
amounts of water to regions of Cali-
fornia that need it most in the San 
Joaquin Valley. 

As a result of the State and Federal 
agencies’ inability to operate in the 
most flexible range allowable, over 
160,000 acre-feet of water has been lost 
this week alone and over half a million 
acre-feet has been lost this year. Mean-
while, an estimated total of 2 million 
acre-feet of water has gone out to the 
ocean. 

State and Federal agencies are fail-
ing to take advantage of the water in 
the system today, and that is unac-
ceptable. It is a disservice to all Cali-
fornians. It is simply immoral. 

f 

HONORING AMBASSADOR GARY 
DOER 

(Mr. HUIZENGA of Michigan asked 
and was given permission to address 
the House for 1 minute and to revise 
and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. HUIZENGA of Michigan. Mr. 
Speaker, I rise today to honor the Hon-
orable Gary Doer, the outgoing Cana-
dian Ambassador to the United States. 

Canada is one of our Nation’s longest 
and greatest allies. Our bilateral trade 
with Canada was nearly $734 billion 
last year alone, and it supports over 9 
million jobs. In fact, my home State of 
Michigan sells more goods to Canada 
than our next 12 largest trading part-
ners combined. 

Over the last 7 years, Ambassador 
Doer has built a long list of accom-
plishments, including improved U.S.- 
Canadian regulatory cooperation, advo-
cating for the Congressional Gold 
Medal for the Devil’s Brigade, and the 
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repeal of burdensome country of origin 
labeling requirements. 

Mr. Speaker, I am grateful for Am-
bassador Doer’s personal friendship to 
me and his relentless service to Canada 
and his friendship with the United 
States. I wish him well in his future 
endeavors. 

As chair of the U.S.-Canada Inter-
parliamentary Group, I look forward to 
working with Canada’s incoming Am-
bassador, David MacNaughton, to fur-
ther build on our Nation’s great part-
nership. 

f 

NATIONAL CATHOLIC SCHOOLS 
WEEK 

(Mr. LIPINSKI asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. LIPINSKI. Mr. Speaker, this is 
National Catholic Schools Week. I 
want to recognize the outstanding con-
tributions that Catholic schools make 
to our Nation. 

As a proud graduate of St. 
Symphorosa Grammar School and St. 
Ignatius College Prep, and as a strong 
supporter of Catholic education, I have 
introduced H. Res. 592 to honor Catho-
lic Schools Week. 

Since 1974, this week has celebrated 
the important role that Catholic edu-
cation plays in America, especially the 
dedication of Catholic schools to aca-
demic excellence and service. This 
year’s theme—Communities of Faith, 
Knowledge, and Service—highlights the 
values that are central to a Catholic 
education. 

Earlier this week I visited St. Jo-
seph’s School in Lockport, which has 
the distinction of receiving three na-
tional awards in the past 6 years, in-
cluding awards for Pastor Father Greg 
and Principal Lynne Scheffler. Later 
this week I look forward to visiting 
Bridgeport Catholic Academy and St. 
Barnabas School, both in Chicago. 

I applaud the work of these and other 
Catholic schools across the country 
and all they contribute to our great 
Nation. 

f 

HONORING COACH GLENN 
ROBINSON 

(Mr. PITTS asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. PITTS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
in honor of Coach Glenn Robinson of 
Franklin and Marshall College in Lan-
caster. 

For 45 years, since he was only 25 
years old, Coach Robinson has been 
leading the F&M Diplomats to victory. 
Coach Robinson is the winningest 
coach in the history of Division III bas-
ketball. He is now only the third col-
lege basketball coach ever to win 900 
games, behind only legendary Bobby 
Knight of Indiana and Philadelphia’s 
Bob Magee. 

Four times he has broken his own 
school record for best record in the sea-

son, 12 times he has been named Region 
Coach of the Year by the National As-
sociation of Basketball Coaches, 12 
times he has been Conference Coach of 
the Year, he has once been Division 
Coach of the Year, and he has won 93 
postseason victories, 42 NCAA tour-
nament victories, including 16 trips to 
the Sweet 16, 10 trips to the Elite 8, 
five trips to the Final 4, and one na-
tional championship appearance. 

True leadership is servant leadership, 
the kind that finds people’s strengths. 
Coach Robinson is an exemplary lead-
er, and the proof of that is that he 
brings out the best in his players, 25 of 
whom have gone all-American. 

Coach Robinson is one of the greatest 
coaches in college history, and Lan-
caster will always be rightly proud of 
him. 

f 

WE MUST FIX OUR BROKEN 
IMMIGRATION SYSTEM 

(Mr. POLIS asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. POLIS. Mr. Speaker, with one 
item, the American people speak with 
a single voice. They want Congress to 
tackle our broken immigration system, 
secure our borders, and restore the rule 
of law. Yet here we are, more than 
halfway through the 114th Congress, 
and not a single immigration bill that 
fixes the problem has even been 
brought to the floor or committee or 
passed. 

We hear Presidential candidates on 
both sides of the aisle tapping into the 
enormous public sentiment that says 
stop what you are doing and fix our 
broken immigration system. There are 
11 million people or more in our coun-
try illegally. The rule of law has been 
made a mockery of, families are being 
torn apart by ICE and DHS at great 
cost to taxpayers. Let’s fix our immi-
gration system. 

Comprehensive immigration reform 
will save over $200 billion, create hun-
dreds of thousands of jobs for Ameri-
cans, secure our borders, and restore 
the rule of law. 

What is not to like? Let’s come to-
gether around finally fixing the prob-
lem rather than simply complaining 
about it. 

f 

HONORING DAVID LAWSON, ROCH-
ESTER VOLUNTEER FIRE-
FIGHTER 

(Mrs. WALORSKI asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Mrs. WALORSKI. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and pay tribute to a 
brave individual in my district. Roch-
ester volunteer firefighter David 
Lawson was returning home from an 
early-morning medical call last month 
when he hit a deer. While the accident 
only caused minor damage to his vehi-
cle, it delayed his trip home. While he 

was driving, he saw smoke coming out 
of the vents of a nearby property. 

He called 911. He headed to the house 
and began banging on the front door to 
wake up the residents. He woke up the 
adults. The adults grabbed the four 
kids, and they got out safely. We later 
found out the fire started in the attic, 
which is why it did not set off smoke 
detectors. 

David Lawson’s courage and resolve 
to protect the residents of northern In-
diana is truly remarkable. On behalf of 
the people of Indiana’s Second Congres-
sional District, I want to personally 
thank David and every brave man and 
woman who represent Indiana’s finest 
first responder community for their 
collective service and commitment to 
protecting all of our loved ones. 

f 

REMEMBERING THE LEGACY OF 
SACRIFICE AND SERVICE OF 
DAVID MAURITSON AND PHIL 
DRYDEN 

(Mr. BYRNE asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. BYRNE. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to remember two remarkable in-
dividuals who tragically died Monday 
evening in a plane crash in Mobile 
County, Alabama. 

Major David Mauritson of Fairhope 
and Lieutenant Phil Dryden of Gulf 
Shores were members of the Civil Air 
Patrol, and they were returning from a 
compassion flight to Baton Rouge 
where they helped transport a fellow 
citizen for medical care when their 
plane went down. 

David Mauritson had been a member 
of the Civil Air Patrol since 1991 and 
worked for years as a cardiologist and 
a lawyer. He had been flying all his life 
and was committed to helping others 
through charity medical flights. 

Phil Dryden served our country in 
Vietnam as a combat medic. He had 
just joined the Civil Air Patrol last 
year and served as the Mobile squad-
ron’s assistant operations officer. 

Mr. Speaker, one day our time on 
this Earth will draw to a close. When 
that day comes, we will be remembered 
not for what we had, we will be remem-
bered for what we did. 

David Mauritson and Phil Dryden 
left this world helping others. The leg-
acy of service and sacrifice is how they 
will always be remembered. 

On behalf of Alabama’s First Con-
gressional District, I offer my deepest 
condolences to their families. These 
great Americans will be sorely missed. 

f 

IRAN NUCLEAR DEAL 

(Mr. LAMALFA asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. LAMALFA. Mr. Speaker, as part 
of the Iran nuclear deal, the Iranian re-
gime will receive up to $150 billion in 
sanctions relief. Secretary of State 
John Kerry has admitted that some of 
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