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in their own homes also are helping 
seniors stay where they want to be— 
and that is less expensive for taxpayers 
than if these seniors were instead in 
nursing homes. 

Mr. ENZI. I would also like to high-
light the National Resource Center for 
Women and Retirement as a highly 
successful program run by the Women’s 
Institute for a Secure Retirement— 
known to most as ‘‘WISER’’—a non-
profit organization dedicated to ensur-
ing the security of women’s retirement 
income through outreach, partner-
ships, and policy development. The 
staff and programs at WISER have pro-
vided important and effective trainings 
and education in my home State of Wy-
oming, as well as around the country. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. For more than 50 
years, the Older Americans Act has 
been effective in large part because 
these successful programs are funded 
through flexible grants to States. 
States know best what services will be 
most beneficial for their residents to 
live healthier, more independent lives 
as they age. 

I want to thank Senator MURRAY for 
working with me on this bill in our 
committee. 

I want to thank Senator COLLINS, 
whose leadership on the Special Com-
mittee on Aging was instrumental. Her 
determination to help seniors stay 
home and independent helped us get 
this bill through the full Senate. 

I want to thank Senator BURR for his 
determination to get a result on the 
funding issue. 

Finally, I would like to thank Sen-
ator SANDERS for his tireless work on 
this issue and on this bill. 
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NATIONAL CONGENITAL DIA-
PHRAGMATIC HERNIA AWARE-
NESS MONTH 

Mr. SESSIONS. Mr. President, today 
I wish to discuss S. Res. 408. I am de-
lighted that the Senate has unani-
mously declared April as National Con-
genital Diaphragmatic Hernia Aware-
ness Month for the fourth consecutive 
year. I would like to thank my friend 
and able colleague, Senator BEN 
CARDIN of Maryland, for joining me in 
this legislation. This resolution is very 
important to me and my family as my 
grandson Jim Beau is a CDH survivor. 

I specifically wanted to speak today, 
April 19, to commemorate Congenital 
Diaphragmatic Hernia Action Day. 
Charities and families in 60 countries 
and cities all over the U.S. are working 
together to raise CDH Awareness 
through State and town proclamations, 
lighted buildings, Parades of Cherubs, 
fundraisers, and other events. 

CDH is a birth defect that occurs 
when the fetal diaphragm fails to fully 
develop. The lungs develop at the same 
time as the diaphragm and the diges-
tive system. When a diaphragmatic 
hernia occurs, the abdominal organs 
move into and develop in the chest in-
stead of remaining in the abdomen. 
With the heart, lungs, and abdominal 

organs all taking up space in the chest, 
the lungs do not have space to develop 
properly. This may cause the lungs to 
be small and underdeveloped. 

A diaphragmatic hernia is a life- 
threatening condition. When the lungs 
do not develop properly during preg-
nancy, it can be difficult for the baby 
to breathe after birth, or the baby is 
unable to take in enough oxygen to 
stay healthy. 

Several members from the CHERUBS 
group visited my office yesterday. I 
was encouraged by their good spirit 
and enthusiasm. These individuals 
have been coming to Capitol Hill every 
year for the last several years to advo-
cate for Federal assistance for this 
birth defect. Over the last 4 years, we 
have made good progress. 

We have seen an increase in funding 
at the National Institutes of Health, 
NIH. In fiscal year 2015, the NIH funded 
approximately $3,300,000 in CDH re-
search. This is an increase of $800,000 
from fiscal year 2014. We have also seen 
an increase in awareness and edu-
cation. But more research is needed. 
The cause of CDH remains unknown. 
Most cases of diaphragmatic hernia are 
believed to be multifactorial in origin, 
meaning both genetic and environ-
mental factors are involved. It is 
thought that multiple genes from both 
parents, as well as a number of envi-
ronmental factors that scientists do 
not yet fully understand, contribute to 
the development of a diaphragmatic 
hernia. 

Congenital diaphragmatic hernia is a 
birth defect that occurs in 1 out of 
every 3,836 live births worldwide. 

The CDC estimates that CDH affects 
1,088 babies in the U.S. each year. 

Every 10 minutes, a baby is born with 
CDH, adding up to more than 700,000 
babies with CDH since just 2000; yet 
most people have never heard of CDH. 

Up to 20 percent of cases of CDH have 
a genetic cause due to a chromosome 
defect or genetic syndrome. 

According to the CDC, babies born 
with CDH experience a high mortality 
rate ranging from 20–60 percent depend-
ing on the severity of the defect and 
the treatments available at delivery. 
The mortality rate has remained stable 
since 1999. 

Approximately 40 percent of babies 
born with CDH will have other birth 
defects, in addition to CDH. The most 
common is a congenital heart defect. 

Awareness, good prenatal care, early 
diagnosis, and skilled treatment are 
the keys to a greater survival rate in 
these babies. That is why this resolu-
tion is so important. 

In 2009, my grandson Jim Beau was 
diagnosed with CDH during my daugh-
ter Mary Abigail’s 34th week of preg-
nancy. At that time, no one in my fam-
ily had heard of CDH before. My family 
was very lucky that Jim Beau’s defect 
was caught before he was born and that 
he was in the right place to receive ex-
cellent care for his CDH. 

He is now a happy, rambunctious 6- 
year-old. 

The resolution Senator CARDIN and I 
introduced is important because it will 
bring awareness to this birth defect, 
and this awareness will save lives. Al-
though hundreds of thousands of babies 
have been diagnosed with this defect, 
the causes are still unknown, and more 
research is needed. Every year more is 
learned and there are more successes. 
We are making good progress, and we 
must continue these efforts. 

I want to thank my colleagues for 
joining me in supporting this legisla-
tion to bring awareness to CDH. 

I thank the Chair. 
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TRIBUTE TO LARRY MACDONALD 

Ms. BALDWIN. Mr. President, today 
I wish to recognize Larry MacDonald 
as he retires from the city of Bayfield, 
WI, after an impressive 20 years as the 
city’s mayor. Since his election in 1994, 
Larry has dedicated himself to improv-
ing the city of Bayfield and making it 
a wonderful destination in north-
western Wisconsin. 

Larry was born in Munich, Germany, 
to American parents. After growing up 
in the Twin Cities area of Minnesota, 
Larry and his wife, Julie, moved to 
Bayfield in 1989. They opened Cooper 
Hill House B&B, contributing to 
Bayfield’s tradition of welcoming visi-
tors from across the State to beautiful 
Bayfield County. The MacDonalds also 
opened the Apostle Islands Outfitters 
that, for close to two decades, sup-
ported Bayfield and the city’s practice 
of providing outstanding outdoor recre-
ation opportunities to residents and 
tourists alike. 

While he has served as mayor for 20 
years, Larry’s career in public service 
began as a casual interest in local gov-
ernment. However, as a proactive poli-
tician, a committed environmentalist, 
and a savvy businessman, Larry’s cas-
ual interest quickly grew into a re-
markable passion for his work and 
dedication to his city. Over the past 
two decades and despite an ill-fated at-
tempt at retirement in 2004, Larry has 
influenced all aspects of the Bayfield 
community. 

The city of Bayfield is the smallest 
city in Wisconsin, but one of our most 
popular destinations. A beautiful city 
located on Lake Superior, Bayfield 
draws visitors from across the State. 
When others would be daunted, he 
faced head-on the challenges of a local 
economy based on tourism, working 
with local organizations and listening 
closely to his community. Larry also 
dedicated his career to maintaining the 
natural beauty of Lake Superior and 
the Apostle Islands through his work 
as a board member of the Alliance of 
the Great Lakes and the Apostle Is-
lands National Lakeshore. As mayor, 
he led the city to be one of the first in 
the Nation to adopt an eco-munici-
pality resolution, thereby codifying its 
commitment to sustainability, setting 
an example for others to follow, and 
preserving Bayfield’s natural resources 
for generations to come. 
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Larry’s involvement in the commu-

nity goes beyond his work as mayor. 
His many civic contributions include 
roles as master of ceremonies for the 
Bayfield Apple Festival for many 
years, an avid participant in the Big 
Top Chautauqua annual Pie & Politics 
event, and a regular contributor to the 
Bayfield School Reading Days. Larry’s 
influence can be seen throughout the 
city, whether it is through his commu-
nity work, the time he has spent work-
ing at his family’s business interests, 
or simply enjoying the city. 

However, when he looks back on his 
many roles in life, his greatest accom-
plishment will be his 20 years of service 
as mayor. Larry himself describes it as 
the best job he ever had. While he at-
tributes his success to the Bayfield 
community, the city council and his 
dedicated staff, Larry’s success comes 
from his own will. His investment in 
his staff, his honesty and involvement, 
and his personal touch are what 
spurred Bayfield residents to return 
him to office year after year. Although 
in retirement he will no longer be in 
the mayor’s office, Larry’s legacy will 
remain. 

Over the past 20 years, Larry has im-
pacted Bayfield residents and the com-
munity around him through his dedica-
tion, honest nature, and kind heart. I 
am so pleased to join others in recog-
nizing Larry’s success and accomplish-
ments. I wish him, his wife, Julie, their 
children, many grandchildren and 
great-grandchildren all the best in the 
next chapter of their lives together. 
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ADDITIONAL STATEMENTS 

TRIBUTE TO MICHAEL THOMPSON 

∑ Mr, SCOTT. Mr. President, I wish to 
congratulate and recognize Mr. Mi-
chael Thompson of Greenville, SC, for 
receiving one of Scouting’s highest 
honors—the Distinguished Eagle Scout 
Award. This is a significant achieve-
ment and a testament to his continued 
service to our country, State, and espe-
cially to the South Carolina commu-
nity. 

As sitting president of the Blue Ridge 
Council Boy Scouts, Michael Thomp-
son’s love for service and the commu-
nity, as well as his many achieve-
ments, place him in the company of 
other great individuals who have re-
ceived this award, such as President 
Gerald Ford, Neil Armstrong, and 
former Secretary of Defense Dr. Robert 
Gates, to name a few. His involvement 
in the Upstate community represents 
what it truly means to be an out-
standing leader. 

It is with pride and honor that we 
recognize Mr. Michael Thompson and 
his outstanding achievements today 
and add his legacy to our April 19, 2016, 
Congressional Record. We will always 
remember his admiration for the com-
munity, the Upstate, and above all for 
the scouts.∑ 

100TH ANNIVERSARY OF THE 
FOUNTAIN INN WESLEYAN 
METHODIST CHURCH 

∑ Mr. SCOTT. Mr. President, today I 
wish to honor one of South Carolina’s 
most impactful ministries, the Foun-
tain Inn Wesleyan Methodist Church. 
Celebrating 100 years of faith and 
teachings on April 24, 2016, the church 
has remained dedicated to its vision, 
‘‘To exalt Jesus Christ by Evangelizing 
the Lost, Disciplining Believers, Equip-
ping the Church, and Ministering to 
the Community,’’ and intends to con-
tinue on this path for years to come. 

Evangelist Rev. J.M. Hames first or-
ganized the church in 1916, and its offi-
cial name, the Wesleyan Church, was 
obtained in 1968 following mergers with 
several other denominations. Fol-
lowing a tent revival meeting at the 
start of its history, the church began 
as a place of worship for workers and 
residents of the Woodside Mill Village 
community. It was later provided its 
permanent place of worship when the 
Woodside Mill company deeded the 
building and property to the Wesleyan 
Methodist Church. 

Despite many changes incurred over 
time, including the leadership of 21 
pastors, the church has continued to 
serve the community without straying 
from its initial mission. The Fountain 
Inn Wesleyan Methodist Church has re-
mained a consistent source of guidance 
for its community and has brought 
many individuals to know the Lord 
throughout its history. 

It is with honor and admiration that 
we recognize the Fountain Inn Wes-
leyan Methodist Church and its great 
impact, adding its legacy to our April 
19, 2016, Congressional Record.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO SOPHIE DOEDEN 

∑ Mr. THUNE. Mr. President, today I 
recognize Sophie Doeden, an intern in 
my Aberdeen, SD, office for all of the 
hard work she has done for me, my 
staff, and the State of South Dakota. 

Sophie is a graduate of Beresford 
High School in Beresford, SD. Cur-
rently, Sophie is attending Northern 
State University, where she is major-
ing in political science. Sophie is a 
dedicated worker who has been com-
mitted to getting the most out of her 
experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Sophie Doeden for all of 
the fine work she has done and wish 
her continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 
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MESSAGE FROM THE PRESIDENT 

A message from the President of the 
United States was communicated to 
the Senate by Mr. Pate, one of his sec-
retaries. 

PRESIDENTIAL MESSAGE 

REPORT RELATIVE TO THE 
ISSUANCE OF AN EXECUTIVE 
ORDER EXPANDING THE SCOPE 
OF THE NATIONAL EMERGENCY 
ORIGINALLY DECLARED IN EX-
ECUTIVE ORDER 13566 OF FEB-
RUARY 25, 2011, WITH RESPECT 
TO LIBYA—PM 46 

The PRESIDING OFFICER laid be-
fore the Senate the following message 
from the President of the United 
States, together with an accompanying 
report; which was referred to the Com-
mittee on Banking, Housing, and 
Urban Affairs: 

To the Congress of the United States: 
Pursuant to the International Emer-

gency Economic Powers Act (50 U.S.C. 
1701 et seq.) (IEEPA), I hereby report 
that I have issued an Executive Order 
(the ‘‘order’’) expanding the scope of 
the national emergency declared in Ex-
ecutive Order 13566 of February 25, 2011, 
with respect to the unusual and ex-
traordinary threat to the national se-
curity and foreign policy of the United 
States posed by the situation in Libya. 

In the order, I find that the ongoing 
violence in Libya, including attacks by 
armed groups against Libyan state fa-
cilities, foreign missions in Libya, and 
critical infrastructure, as well as 
human rights abuses, violations of the 
arms embargo imposed by United Na-
tions Security Council Resolution 1970 
(2011), and misappropriation of Libya’s 
natural resources threaten the peace, 
security, stability, sovereignty, demo-
cratic transition, and territorial integ-
rity of Libya, and thereby constitute 
an unusual and extraordinary threat to 
the national security and foreign pol-
icy of the United States. The order 
blocks the property and interests in 
property of persons determined by the 
Secretary of the Treasury, in consulta-
tion with the Secretary of State: 

∑ to be responsible for or complicit 
in, or to have engaged in, directly or 
indirectly, any of the following: 

Æ actions or policies that threaten 
the peace, security, or stability of 
Libya, including through the supply of 
arms or related materiel; 

Æ actions or policies that obstruct, 
undermine, delay, or impede, or pose a 
significant risk of obstructing, under-
mining, delaying, or impeding, the 
adoption of or political transition to a 
Government of National Accord or a 
successor government; 

Æ actions that may lead to or result 
in the misappropriation of state assets 
of Libya; or 

Æ threatening or coercing Libyan 
state financial institutions or the Lib-
yan National Oil Company; 

∑ to be planning, directing, or com-
mitting or to have planned, directed, or 
committed, attacks against any Liby-
an state facility or installation (in-
cluding oil facilities), against any air, 
land, or sea port in Libya, or against 
any foreign mission in Libya; 
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