H3620

This bill would simply require agencies to
create a short, plain language summary and a
website link to make it easily accessible so
that all Americans can easily find and under-
stand the rules being proposed by the admin-
istration.

Giving Americans—and especially small
businesses—a one-hundred-word, plain lan-
guage summary for an otherwise convoluted
government rulemaking provides much need-
ed streamlining and transparency.

| hope my colleagues on both sides of the
aisle will vote for this bill to help the small
business owners who create jobs and eco-
nomic growth nationwide focus on running
their businesses, not sifting through long-wind-
ed government documents.

| thank Senator LANKFORD for getting this bill
across the finish line in the Senate. | encour-
age my colleagues to vote in favor of the Pro-
viding Accountability Through Transparency
Act.

Ms. JACKSON LEE. Mr. Speaker, | rise
today in support of S. 111, the Providing Ac-
countability Through Transparency Act.

S. 111 would require each agency, in pro-
viding notice of a rulemaking, to include a link
to a 100-word plain language summary of the
proposed rule, to be made available on the
website regulations.gov.

Our job here is public service—not for our
benefit, but the enrichment of our commu-
nities, state, and Nation.

The bills we pass here directly affect the
lives of everyday Americans.

Therefore, the public must be able to ac-
cess and provide their input regarding rules.

For those who may not be experts in the
subject matter of the rule, S. 111 provides that
a plain-language summary of 100 words or
less be made available by agencies at regula-
tions.gov.

Having this clear and simplistic summary
will give members of the public the opportunity
to provide specific and useful comments to
those of us who serve them.

Plain language makes it easier for the public
to read, understand, and use government
communications.

As a result, Americans understand docu-
ments more quickly, call less often for expla-
nations, and make fewer errors filling out
forms.

All in all, Americans comply more accurately
and quickly with requirements when written in
plain language.

Ultimately, this helps improve government
transparency and empower greater participa-
tion in the democratic process.

Through plain language, Americans are
broadly better able to understand their options
and the policies their government is pursuing.

Simply put, Americans are better able to
participate in the debate once they understand
their choices.

In addition, the Congressional Budget Office
expects that preparing this short summary of
proposed rules would not significantly increase
agencies’ administrative costs.

Further, this remains true when the costs of
implementation are assessed over a five year
period, with the Congressional Budget Office
estimating no significant costs accruing
through implementation of this policy from
2023 through 2028.

In fact, such a measure is likely to save fed-
eral government dollars in the long run.

Because Americans understand more imme-
diately, file documents with greater accuracy,

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

and have less need to seek explanations from
bureaucrats, plain language saves government
employees time and allows them to work more
effectively and efficiently.

Multiple studies have shown that plain lan-
guage improves bottom lines by saving time,
personnel resources, and money, all while
providing better service to Americans.

| urge my colleagues to support this com-
mon-sense measure that improves trans-
parency, accessibility of information, and the
ability of Americans to thoughtfully participate
in the democratic process.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The
question is on the motion offered by
the gentleman from New Jersey (Mr.
VAN DREW) that the House suspend the
rules and pass the bill, S. 111.

The question was taken.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. In the
opinion of the Chair, two-thirds being
in the affirmative, the ayes have it.

Mr. VAN DREW. Mr. Speaker, on
that I demand the yeas and nays.

The yeas and nays were ordered.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 8 of rule XX, further pro-
ceedings on this motion will be post-
poned.

———————

ANIMAL DRUG AND ANIMAL GE-
NERIC DRUG USER FEE AMEND-
MENTS OF 2023

Mr. BILIRAKIS. Mr. Speaker, I move
to suspend the rules and pass the bill
(H.R. 1418) to amend the Federal Food,
Drug, and Cosmetic Act to reauthorize
user fee programs relating to new ani-
mal drugs and generic new animal
drugs, as amended.

The Clerk read the title of the bill.

The text of the bill is as follows:

H.R. 1418

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘“‘Animal Drug
and Animal Generic Drug User Fee Amendments
of 2023”.

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.
The table of contents for this Act is the fol-
lowing:
Sec. 1. Short title.
Sec. 2. Table of contents.
TITLE [—FEES RELATING TO ANIMAL
DRUGS
Short title; finding.
Definitions.
Authority to assess and use animal
drug fees.
Reauthorication;
ments.
Savings clause.
Sec. 106. Effective date.
Sec. 107. Sunset dates.
TITLE II—FEES RELATING TO GENERIC
ANIMAL DRUGS
Short title; finding.
Authority to assess and use generic
new animal drug fees.
Reauthorization; reporting
ments.
Savings clause.
Sec. 205. Effective date.
Sec. 206. Sunset dates.
TITLE III—SUPPORTING ANIMAL AND
HUMAN HEALTH

Sec. 301. Reporting requirements.

101.
102.
103.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec. 104.

reporting require-

Sec. 105.

201.
202.

Sec.
Sec.
203.

Sec. require-

Sec. 204.

July 17, 2023

Sec. 302. Definition of major species.
Sec. 303. Antimicrobdial resistance.
TITLE I—FEES RELATING TO ANIMAL
DRUGS
SEC. 101. SHORT TITLE; FINDING.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This title may be cited as
the ‘“‘Animal Drug User Fee Amendments of
2023".

(b) FINDING.—Congress finds that the fees au-
thorized by the amendments made in this title
will be dedicated toward expediting the animal
drug development process and the review of new
and supplemental animal drug applications and
investigational animal drug submissions as set
forth in the goals identified for purposes of part
4 of subchapter C of chapter VII of the Federal
Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 379j-11
et seq.), in the letters from the Secretary of
Health and Human Services to the Chairman of
the Committee on Energy and Commerce of the
House of Representatives and the Chairman of
the Committee on Health, Education, Labor,
and Pensions of the Senate as set forth in the
Congressional Record.

SEC. 102. DEFINITIONS.

Section 739 of the Federal Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 379j-11) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (3), by striking ‘‘national
drug code’” and inserting ‘‘National Drug
Code’’; and

(2) by amending paragraph (8)(I) to read as
follows:

‘“(I) The activities necessary for implementa-
tion of the United States and European Union
Mutual Recognition Agreement for Pharma-
ceutical Good Manufacturing Practice Inspec-
tions, and the United States and United King-
dom Mutual Recognition Agreement Sectoral
Annex for Pharmaceutical Good Manufacturing
Practices, and other mutual recognition agree-
ments, with respect to animal drug products
subject to review, including implementation ac-
tivities prior to and following product ap-
proval.”.

SEC. 103. AUTHORITY TO ASSESS AND USE ANI-
MAL DRUG FEES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 740(a)(1)(A)(ii) of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3797-12(a)(1)(A)(ii)) is amended—

(1) in subclause (1), by striking “‘and’ at the
end;

(2) in subclause (II), by striking the period at
the end and inserting ‘‘; and’’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

‘“(I111) an application for conditional approval
under section 571 of a mew animal drug for
which an animal drug application submitted
under section 512(b)(1) has been previously ap-
proved under section 512(d)(1) for another in-
tended use.”’.

(b) FEE REVENUE AMOUNTS.—Section 740(b)(1)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-12(b)(1)) is amended to read as fol-
lows:

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—Subject to subsections (c),
(d), (f), and (g), for each of fiscal years 2024
through 2028, the fees required under subsection
(a) shall be established to generate a total rev-
enue amount of $33,500,000.”’.

(c) ANNUAL FEE SETTING; ADJUSTMENTS.—

(1) ANNUAL FEE SETTING.—Section 740(c)(1) of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-12(c)(1)) is amended to read as fol-
lows:

‘““(1) ANNUAL FEE SETTING.—Not later than 60
days before the start of each fiscal year begin-
ning after September 30, 2023, the Secretary
shall—

““(A) establish for that fiscal year animal drug
application fees, supplemental animal drug ap-
plication fees, animal drug sponsor fees, animal
drug establishment fees, and animal drug prod-
uct fees based on the revenue amounts estab-
lished under subsection (b) and the adjustments
provided under this subsection; and

‘““(B) publish such fee revenue amounts and
fees in the Federal Register.”.



July 17, 2023

(2) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—Section 740(c)(2)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 379j-12(c)(2)) is amended—

(4) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) in the matter preceding clause (i), by strik-
ing 2020’ and inserting ‘‘2025°°; and

(i) in clause (iii), by striking ‘‘Baltimore’’ and
inserting ‘‘Arlington-Alexandria’’; and

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking ‘2020’
and inserting ‘‘2025°°.

(3) WORKLOAD ADJUSTMENTS.—Section
740(c)(3) of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cos-
metic Act (21 U.S.C. 3795—-12(c)(3)) is amended—

(4) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) in the matter preceding clause (i)—

(1) by striking 2020”° and inserting
and

(II) by striking ‘‘subparagraphs (B) and (C)”
and inserting ‘‘subparagraph (B)’’;

(ii) in clause (i) by striking “‘and’ at the end;
and

(iii) by striking clause (ii) and inserting the
following:

““(ii) such adjustment shall be made for each
fiscal year that the adjustment determined by
the Secretary is greater than 3 percent, except
for the first fiscal year that the adjustment is
greater than 3 percent; and

““(iii) the Secretary shall publish in the Fed-
eral Register motice under paragraph (1) the
amount of such adjustment and the supporting
methodologies.’’;

(B) by striking subparagraph (B); and

(C) by redesignating subparagraph (C) as sub-
paragraph (B).

(4) FINAL YEAR ADJUSTMENT.—Section 740(c)(4)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-12(c)(4)) is amended to read as fol-
lows:

““(4) OPERATING RESERVE ADJUSTMENT.—

‘““(A) IN GENERAL.—For fiscal year 2025 and
each subsequent fiscal year, after the fee rev-
enue amount established under subsection (b) is
adjusted in accordance with paragraphs (2) and
(3), the Secretary shall—

““(i) increase the fee revenue amount for such
fiscal year, if necessary to provide an operating
reserve of not less than 12 weeks; or

““(ii) if the Secretary has an operating reserve
in excess of the mumber of weeks specified in
subparagraph (C) for that fiscal year, the Sec-
retary shall decrease the fee revenue amount to
provide mot more than the number of weeks
specified in subparagraph (C) for that fiscal
year.

‘““(B) CARRYOVER USER FEES.—For purposes of
this paragraph, the operating reserve of carry-
over user fees for the process for the review of
animal drug applications does not include car-
ryover user fees that have mot been appro-
priated.

“(C) NUMBER OF WEEKS OF OPERATING RE-
SERVES.—The number of weeks of operating re-
serves specified in this subparagraph is—

““(i) 22 weeks for fiscal year 2025;

““(ii) 20 weeks for fiscal year 2026,

““(iii) 18 weeks for fiscal year 2027; and

“‘(iv) 16 weeks for fiscal year 2028.

‘(D) PUBLICATION.—If an adjustment to the
operating reserve is made under this paragraph,
the Secretary shall publish in the Federal Reg-
ister notice under paragraph (1) the rationale
for the amount of the adjustment and the sup-
porting methodologies.”.

(d) EXEMPTION FROM FEES.—Section 740(d)(4)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 379j-12(d)(4)) is amended to read as fol-
lows:

‘“(4) EXEMPTION FROM FEES.—Fees under
paragraphs (2), (3), and (4) of subsection (a)
shall not apply with respect to any person who
is the named applicant or sponsor of an animal
drug application, supplemental animal drug ap-
plication, or investigational animal drug Sub-
mission if such application or submission in-
volves the intentional genomic alteration of an
animal that is intended to produce a drug, de-
vice, or biological product subject to fees under
section 736, 738, 744B, or 744H.”’.

“20257’;

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

(e) CREDITING AND AVAILABILITY OF FEES.—

(1) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Sec-
tion 740(g)(3) of the Federal Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 3795-12(g)(3)) is amend-
ed by striking ‘2019 through 2023’ and inserting
2024 through 2028”’.

(2) COLLECTION SHORTFALLS.—Section 740(g)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 379j-12(g)) is amended—

(4) in paragraph (3), by striking “‘and para-
graph (5)”’; and

(B) by striking paragraph (5).

SEC. 104. REAUTHORIZATION; REPORTING RE-
QUIREMENTS.

Section 740A of the Federal Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 379j-13) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking ‘2018’ and
inserting ‘2023"’;

(2) by striking ‘2019’ each place it appears in
subsections (a) and (b) and inserting ‘‘2024°’;
and

(3) in subsection (d)—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking 2023 and
inserting ‘‘2028”’; and

(B) in paragraph (5), by striking 2023 and
inserting ‘2028”°.

SEC. 105. SAVINGS CLAUSE.

Notwithstanding the amendments made by
this title, part 4 of subchapter C of chapter VII
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-11 et seq.), as in effect on the day
before the date of enactment of this title, shall
continue to be in effect with respect to animal
drug applications and supplemental animal
drug applications (as defined in such part as of
such day) that on or after October 1, 2018, but
before October 1, 2023, were accepted by the
Food and Drug Administration for filing with
respect to assessing and collecting any fee re-
quired by such part for a fiscal year prior to fis-
cal year 2024.

SEC. 106. EFFECTIVE DATE.

The amendments made by this title shall take
effect on October 1, 2023, or the date of the en-
actment of this Act, whichever is later, except
that fees under part 4 of subchapter C of chap-
ter VII of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic
Act (21 U.S.C. 379j-11 et seq.), as amended by
this title, shall be assessed for animal drug ap-
plications and supplemental animal drug appli-
cations received on or after October 1, 2023, re-
gardless of the date of the enactment of this Act.
SEC. 107. SUNSET DATES.

(a) AUTHORIZATION.—Sections 739 and 740 of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 21 U.S.C. 379j-11; 379j—12) shall cease to
be effective October 1, 2028.

(b) REPORTING REQUIREMENTS.—Section 740A
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3797-13) shall cease to be effective Janu-
ary 31, 2029.

(c) PREVIOUS SUNSET PROVISION.—Effective
October 1, 2023, subsections (a) and (b) of sec-
tion 107 of the Animal Drug User Fee Amend-
ments of 2018 (Public Law 115-234) are repealed.

TITLE II—FEES RELATING TO GENERIC
ANIMAL DRUGS
SEC. 201. SHORT TITLE; FINDING.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This title may be cited as
the ‘“‘Animal Generic Drug User Fee Amend-
ments of 2023”°.

(b) FINDING.—Congress finds that the fees au-
thorized by the amendments made in this title
will be dedicated toward expediting the generic
new animal drug development process and the
review of abbreviated applications for generic
new animal drugs, supplemental abbreviated ap-
plications for generic new animal drugs, and in-
vestigational submissions for generic mew ani-
mal drugs as set forth in the goals identified for
purposes of part 5 of subchapter C of chapter
VII of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic
Act (21 U.S.C. 379521 et seq.), in the letters from
the Secretary of Health and Human Services to
the Chairman of the Committee on Energy and
Commerce of the House of Representatives and

H3621

the Chairman of the Committee on Health, Edu-

cation, Labor and Pensions of the Senate as set

forth in the Congressional Record.

SEC. 202. AUTHORITY TO ASSESS AND USE GE-
NERIC NEW ANIMAL DRUG FEES.

(a) GENERIC INVESTIGATIONAL NEW ANIMAL
DRUG FILE FEE.—Section 741(a) of the Federal
Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 379j—
21(a)) is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

‘“(4) GENERIC INVESTIGATIONAL NEW ANIMAL
DRUG FILE FEE.—

““(A) IN GENERAL.—

‘(i) NEW FILE REQUEST.—Each person that
submits a request to establish a generic inves-
tigational new animal drug file on or after Octo-
ber 1, 2023, shall be assessed a fee as established
under subsection (c).

““(1i) NEW SUBMISSION TO ESTABLISHED FILE.—
Each person that makes a submission to a ge-
neric investigational new animal drug file on or
after October 1, 2023, where such file was estab-
lished prior to October 1, 2023, shall be assessed
a fee for the first submission on or after October
1, 2023, as established under subsection (c).

“(B) PAYMENT.—

““(i) NEW FILE REQUEST.—The fee required by
subparagraph (A)(i) shall be due upon submis-
sion of the request to establish the generic inves-
tigational new animal drug file.

““(i1) NEW SUBMISSION TO ESTABLISHED FILE.—
The fee required by subparagraph (A)(ii) shall
be due upon the first submission to the generic
investigational new animal drug file.

“(C) EXCEPTIONS.—

““(i) TERMINATING AN EXISTING GENERIC INVES-
TIGATIONAL NEW ANIMAL DRUG FILE.—If a person
makes a submission to the generic investiga-
tional new animal drug file to terminate that
file, the person shall not be subject to a fee
under subparagraph (A)(ii) for that submission.

““(ii) TRANSFERRING AN EXISTING GENERIC IN-
VESTIGATIONAL NEW ANIMAL DRUG FILE—If a
person makes a submission to the generic inves-
tigational new animal drug file to transfer that
file to a different generic new animal drug spon-
sor, the person shall not be subject to a fee
under subparagraph (A)(ii) for that submis-
sion.”’.

(b) FEE REVENUE AMOUNTS.—Section 741(b) of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 379j-21(b)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking 2019 through 2023 and in-
serting ‘2024 through 2028”°; and

(B) by striking ‘318,336,340’ and inserting
““$25,000,000”’; and

(2) in paragraph (2)—

(A) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) by striking ‘25 percent’ and inserting ‘20
percent’’; and

(ii) by inserting before the semicolon at the
end the following: ‘“‘and fees under subsection
(a)(4) (relating to generic investigational new
animal drug files)’’;

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking “37.5
percent’ and inserting ‘40 percent’’; and

(C) in subparagraph (C), by striking “‘37.5 per-
cent’”’ and inserting ‘40 percent’’.

(c) ANNUAL FEE SETTING; ADJUSTMENTS.—

(1) ANNUAL FEE SETTING.— Section 741(c)(1) of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-21(c)(1)) is amended to read as fol-
lows:

‘““(1) ANNUAL FEE SETTING.—The Secretary
shall establish, not later than 60 days before the
start of each fiscal year beginning after Sep-
tember 30, 2023, for that fiscal year—

“(A) abbreviated application fees that are
based on the revenue amounts established under
subsection (b), the adjustments provided under
this subsection, and the amount of fees antici-
pated to be collected under subsection (a)(4)
during that fiscal year;

‘““(B) generic new animal drug sponsor fees,
and generic new animal drug product fees,
based on the revenue amounts established under
subsection (b) and the adjustments provided
under this subsection; and



H3622

‘“(C) a generic investigational mew animal
drug file fee of 350,000 for each request or sub-
mission described in subsection (a)(4)(A4).”.

(2) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—Section 741(c)(2)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3797-21(c)(2)) is amended—

(A4) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) in the matter preceding clause (i), by strik-
ing 2020’ and inserting ‘‘2025°; and

(ii) in clause (iii), by striking ‘‘Baltimore’ and
inserting ‘‘Arlington-Alexandria’’; and

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking ‘2020’
and inserting ‘‘2025”°.

(3) WORKLOAD ADJUSTMENT.—Section 741(c)(3)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-21(c)(3)) is amended—

(4) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) in the matter preceding clause (i), by strik-
ing 2020’ and inserting ‘‘2025°’;

(ii) in clause (i)—

(I) by striking ‘“‘and investigational generic
new animal drug protocol submissions’ and in-
serting ‘‘investigational generic mnew animal
drug protocol submissions, requests to establish
a generic investigational new animal drug file,
and generic investigational new animal drug
meeting requests’’; and

(II) by striking *‘; and’ and inserting a semi-
colon;

(iii) by redesignating clause (ii) as clause (iii);
and

(iv) by inserting after clause (i) the following:

““(ii) if the workload adjustment calculated by
the Secretary under clause (i) exceeds 25 per-
cent, the Secretary shall use 25 percent for the
adjustment; and’’; and

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking ‘2021
through 2023 and inserting ‘2026 through
2028,

(4) FINAL YEAR ADJUSTMENT.—Section 741(c)(4)
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-21(c)(4)) is amended—

(A) by striking ‘2023’ each place it appears
and inserting ‘‘2028”’; and

(B) by striking ‘2024’ and inserting ‘2029’.

(d) FEE WAIVER OR REDUCTION;, EXEMPTION
FROM FEES.—Subsection (d) of section 741 of the
Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 379j-21) is amended to read as follows:

‘““(d) FEE WAIVER OR REDUCTION.—The Sec-
retary shall grant a waiver from, or a reduction
of, one or more fees assessed under subsection
(a) where the Secretary finds that the generic
new animal drug is intended solely to provide
for a minor use or minor species indication.”’.

(e) EFFECT OF FAILURE TO PAY FEES.—Section
741(e) of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic
Act (21 U.S.C. 3795-21(e)) is amended by striking
“The Secretary may discontinue’ and inserting
“A request to establish a generic investigational
new animal drug file that is submitted by a per-
son subject to fees under subsection (a) shall be
considered incomplete and shall not be accepted
for action by the Secretary until all fees owed
by such person have been paid. The Secretary
may discontinue’’.

(f) ASSESSMENT OF FEES.—Section 741(f)(2) of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-21(f)(2)) is amended by striking
‘“‘sponsors, and generic new animal drug prod-
ucts at any time” and inserting ‘‘products, ge-
neric new animal drug sponsors, and generic in-
vestigational new animal drug files at any
time’’.

(9) CREDITING AND AVAILABILITY OF FEES.—
Section 741(g) of the Federal Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 3797-21(g)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (3), by striking 2019
through 2023 and inserting ‘2024 through
2028"’;

(2) by striking the second paragraph (4) (relat-
ing to Offset), as added by section 202 of the
Animal Generic Drug User Fee Amendments of
2013 (Public Law 113-14); and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

““(5) RECOVERY OF COLLECTION SHORTFALLS.—
The amount of fees otherwise authorized to be
collected under this section shall be increased—

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

“(A) for fiscal year 2026, by the amount, if
any, by which the amount collected under this
section and appropriated for fiscal year 2024
falls below the amount of fees authorized for fis-
cal year 2024 under paragraph (3);

“(B) for fiscal year 2027, by the amount, if
any, by which the amount collected under this
section and appropriated for fiscal year 2025
falls below the amount of fees authorized for fis-
cal year 2025 under paragraph (3); and

“(C) for fiscal year 2028, by the amount, if
any, by which the amount collected under this
section and appropriated for fiscal years 2026
and 2027 (including estimated collections for fis-
cal year 2027) falls below the amount of fees au-
thorized for such fiscal years under paragraph
(3).”.

(h) DEFINITIONS.—Section 741(k) of the Fed-
eral Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C.
3797-21(k)) is amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (8), (9), (10),
and (11) as paragraphs (9), (10), (11), and (13),
respectively;

(2) by inserting after paragraph (7) the fol-
lowing:

““(8) GENERIC INVESTIGATIONAL NEW ANIMAL
DRUG MEETING REQUEST.—The term ‘generic in-
vestigational new animal drug meeting request’
means a request submitted by a generic new ani-
mal drug sponsor to meet with the Secretary to
discuss an investigational submission for a ge-
neric new animal drug.’’;

(3) in paragraph (11) (as so redesignated), by
adding at the end the following:

“(1) The activities necessary for exploration
and implementation of the United States and
European Union Mutual Recognition Agreement
for Pharmaceutical Good Manufacturing Prac-
tice Inspections, and the United States and
United Kingdom Mutual Recognition Agreement
Sectoral Annex for Pharmaceutical Good Manu-
facturing Practices, and other mutual recogni-
tion agreements, with respect to generic mew
animal drug products subject to review, includ-
ing implementation activities prior to and fol-
lowing product approval.’”’; and

(4) by inserting after paragraph (11) (as so re-
designated) the following:

““(12) REQUEST TO ESTABLISH A GENERIC INVES-
TIGATIONAL NEW ANIMAL DRUG FILE.—The term
‘request to establish a generic investigational
new animal drug file’ means the submission to
the Secretary of a request to establish a generic
investigational new animal drug file to contain
investigational submissions for a generic new
animal drug.”’.

SEC. 203. REAUTHORIZATION; REPORTING RE-
QUIREMENTS.

Section 742 of the Federal Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 379j-22) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking ‘2018 and
inserting ‘‘2023’;

(2) by striking ‘2019 each place it appears in
subsections (a) and (b) and inserting 2024°’;
and

(3) in subsection (d), by striking ‘2023 each
place it appears and inserting ‘‘2028°°.

SEC. 204. SAVINGS CLAUSE.

Notwithstanding the amendments made by
this title, part 5 of subchapter C of chapter VII
of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-21 et seq.), as in effect on the day
before the date of enactment of this title, shall
continue to be in effect with respect to abbre-
viated applications for a generic new animal
drug and supplemental abbreviated applications
for a generic new animal drug (as defined in
such part as of such day) that on or after Octo-
ber 1, 2018, but before October 1, 2023, were ac-
cepted by the Food and Drug Administration for
filing with respect to assessing and collecting
any fee required by such part for a fiscal year
prior to fiscal year 2024.

SEC. 205. EFFECTIVE DATE.

The amendments made by this title shall take
effect on October 1, 2023, or the date of the en-
actment of this Act, whichever is later, except

July 17, 2023

that fees under part 5 of subchapter C of chap-
ter VII of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic
Act (21 U.S.C. 379521 et seq.), as amended by
this title, shall be assessed for abbreviated appli-
cations for a generic new animal drug and sSup-
plemental abbreviated applications for a generic
new animal drug received on or after October 1,
2023, regardless of the date of enactment of this
Act.

SEC. 206. SUNSET DATES.

(a) AUTHORIZATION.—Section 741 of the Fed-
eral Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C.
3797-21) shall cease to be effective October 1,
2028.

(b) REPORTING REQUIREMENTS.—Section 742 of
the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21
U.S.C. 3795-22) shall cease to be effective Janu-
ary 31, 2029.

(c) PREVIOUS SUNSET PROVISION.—Effective
October 1, 2023, subsections (a) and (b) of sec-
tion 206 of the Animal Generic Drug User Fee
Amendments of 2018 (Public Law 115-234) are re-
pealed.

TITLE III—SUPPORTING ANIMAL AND

HUMAN HEALTH
SEC. 301. REPORTING REQUIREMENTS.

Section 740A of the Federal Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 379j-13), as amended by
section 104, is further amended—

(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) by striking ‘“‘Beginning with’’ and insert-
ing the following:

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—Beginning with’’; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

““(2) CONTENTS.—The report under paragraph
(1) shall include the following:

‘““(4) Data, analysis and discussion of the
changes in the number of individuals hired and
funded by fees collected pursuant to section 740,
and data, analysis, and discussion of the num-
ber of full-time equivalents in the animal drug
review program, including a breakdown by
funding from fees collected pursuant to section
740 versus budget authority, and by each divi-
sion within the Center for Veterinary Medicine,
the Office of Regulatory Affairs, and the Office
of the Commissioner.

‘““(B) Data, analysis, and discussion of the
changes in the fee revenue amounts and costs
for the process for the review of animal drug ap-
plications, including identifying—

‘(i) the drivers of such changes; and

‘““(i1) changes in the total cost per full-time
equivalent in the animal drug review program.

‘“(C) Data, analysis, and discussion of
changes in the average full-time equivalent
hours required to complete review of each type
of animal drug application.

““(D) For fiscal years 2024 and 2025, of the
meeting requests from animal drug sponsors for
which the Secretary has determined that a face-
to-face meeting is appropriate, the number of
face-to-face meetings requested by sponsors to
be conducted in person (in such manner as the
Secretary shall prescribe on the website of the
Food and Drug Administration), and the num-
ber of such in-person meetings granted by the
Secretary.”’; and

(2) in subsection (d)—

(4) in paragraph (5), by inserting a comma
after “paragraph (4)’;

(B) by redesignating paragraph (6) as para-
graph (7);

(C) by inserting after paragraph (5) the fol-
lowing:

‘““(6) UPDATES TO CONGRESS.—The Secretary,
in consultation with regulated industry, shall
provide regular updates on negotiations on the
reauthorization of this part to the Committee on
Health, Education, Labor, and Pensions of the
Senate and the Committee on Energy and Com-
merce of the House of Representatives.”’; and

(D) in paragraph (7) (as so redesignated)—

(1) in subparagraph (A)—

(I) by striking ‘‘Before presenting the rec-
ommendations developed under paragraphs (1)
through (5) to Congress, the Secretary’ and in-
serting ‘‘The Secretary’’; and



July 17, 2023

(II) by inserting before the period at the end
the following: *‘, not later than 30 days after
each such negotiation meeting’’; and

(ii) in subparagraph (B), by inserting *, in
sufficient detail,”” after “‘shall summarize’.

SEC. 302. DEFINITION OF MAJOR SPECIES.

Section 20I1(nn) of the Federal Food, Drug,
and Cosmetic Act (21 U.S.C. 321(nn)) is amended
by inserting ‘‘, or remove species from,” after
“‘add species to’’.

SEC. 303. ANTIMICROBIAL RESISTANCE.

(a) REPORT ON ANTIMICROBIAL STEWARD-
SHIP.—Not later than December 31, 2023, the
Secretary of Health and Human Services, acting
through the Commissioner of Food and Drugs,
shall submit to the Committee on Energy and
Commerce of the House of Representatives and
the Committee on Health, Education, Labor,
and Pensions of the Senate a report describing—

(1) activities conducted by the Center for Vet-
erinary Medicine of the Food and Drug Admin-
istration (referred to in this section as ‘‘the Cen-
ter’”) during the period of fiscal years 2019
through 2023 to support antimicrobial steward-
ship in wveterinary settings, including ongoing
activities and the targeted completion date of
such activities; and

(2) with respect to antimicrobial stewardship
in veterinary settings—

(A) the goals of the Center regarding sup-
porting antimicrobial stewardship in veterinary
settings;

(B) activities the Center plans to execute dur-
ing the period of fiscal years 2024 through 2028
to support such goals, including targeted com-
pletion dates for such activities; and

(C) metrics the Center plans to use to evaluate
progress toward its goals regarding supporting
antimicrobial stewardship in veterinary settings.

(b) ANNUAL PROGRESS REPORTS.—Not later
than 120 days after the end of each fiscal year
during which fees are collected under section
740, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee
on Energy and Commerce of the House of Rep-
resentatives and the Committee on Health, Edu-
cation, Labor, and Pensions of the Senate a re-
port that includes—

(1) a description of activities conducted by the
Center in the prior fiscal year to support anti-
microbial stewardship in veterinary settings, in-
cluding progress made toward goals and activi-
ties specified in subsection (a)(2);

(2) in the case of an incomplete activity de-
scribed in subsection (a)(2)(B) for which the tar-
get completion date has passed—

(4) an explanation for why such target com-
pletion date was not met; and

(B) if applicable, the updated expected com-
pletion date for such activity;

(3) a description of emerging challenges re-
lated to antimicrobial stewardship in veterinary
settings that impact Center activities; and

(4) a description of activities undertaken to
incentivize the development of new drugs for the
treatment, prevention, or control of bacterial
diseases in animals.

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr. VAN
DREW). Pursuant to the rule, the gen-
tleman from Florida (Mr. BILIRAKIS)
and the gentlewoman from Washington
(Ms. SCHRIER) each will control 20 min-
utes.

The Chair recognizes the gentleman
from Florida.

GENERAL LEAVE

Mr. BILIRAKIS. Mr. Speaker, I ask
unanimous consent that all Members
may have b5 legislative days in which to
revise and extend their remarks and in-
clude extraneous material in the
RECORD on the bill.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is there
objection to the request of the gen-
tleman from Florida?

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

There was no objection.

Mr. BILIRAKIS. Mr. Speaker, I yield
myself such time as I may consume.

Mr. Speaker, I rise today in support
of H.R. 1418, the Animal Drug and Ani-
mal Generic Drug User Fee Amend-
ments of 2023, sponsored by my good
friend, Mr. PENCE, and, of course, Ms.
SCHRIER on the Democrat side and
their members on the Energy and Com-
merce Committee.

Our committee has worked hard on
this legislation for many months, hold-
ing a legislative hearing in March and
two markups this spring before advanc-
ing it out of full committee last month
by a vote of 49-0.

At each step, our members worked in
a bipartisan fashion to consider ways
to make improvements to this legisla-
tion and keep any controversial poli-
cies from getting in the way of passing
this bill before its September deadline.
Great work.

Overall, the ADUFA amendments of
2023 will reauthorize the two user fee
programs established to support the de-
velopment and review of animal drugs
and generics.

These drugs Kkeep our animals
healthy, from our household pets to
our farm animals, and they ensure that
our food supply is safe for humans too.
That is how important this bill is.

The bill before us also includes provi-
sions to support the review process in
getting new drugs to the market faster
and adds new reporting requirements
to improve transparency and account-
ability within the FDA’s Center for
Veterinary Medicine.

It also takes steps to support uti-
lizing the conditional approval path-
way for animal drugs, which will bring
more drugs to the market for small
animal populations with unmet clin-
ical needs.

There are even more program en-
hancements contained in these agree-
ments, addressing foreign inspections,
fiscal responsibility, and the need for
more innovation.

If this legislation is not signed into
law before September 30, Mr. Speaker,
the review and approval of the medi-
cines that farmers and pet owners rely
on will dramatically slow down. We
can’t let that happen.

Drugmakers will also face regulatory
uncertainty in getting their therapies
to the market, impacting access to new
cures and treatments. They are relying
on Congress to do its job, and we will,
which is why I strongly urge support of
this legislation and encourage my col-
leagues to vote ‘‘yes.”

I reserve the balance of my time, Mr.
Speaker.

Ms. SCHRIER. Mr. Speaker, I yield
myself such time as I may consume.

I first thank Chair ROGERS, Ranking
Member PALLONE, Representative BILI-
RAKIS, and, of course, Representative
PENCE, who sponsored this bill together
with me, for their leadership and hard
work on this bipartisan bill. I am a
proud sponsor.

The Animal Drug User Fee Agree-
ment is important for the safety of

H3623

both animal and human health. This
bill will accelerate the development of
new medications for animals with a
predictable and streamlined review
process.

It will hold the FDA accountable for
performance goals that will improve
wait times for inspections and provide
regulatory certainty for innovators
and pet and animal owners alike.

It will ensure that our Nation’s food
supply is safe by making sure the medi-
cines that are administered to food-
producing animals are safe.

O 1645

I want to underscore that this bill is
a win for everyone, but it is especially
good for farmers.

In my district, farmers, ranchers, and
dairymen rely on these FDA-approved
medications to keep their livestock
healthy. For them, keeping animals
healthy is not just about their affec-
tion and responsibility for these ani-
mals. It is critical for food production,
food safety, and their very economic
survival.

Having timely access to affordable,
effective medications is a key part of
our domestic food chain, and that is
really the heart of our rural economies.

I am happy to go to bat for our rural
areas and our agricultural commu-
nities with this legislation. I encourage
my colleagues to vote ‘‘yes’ on this
important bill, Mr. Speaker, and I re-
serve the balance of my time.

Mr. BILIRAKIS. Mr. Speaker, I yield
such time as he may consume to the
gentleman from Indiana (Mr. PENCE),
the sponsor of the bill along with Ms.
SCHRIER.

Mr. PENCE. Mr. Speaker, I am proud
to champion the fifth reauthorization
of the Animal Drug User Fee Act with
Congresswoman SCHRIER.

This important legislation is critical
to ensuring safe and effective drugs for
our Nation’s livestock industry and
farm animals for the next 5 years. It
provides resources for the review of
new and generic animal drugs, acceler-
ates the development of animal thera-
peutics, and promotes a more predict-
able and streamlined review process.

It is important we hold the FDA ac-
countable to performance goals that
will enhance inspection times and pro-
vide regulatory certainty for both
innovators and pet owners alike.

Farmers, ranchers, and rural commu-
nities across southern Indiana rely on
veterinary medicines and therapeutics
produced by animal drug manufactur-
ers. Innovators in the Hoosier State,
like Elanco Animal Health, are leading
the charge to keep American farm ani-
mals safe and healthy. We need innova-
tion in veterinary medicine to secure
the best care for our Nation’s veteri-
nary patients.

This legislation would preserve the
security of America’s food supply by
making certain the medications ad-
ministered to food-producing animals
are safe for animal and human health.

Mr. Speaker, I urge support for final
passage of this legislation.



H3624

Ms. SCHRIER. Mr. Speaker, I yield
myself the balance of my time to close.

I thank Mr. BILIRAKIS and Members
on the other side of the aisle for work-
ing together on this bipartisan bill. I
encourage my colleagues to vote ‘‘yes”
on this bill to make sure we can speed
novel medications to animals in this
country.

Mr. Speaker, I yield back the balance
of my time.

Mr. BILIRAKIS. Mr. Speaker, this is
a great bill. It is a necessary bill for
our farmers but also our animal own-
ers. I used to be the chair of the Hu-
mane Bond Caucus, and we absolutely
love our animals. Mr. PENCE and Ms.
SCHRIER are doing an excellent job on
this particular bill, and I urge unani-
mous passage.

Mr. Speaker, I yield back the balance
of my time.

Ms. JACKSON LEE. Mr. Speaker, | rise in
support of H.R. 1418, the “Animal Drug and
Animal Generic Drug User Fee Amendments
of 2023”, or ADUFA and AGDUFA, which will
enable the U.S. to lead the world in innovation
and drug development for animal pharma-
ceuticals.

The Animal Drug and Animal Generic Drug
User Fee Amendment or AGDUFA was de-
signed to enhance the performance of the ge-
neric new animal drug review process and en-
able the FDA to more efficiently ensure that
generic new animal drug products are safe
and effective.

AGDUFA was originally signed into law in
2008 and reauthorized in 2013 and 2018.

This bill reauthorizes the FDA to collect user
fees for certain abbreviated applications for
generic new animal drugs, generic new animal
drug products and from certain sponsors of
abbreviated applications for generic new ani-
mal drugs and investigational submissions for
generic new animal drugs.

Specifically, this bill ensures that the Center
for Veterinary Medicine can continue to meet
the needs of the animal drug industry as it
evolves.

This bipartisan bill will lead to increased
transparency, additional pathways for animal
drug approvals, and reduced review times for
pioneer and generic drug applications while
maintaining high standards for safety and effi-
cacy.

Veterinarians have far fewer FDA-approved
animal drugs compared to the number of FDA-
approved human drugs.

My district in Houston is home to hundreds
of veterinarians working hard to improve the
health of animals.

In fact, Houston ranks fourth among metro
areas for dog ownership and was named the
“Dog Capital of the World” in a 2022 study
conducted by Protect Our Paws.

Protect Our Paws found that Houston had
the highest dog-toperson ratio in the world
with 52.1 dogs per 100 humans.

More broadly, with Texas being No. 4 in pet
ownership and over 58 percent of households
owning at least one pet, we have thousands ot
pets and animals to protect.

| have a vested interest in moving these re-
authorizations forward because they are crit-
ical to animal and human health and well-
being.

FDA continues to make progress to mitigate
the growth of antimicrobial resistance in food-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

producing animals, including ending over-the-
counter access to medically important anti-
biotics which are used in both humans and
animals, but more needs to be done.

| remain fully committed to moving the Ani-
mal Drug and Animal Generic Drug User Fee
Amendments of 2023 through a swift reauthor-
ization before the programs expire on Sep-
tember 30th.

| urge all my colleagues to join me in voting
in favor of H.R. 1418, the Animal Drug and
Animal Generic Drug User Fee Amendments
of 20283.”

Ms. JACKSON LEE. Mr. Speaker, | rise
today in support of H.R. 813, the Global In-
vestment in American Jobs Act of 2023.

This bill will direct the Secretary of Com-
merce to conduct an interagency review of
and report to Congress on ways to increase
the global competitiveness of the United
States in attracting foreign direct investment.

The report will look at the economic impact
of foreign direct investments in the United
States, focusing on manufacturing, services,
trade, and jobs in the United States.

This will allow Congress to better under-
stand trends and challenges in global cross-
border investments, as well as collaborate with
other trusted partner countries.

Specifically, this bill will attract foreign direct
investment from responsible private-sector en-
tities, which is directly linked to the long-term
economic prosperity, global competitiveness,
and security of the United States.

It will promote polices to ensure that United
States remains the global leader in developing
and deploying cutting-edge technologies, such
as self-driving vehicle technology and artificial
intelligence.

As digital information becomes increasingly
important to the United States economy and
the development of new technologies and
services that will be crucial to the country’s
competitiveness in the 21st century global
economy, barriers including data localization
and infringement of intellectual property rights
must be further addressed.

This study will focus on the economic im-
pact of foreign direct investment, challenges
associated with foreign direct investment by
state-owned enterprises, and the influence of
protectionist policies enacted by other coun-
tries on the advanced technology economy.

Further, this bill will allow us to reduce our
supply-chain dependence on China.

For the success of our larger economy, na-
tional security, and global relationships, it is
vital that we pass H.R. 813.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The
question is on the motion offered by
the gentleman from Florida (Mr. BILI-
RAKIS) that the House suspend the rules
and pass the bill, H.R. 1418, as amend-
ed.

The question was taken; and (two-
thirds being in the affirmative) the
rules were suspended and the bill, as
amended, was passed.

A motion to reconsider was laid on
the table.

————————

GLOBAL INVESTMENT IN
AMERICAN JOBS ACT OF 2023
Mr. BILIRAKIS. Mr. Speaker, I move
to suspend the rules and pass the bill
(H.R. 813) to direct the Secretary of
Commerce, in coordination with the

July 17, 2023

heads of other relevant Federal depart-
ments and agencies, to conduct an
interagency review of and report to
Congress on ways to increase the glob-
al competitiveness of the United States
in attracting foreign direct invest-
ment, as amended.

The Clerk read the title of the bill.

The text of the bill is as follows:

H.R. 813

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Global In-
vestment in American Jobs Act of 2023”°.
SEC. 2. SENSE OF CONGRESS.

It is the sense of Congress that—

(1) the ability of the United States to at-
tract foreign direct investment from respon-
sible private-sector entities based in trusted
countries is directly linked to the long-term
economic prosperity, global competitiveness,
and security of the United States;

(2) it is a top national priority to enhance
the global competitiveness, economic pros-
perity, and security of the United States
by—

(A) removing unnecessary barriers to for-
eign direct investment from responsible pri-
vate-sector entities based in trusted coun-
tries and the jobs that such investment cre-
ates throughout the United States;

(B) promoting policies to ensure the United
States remains the premier global destina-
tion to invest, hire, innovate, provide serv-
ices, and manufacture products;

(C) promoting policies to ensure the United
States remains the global leader in devel-
oping and deploying cutting-edge tech-
nologies, such as self-driving vehicle tech-

nology, artificial intelligence, Internet of
Things, quantum computing, blockchain;
and

(D) promoting policies that maintain and
expand resilient supply chains and reduce
the dependence of the United States on sup-
ply chains from China and other foreign ad-
versaries;

(3) maintaining the United States commit-
ment to an open investment policy with pri-
vate-sector entities based in trusted coun-
tries encourages other countries to recip-
rocate and enable the United States to open
new markets abroad for United States com-
panies and their products;

(4) while foreign direct investment by re-
sponsible private-sector entities based in
trusted countries can enhance the United
States economic strength, policies regarding
foreign direct investment should reflect se-
curity interests and should not disadvantage
domestic investors, companies, or the work-
force;

(5) United States efforts to attract foreign
direct investment from responsible private-
sector entities based in trusted countries
should be consistent with efforts to maintain
and improve the domestic standard-of-living,
including for the workforce;

(6) as digital information becomes increas-
ingly important to the United States econ-
omy and the development of new tech-
nologies and services that will be crucial to
the country’s competitiveness in the 2lst
century global economy, barriers including
data localization and infringement of intel-
lectual property rights must be further ad-
dressed;

(7) foreign direct investment by companies
or other entities owned, directed, supported,
or influenced by the Chinese Communist
Party is a threat to United States security
and merits an aggressive policy framework
to protect United States interests, jobs, in-
tellectual property, and security;



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-12-22T16:07:53-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




